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CHAPTER 1 

1.0 INTRODUCTION 

This chapter outlines the project regulatory authority and work performed by USA Environmental, Inc. 
(USA) for the U.S. Army Engineering and Support Center, Huntsville (USAESCH) and describes the 
removal action conducted at the former Camp Butner located in Butner, North Carolina. This report is an 
annual report and includes supporting documentation that can be found in Appendices A through G. 
Referenced tables are in the text of the report, while referenced figures (maps) can be found in Appendix 
D. All activities involving work in areas potentially containing munitions and explosives of concern (MEC) 
were conducted in full compliance with the U.S. Army Corps of Engineers (USACE), Department of the 
Army (DA), and Department of Defense (DoD) requirements regarding personnel, equipment, and 
procedures. All site operations were performed in accordance with the USAESCH Scope of Work (SOW) 
provided in Appendix A (dated 27 June 2005) and Modification 13 to the SOW (dated 30 September 
2008). 

1.1 GENERAL DESCRIPTION 

The former Camp Butner is comprised of approximately 20,834 acres, which includes the town of Butner 
and the North Carolina National Guard (NCNG) Camp Butner Training Site (See Figure D1). The NCNG 
training site encompasses 4,750 acres of active range and is situated in portions of Person, Durham, and 
Granville Counties, in North Carolina. The boundary of the former Camp Butner is defined by the old 
Range Road, which makes a continuous loop around the site, although identified by multiple names and 
County designations. Approximately 75 percent of the site is located within Granville County. The 
northern and eastern boundaries roughly follow Range Road (County Road 1126). County Road 1721, 
which is a continuation of Range Road into Person County, defines the Camp's western boundary and 
continues southward onto Cassam Road. The Southern Railroad defines the southeastern border of the 
site. The nearest urban area to the site is Durham, which is 15 miles away. 

1.2 AUTHORITY 

USA was tasked under Contract Number W912DY-04-D-0006, Task Order No. 0007 to perform a removal 
action at Camp Butner. MEC is a safety hazard and may constitute a threat to the local population. USA 
performed the work associated with this response action in a manner consistent with USACE, DA, and 
DoD requirements. All operations at the site were performed in accordance with the Occupational Safety 
and Health Administration (OSHA) Hazardous Waste Operations and Emergency Response 
(HAZWOPER) Standard 29 Code of Federal Regulation (CFR) 1910.120. 

1.3 TECHNICAL SCOPE OF WORK 

The objective of this project was to perform a removal action to remove and dispose of all explosive 
hazards within the selected areas at the former Camp Butner. For each site-specific MEC, quality 
control/quality assurance (QC/QA) targets were established with the requirement to remove all MEC 
objects with a width (diameter) or thickness inclusive of the QC/QA criteria MEC items, to a depth of 11 
times the diameter of the criteria MEC items. The removal action complies with the signed Action 
Memorandums dated December 2004 and January 2006. 

USA's proposal was based on stand-alone awards for each of the areas tasked for clearance, and on the 
use of detect and dig clearance operations using hand-held metal detectors or magnetometers. This 
Report contains generic information about USA's processes, as well as specific information about each 
removal action subtask. 

The following tasks were required by the SOW: 

• Task 1: Project Preparation and Planning 
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Task 2: Work Plan 

Task 3: Removal Action 

- 3a: Area 1A Flamethrower Range 

- 3b: Complex 1 Area 4A 

- 3c: Complex 1 Area 4B 

- 3d: Complex 1 Area 4D 

- 3e: Complex 1 Area 4E 

- 3f: Complex 1 Area 4 Remaining Lands 

- 3g: Lakeview Subdivision 

- 3h: Complex 2 Area 4C 

- 3i: Complex 2 Area 4 Remaining Lands 

- 3j: Site-Wide Institutional Controls 

- 3k: Evacuation 

- 3m: Mobilizations/Demobilizations for Subtasks 3F and 31 (as written in the SOW) 

Task 4: Geospatial Data 

Task 5: Final Report 

Task 6: Project Management. 
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CHAPTER 2 

2.0 DISCUSSION OF WORK PERFORMED 

This chapter describes the primary work presented in this annual report to include the activities that were 
performed from January 2006 through 31 December 2008 to implement Task 3, subtasks 3a through 3m, 
in the order completed, including completed removal actions, site-wide institutional controls, evacuations, 
and mobilizations and demobilizations. Removal actions were completed at Area 1A, Area 4A, Area 4B, 
Area 4D, Area 4 Complex 1 Unit 1, Lakeview Subdivision, Area 4C, Area 4 Complex 2 Unit 1, and Area 4 
Complex 2 Unit 2. Sections 2.6 through 2.14 define the completed removal actions, detailing 
mobilization, field operations, MEC disposal, munitions debris disposal, quality control, and demobilization 
at each area completed. (See Figure D-2 for current status of the removal action.) Sections 2.15 and 2.16 
identify site-wide institutional controls and evacuations, respectively. 

This chapter does not describe partially completed removal activities at Area 4 Complex 1 Unit 2 that 
were stopped based on difficulties in obtaining right-of-entry (ROE) permission or property owners' 
reluctance/inability to evacuate. Future work remaining to be completed will be described in subsequent 
annual reports and based on authorizations from the USAESCH to proceed. 

This chapter first describes, in general, the activities USA performed during each phase of the work and 
the methodology used to accomplish these activities. The general discussion is followed by a specific 
discussion of operations conducted during each subtask. 

USA performed operations at the former Camp Butner project site in a systematic manner using proven 
operating techniques and methods. Operational activities were performed under the supervision and 
direction of qualified unexploded ordnance (UXO) personnel. Non-essential personnel were prohibited 
from performing operations, unless they were accompanied and supervised by a qualified UXO 
Technician. Throughout operations, USA strictly adhered to the following general practices. 

• Operations were conducted during daylight hours only. 

• All personnel attended a daily general safety briefing and tailgate safety briefing prior to beginning 
work on site. 

• Visitors received a safety briefing prior to entering the operating areas and were escorted at all 
times by the Senior UXO Supervisor (SUXOS), UXO Safety Officer (UXOSO), or UXO Quality 
Control Specialist (UXOQCS). 

The following general discussion addresses the work performed in execution of the SOW tasks, including 
equipment and facilities utilized, data obtained, and removal action results. 

2.1 PROJECT PREPARATION AND PLANNING 

The project preparation and planning task includes a site visit and two Technical Project Planning (TPP) 
meetings. USA conducted a post-award site visit on 8 August 2005, but no TPP meetings were required 
or conducted. 

2.2 WORK PLAN 

The USAESCH awarded Task Order 0007 to USA on 31 July 2005. USA submitted the Draft Work Plan 
to USAESCH on 16 September 2005 for review and approval. After review, comments, and an on-board 
review at USAESCH, the Final Work Plan was submitted on 15 December 2005. USA received approval 
of the Work Plan and a notice to proceed (NTP) on 12 January 2006. The following amendments were 
submitted to USAESCH during the project: 

• Amendment 1 - Submitted on 24 January 2006 to allow the option of detect and dig operations, 
as well as detect and flag operations. 
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• Amendment 2 - Submitted on 16 March 2007 to change the Munition with Greatest 
Fragmentation Distance (MGFD) for Area 4D from 37mm to 105mm projectile. 

• Amendment 3 - Submitted on 11 October 2007 to incorporate Amendments 2 and 3 of the 
Explosives Safety Submission (ESS) and the 5 October 2007 approval memorandum and to 
incorporate the Hazardous Fragmentation Distances (HFDs) for all areas changed by ESS 
Amendment 3. 

• Amendment 4 - Submitted on 8 November 2007 to change the HFD for Area 4C due to the 
finding of a 155mm projectile. 

• Amendment 5 - Submitted on 3 April 2008 to change the HFD for Area 4C Complex 2 Remaining 
Lands due to the finding of a 155mm projectile. 

2.3 PHASE I - MOBILIZATION 

This section discusses the activities conducted as part of the typical mobilization operation and provides 
the site-specific training that was completed by site personnel. 

2.3.1 LOCAL COORDINATION 

The SUXOS mobilized before the clearance team to coordinate with local sources for leased equipment, 
lodging, and other support. The SUXOS also received and inventoried project equipment and procured 
materials for the geophysical test strips. The UXOSO/QCS, and a Site Geophysicist if necessary, 
mobilized along with the SUXOS to set up a geophysical test strip, bury QC seed items, survey-in grid 
corners, and develop the necessary training curriculum and report formats. The clearance team 
mobilized immediately after local coordination was complete. 

2.3.2 SITE-SPECIFIC TRAINING 

USA performed site-specific training for all personnel assigned to this project to ensure that all personnel 
fully understood the procedures and methods to perform operations at the former Camp Butner, their 
individual duties and responsibilities, and all safety and environmental practices/procedures associated 
with site operations. The following training was provided to site personnel. 

• Prior to deployment, the SUXOS received operational briefings on his duties and responsibilities, 
and reviewed the work and safety plans. 

• At the site and prior to the start of operations, the SUXOS and UXOSO provided the USA teams 
with ordnance recognition and MEC safety precautions training. 

• All personnel received training on the individual equipment they were to operate while on site. 

• Prior to mobilization, all UXO personnel received HAZWOPER 40-hours (or 8-hour refresher) 
training, as required. 

All personnel on site completed a pre-placement or annual physical examination that complies with the 
requirements of 29 CFR 1910.120. Also, all personnel were certified as fit to work by an Occupational 
Physician certified in Occupational Medicine by the American Board of Preventive Medicine or who, by 
necessary training and experience, is board eligible. All USA UXO personnel on site were participants in 
the USA medical surveillance program during site operations. 

2.4 PHASE II - FIELD OPERATIONS 

This section describes the typical activities conducted as part of the Phase II field operations. 
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2.4.1 LOCATION SURVEYS 

USA contracted with Acculine Surveyors of Creedmoor, NC, to lay out the site boundaries of Areas 1A, 
4A, and Lakeview Subdivision. For all other areas, boundaries for 2-acre areas around individual 
residences were estimated in the field by the USA Project Manager and U.S. Army Corps of Engineers 
(USACE) Wilmington Project Manager. The SUXOS would then record Global Positioning System (GPS) 
coordinates for the corners and submit to the USA GIS Manager for development of more accurate maps. 
The GIS-developed maps were then submitted to the SUXOS for adjustment of corners, if necessary, to 
obtain the required 2 acres of clearance. As-built coordinates of the 2-acre areas were taken using the 
Trimble GeoXT. 

Grid coordinates were based on a master grid system developed by USA for the project. Grid corners for 
larger areas, such as 1A, 4A, and Lakeview Subdivision, were surveyed-in by USA personnel using Real 
Time Kinematic Differential GPS equipment and marked with survey laths. Grid coordinates were taken 
using the Trimble GeoXT for the 2-acre boundaries around individual residences. 

2.4.2 TASK 3: REMOVAL ACTION 

Removal actions for the individual subtasks are described in Sections 2.6 through 2.14. In general, 
surface and subsurface clearance operations were conducted to depth of detection. Minimum separation 
distances (MSDs) were based on the MGFD defined for that subtask in the Work Plan. 

2.4.2.1 Detect/Dig Operations 

Each MEC Team, consisting of a UXO Technician III (UXOTIII) Team Leader and four UXO Technician 
ll/l (UXOTII/I) personnel, performed a metal detector search of the grids. Grids were searched in 5-ft 
lanes and cleared to depth. The anomalies were excavated, identified, recorded, and either destroyed by 
detonation in place or moved to a consolidation point within the area by the Demolition Team. The 
following subsections describe the equipment and procedures that the individual MEC Teams used to 
search and clear the individual grids. 

2.4.2.1.1 Equipment 

The equipment requirements for this activity included: 

• Minelab II metal detectors or Schonstedt GA-52Cx magnetometers used to detect subsurface 
metallic anomalies 

• Pre-marked baselines used to subdivide the grid into individual search lanes 

• Rope reels containing nylon rope/twine used to mark individual search lanes 

• Five-gallon plastic buckets to temporarily collect recovered metal 

• Miscellaneous common hand tools (e.g., shovels, pry bars, hammers) 

• Forms and logbooks to record site activities and MEC encountered. 

2.4.2.1.2 Search Lanes 

Each grid was subdivided into individual search lanes consisting of parallel paths approximately 5 ft wide 
that ran parallel to one boundary of the operating grid. Search lanes ran adjacent to each other and 
completely covered the entire operating grid. To lay out the search lanes, the MEC Team Leaders had 
team members perform the following steps: 

• Select two opposing boundary lines for installation of the pre-marked lane base lines 

• Install one of the pre-marked base lines along each boundary 
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• Lay out rope or twine between the marks on both baselines to mark individual lane boundaries. 

2.4.2.1.3 Detect/Dig Operation 

After establishing the individual search lanes, the MEC Team Leader directed the MEC team members to 
begin searching each lane with a Schonstedt GA-52Cx magnetometer or a Minelab II metal detector. 
UXOTII/I personnel started at one end of each lane and moved forward toward the opposing baseline. 
During the forward movement, the individual moved the detector from one side of the lane to the other. 
Both forward movement and the swing of the detector were conducted at a pace that ensured that the 
entire lane was searched and that the instrument was able to appropriately respond to subsurface 
anomalies. 

Whenever encountering a subsurface anomaly or metallic surface object, the individual halted and 
investigated the anomaly. Each anomaly was excavated by carefully digging alongside of the location of 
the anomaly and removing the earth overburden using a shovel or trowel. When the overburden was 
removed to within 6 inches of the anomaly, the UXOTII/I removed the remaining earth using a trowel or 
other small digging implement. All anomalies were pursued to depth. At the completion of investigations, 
each hole was checked with a detector to ensure no metallic contacts remained. Throughout this 
operation, the MEC Team Leader closely monitored individual performance to ensure that these 
procedures were performed with due diligence and attention to detail. 

2.4.2.1.4 Records 

The MEC Team Leaders prepared and maintained a detailed accounting of activities performed at each 
grid or residence. The Daily Operations Record included information pertaining to the following: 

• The date and time operations began 

• The date and time operations were completed 

• The location, number, type, and description of MEC items encountered 

• The location and number of subsurface anomalies detected and dug for investigation 

• An estimated weight, in pounds, of the munitions debrisremoved from the grid 

• The locations of all MEC items as determined by GPS and recording of a Universal Transverse 
Mercator (UTM) coordinate. 

2.4.2.2 MEC Disposal 

MEC disposal was conducted in accordance with the Work Plan, using sandbags. Nearby residents were 
warned in advance of a pending demolition shot, and at times the local fire department chose to stand by 
in case of fire. 

2.4.2.3 Munitions Debris Disposal 

All recovered munitions debris was placed in a 5-gallon bucket by clearance teams. A Tech II performed 
a visual inspection at the end of each workday to ensure all HE and fuzes were removed from munitions 
debris and all surfaces were clearly visible, free of dirt. The Team Leader, a Tech III, also visually 
inspected all munitions debris to verify the munitions debris was free of HE and fuzes and visually clean 
prior to placing all material in a 55-gallon drum and closing with a lid. The SUXOS secured all munitions 
debris in a rented storage unit at the end of the workday. Upon completion of operations at each area, 
the SUXOS moved the munitions debris to a CONEX container on Army National Guard property on the 
former Camp Butner site. All munitions debris was inspected by the SUXOS, sealed in 55-gallon drums, 
given an estimated weight, certified with a completed 1348 form, and shipped to Bedford Recycling in 
Bedford, Indiana, during the final demobilization. The first shipment, consisting of 8,043 lb of munitions 
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debris, occurred on 16 June 2008, with confirmation of destruction received on 25 June 2008. The 
second shipment, consisting of 4,211 lb of munitions debris, occurred on 17 September 2008, with 
confirmation of destruction received on 28 October 2008 (see Appendix B). 

2.4.2.4 Quality Control and Quality Assurance 

Throughout operations, USA performed QC inspections that consisted of daily inspections of operational 
activities and formal inspections of completed work. Daily inspections included checks of maintenance 
and calibration procedures, and assessment of compliance with the Work Plan (see Chapter 4, Tests). 
Following completion of investigations of the grids, the UXOQCS either performed a formal inspection or 
determined if the MEC team had found or missed a QC seed item. Upon passing the QC inspection, the 
grids were turned in to the USAESCH Safety Specialist for approval. 

2.4.3 MEETINGS AND PRESENTATIONS 

Throughout the duration of field work, USA's Project Manager attended quarterly Restoration Advisory 
Board (RAB) meetings in the Town of Butner to provide progress updates, discuss work plans for the 
upcoming quarter, and coordinate on issues such as evacuations or rights of entry (ROE). While field 
activities were in progress, USA's Project Manager provided weekly status reports to USAESCH, to 
include fund expenditures and projections. Monthly project status reports were provided when field 
activities were not in progress. 

2.5 PHASE III - DEMOBILIZATION 

As part of the demobilization process, USA removed operational capability from the area and reallocated 
personnel and equipment to other projects. Following the completion of operations, leased/rented 
equipment was returned to vendors, and USA property was returned to the USA Tampa/Oldsmar Office. 
If the remobilization was expected within several months, USA left the office trailer and storage units in 
place and continued to rent during the interim. No property or supplies were purchased for Time and 
Materials tasks. Therefore, there was no Government Furnished Equipment to return to the government. 
No damages occurred to trees, utilities, or facilities for which corrective actions were required. Re-
vegetation or re-seeding was provided for individual residences, as required. All munitions debris was 
inspected by the SUXOS, sealed in 55-gallon drums, and shipped to Bedford Recycling in Bedford, 
Indiana, in two shipments (16 June and 24 September 2008) during the final demobilization. 

2.6 REMOVAL ACTION FOR AREA 1A - SUBTASK 3A 
2.6.1 MOBILIZATION 

The SUXOS, a dual-hatted UXOSO/UXOQCS, and a Site Geophysicist mobilized to the site on 17 
January 2006 to prepare for the removal action at the Area 1A Flamethrower Range. A geophysical test 
strip was set up adjacent to the site, and QC seed items were planted throughout the site. Acculine 
Surveyors established the site boundaries for this 20-acre area, and USA personnel established grid 
corners following the pattern of the master grid system using USA's Real-Time Kinematic (RTK)-GPS 
equipment. Two MEC clearance teams mobilized on 23 January 2006. 

2.6.2 FIELD OPERATIONS 

Removal operations were based on the MKII hand grenade as the MGFD, with a MSD for unintentional 
detonations of 390 ft. The MKII hand grenade was also the smallest target anomaly for depth of detection 
required by the SOW. Removal operations began on 23 January with two teams starting at the northern 
edge of the site. The plan was to avoid evacuations and road closures as long as possible while 
collecting as much data as possible. USA anticipated that no UXO would be found in Area 1A and that 
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USA would be able to justify to USAESCH a waiver to use the 1/600 HFD for unintentional detonations of 
200 ft, thus minimizing evacuations and road closures from a residential area adjacent to the site. 

During the first week of operations, the MEC teams used detect and flag (detect /flag) procedures. The 
USA Project Manager visited the site on 26 January 2006 to coordinate with the project team. It was 
discovered that the grids along the northwest boundary were showing a high number of anomalies, many 
of which were rocks with high metallic content, or "hot rocks". USA immediately submitted an amendment 
to the Work Plan to perform all detect and dig (detect /dig) operations so that the teams could work more 
efficiently. By 3 February 2006, detect and dig operations were approved. USA also shipped two 
Minelab II metal detectors to the site, one for each team, to aid in identifying magnetic rocks. The two 
actions effectively increased the production rate in hot rock areas. 

On 3 February 2006, USA submitted a request for approval to reduce the MSD for unintentional 
detonations to 200 ft, based on the fact that no UXO had been found by that time. While waiting for the 
approval, USA coordinated with the Butner Police Department to enforce road closures and seek the 
cooperation of local residents to temporarily evacuate their homes on 8 and 9 February. One family was 
provided room and board at a local motel for two days. Approval of the MSD for unintentional detonations 
reduction was received in the field on 9 February. This approval allowed completion of the work near the 
residences on 13 February, with morning evacuation of only two residences. Clearance operations were 
completed on 17 February. Figure D-3 provides status of clearance activities for Area 1A under this task 
order. 

2.6.3 MEC DISPOSAL 

During the removal action at Area 1A, 6,343 subsurface anomalies were excavated. USA located, 
identified, and disposed of two UXO items on the same day, consisting of one M15 smoke grenade (white 
phosphorus) (see Figure C-3) and one M1 training anti-vehicular land mine smoke canister (see Figure C-
1). Both the smoke grenade and the land mine smoke canister were moved from separate locations in 
Grid 41-B23 to a safe, remote area in Grid 41-B24 and blown in place (BIP) as a consolidated shot. The 
Butner Fire Department staged three fire trucks near the site during disposal of the items in the event of 
fire resulting from the white phosphorus grenade. Eight 30.06 rifle cartridges were found and turned over 
to the Butner Police Department. (Details of UXO items recovered in Area 1A are identified in Appendix 
B in Area 1A Grid Sheets and UXO Accountability Log.) 

2.6.4 MUNITIONS DEBRIS DISPOSAL 

USA collected an estimated 530 lb of munitions debris, which was stored in a CONEX on NCNG property. 

2.6.5 QUALITY CONTROL 

Of the 37 grids cleared, none were failed due to misses of QC seed items, and none were failed for 
missing an MEC item that met or exceeded the MKII hand grenade target envelope. A total of 30 QC 
seed items were planted and recovered by the MEC teams. The USACE MEC Safety Specialist issued 
CEHNC Form 948's passing all grids (see Appendix B). 

2.6.6 DEMOBILIZATION 

All USA personnel except the SUXOS were demobilized on 17 February 2006. The SUXOS departed on 
20 February 2006 after completing all storage and shipping tasks. 
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2.7 REMOVAL ACTION FOR LAKEVIEW SUBDIVISION - SUBTASK 3G 
2.7.1 MOBILIZATION 

The SUXOS, a UXOSO, a UXOQCS, a UXO Tech II and a UXO Tech I mobilized to the site on 21 August 
2006 to prepare for removal actions at the Lakeview Subdivision and Area 4A. An office trailer was set 
up on NCNG property. A geophysical test strip was set up adjacent to the trailer (see Figure C-7), and 
QC seed items were planted throughout the site. Acculine Surveyors established the site boundaries for 
this 26-acre area and USA personnel established grid corners following the pattern of the master grid 
system using USA's RTK-GPS equipment. The SUXOS informed homeowners of the work to be 
completed and discussed the need for evacuations. Three MEC clearance teams mobilized on 28 August 
2006. 

2.7.2 FIELD OPERATIONS 

Removal operations were based on the 37mm projectile as the MGFD, with an MSD for unintentional 
detonations of 980 ft. The 37mm projectile was also the smallest target anomaly for depth of detection 
required by the SOW. Vegetation clearance and detect /flag operations began on 29 August (see Figure 
C-5). Detect /flag operations were standard practice for this site, as intrusive activities could be 
conducted only when all residents were outside the MSD for unintentional detonations, and some 
residents were not cooperative in leaving before 0730 hrs and not returning before 1700 hrs. 

During the second week of operations, the MEC teams began using Miniature Open Front Barricades 
(MOFB) (see Figure C-4). In order to conduct project operations without incurring large delays, the MOFB 
was used as a tool to address the residents' lack of cooperation in evacuating during the work schedule 
of 0730-1700. The MOFB allows for intrusive operations to be conducted while residents were within the 
MSD. Mini-excavators were used to move the MOFBs. Granville County Sheriff Deputies provided 
traffic control on Roberts Chapel Road during intrusive operations. Due to the difficulty in acquiring the 
ROE for several residents, a USAEDH representative mobilized to the site on 6 September 2006 to 
conduct field acquisition of the outstanding ROEs. However, the Daniels (657 Lakeview Drive) continued 
to refuse to sign the ROE. Therefore, vegetation clearance was completed on all properties within the 26-
acre clearance area with the exception of the Daniels property. 

On 13 September and again on 25 September 2006, USA submitted a request for approval to reduce the 
MSD for unintentional detonations to 200 ft, based on the fact that no UXO had been found by that time. 
The request of 25 September was denied on 2 October 2006, because six UXO items had been found 
during the Lakeview Time Critical Removal Action (TCRA), and a 2.36 inch rocket was found by USA on 
2 October (see Figure C-6). 

On 14 September, one resident, Mr. Tilley, requested that USA not dig on his lawn, because it was on top 
of 6 ft of fill dirt and he did not want to disturb his septic system. USA pulled 1,344 flags from his 
property. On 18 September, Mr. Evans made a similar request, and USA pulled 3,400 flags from his two 
properties (653 and 658 Lakeview Drive) on 20 September. Because of difficulties in obtaining 
evacuations, two teams were diverted to Area 4A to conduct vegetation clearance, while one team 
continued intrusive operations at Lakeview using the MOFB. On 26 September, USA brought in Acculine 
Surveyors to survey the Daniels and Evans property boundaries because of their refusal of ROE. USA 
pulled another 746 flags from the second Evans property (653 Lakeview Drive). 

By 3 October, all detect/flag operations had been completed for the 26-acre clearance area with the 
exception of the Daniels property. One MEC team was conducting intrusive operations using the MOFB. 
On 3 October, Ms. Daniels granted ROE for only the wooded portions of her property. . Her property was 
finally detect /flagged on 10 October, and intrusive operations were conducted to within 200 ft of her 
house. However, Ms. Daniels refused to control or remove her dogs to permit USA to complete the 
clearance of her property. USA's Project Manager visited with Ms. Daniels on 25 October to try to 
convince her to move the dogs inside for one day so that we could complete the clearance. She agreed 
to leave them with her mother the next day, but did not follow through. After coordinating with the 
USAEDH Project Manager, the USA Project Manager instructed the SUXOS to take GPS coordinates of 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 

Page 2-7 



2008 ANNUAL REPORT - REMOVAL ACTION AT FORMER CAMP BUTNER 
BUTNER, NORTH CAROLINA 

the areas cleared and to remove all remaining flags. On 10 October, completed areas were GPS'd, 
equipment was removed, and the removal action at Lakeview Subdivision was completed. Figure D-4 
provides status of clearance activities for Lakeview Subdivision under this task order. 

2.7.3 MEC DISPOSAL 

During the removal action at Lakeview Subdivision, 11,107 subsurface anomalies were identified for 
excavation, but 5,881 flags were removed at homeowners' requests. A total of 4,819 digs were 
accomplished. Of the 26.35 acres scheduled for clearance, USA completed a clearance of 19.01 acres on 
which USA located, identified, and disposed of two MEC items, one of which was UXO (M9 Rifle 
Grenade) and the other item being a MC, a partial 2.36 inch rocket warhead. Both items were disposed 
of by BIP (Details of UXO items recovered in Lakeview Subdivision are identified in Appendix B in 
Lakeview Grid Sheets and UXO Accountability Log). 

2.7.4 MUNITIONS DEBRIS DISPOSAL 

USA collected an estimated 3 lb of munitions debris, which was stored in a CONEX on NCNG property. 

2.7.5 QUALITY CONTROL 

Of the 47 grids for which USA originally had ROE, 43 were detect /flagged, 43 were cleared of brush, and 
42 were cleared or partially cleared. A total of 29 QC seed items were planted and 24 were located. The 
other five seed items were pulled when the owners refused to allow clearance of their yards. Of the 42 
grids cleared, two were failed and re-cleared due to misses of QC seed items, but none were failed for 
missing a MEC item that met or exceeded the 37mm target envelope. The USACE MEC Safety 
Specialist issued HND Form 948's, passing all grids (see Appendix B). 

2.7.6 DEMOBILIZATION 

All USA personnel were shifted to Area 4A as their tasks were completed in Lakeview Subdivision. 

2.8 REMOVAL ACTION FOR AREA 4A - SUBTASK 3B 
2.8.1 MOBILIZATION 

Mobilization for Area 4A consisted of shifting the work force to Area 4A as tasks in Lakeview Subdivision 
were completed. Acculine Surveyors established the site boundaries for this 34-acre area, and USA 
personnel established grid corners following the pattern of the master grid system using USA's RTK-GPS 
equipment. 

2.8.2 FIELD OPERATIONS 

Removal operations were based on the 2.36 inch rocket as the MGFD, with an HFD for unintentional 
detonations of 809 ft. The M9 rifle grenade was the smallest target anomaly for depth of detection in 
accordance with the SOW. Removal operations began on 2 October 2006 with two teams starting detect 
/flag operations. Detect /flag operations were standard practice for this site in early morning and late 
afternoon hours, as intrusive activities could only be conducted when all residents were outside the HFD 
for unintentional detonations, and some of the residents were not cooperative in leaving before 0730 hrs 
or returning after 1700 hrs. 

On 10 October, additional training was provided to the Minelab operators, because they were having 
trouble discriminating out the high occurrences of smaller anomalies. By 12 October, all 3 teams were 
conducting detect /dig operations, and the Minelab training had reduced anomaly counts by 50 to 60 
percent. 
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Granville County Sheriff Deputies provided traffic control on East Range Road during intrusive and 
demolition operations. USAEDH provided a representative to complete ROE applications for several 
residents. The Bullock and Chavez families at first refused to allow ROE. Vegetation clearance was 
completed on all but these two properties. On 26 September, USA brought in Acculine Surveyors to 
survey the Bullock and Chavez property boundaries, because of their refusal of ROE. On 31 October 
2006, the two property owners changed their minds, and USA personnel established grid corners. 

On 6 November, due to several grids failed during QC inspections, USA found that the Minelab II 
operators were being confused too much by background anomalies, and decided to revert back to the 
Schonstedt. By 14 November 2006, clearance of all grids was completed, and by 16 November QC was 
completed. Government QA was conducted on 16 and 17 November 2006. Two grids were failed, and 
USA was able to re-clear one of the failed grids before residents returned home on that Friday afternoon. 
Since the Thanksgiving holiday was pending, USA shut down operations until after the New Year. 

Intrusive operations were begun on 29 January 2007 but were often forced to use detect /flag operations 
because residents kept returning to site during the day. Re-clearance of the last (second) failed grid was 
finally completed and passed QC and QA on 5 February. The team investigated 792 anomalies in re-
clearing the last grid. Figure D-5 provides status of clearance activities for Area 4A under this task order. 

2.8.3 MEC DISPOSAL 

During the removal action at Area 4A, all 51 grids were brush-cleared, detected/flagged, intrusively 
investigated and QC'd. All 51 grids passed QA. A total of 31,343 subsurface anomalies were 
investigated. USA located, identified, and disposed of 60 MEC items, of which 56 were UXO and 4 were 
DMM items. 

Prior to the Area 4A clearance, demolition explosives had been ordered on an as-needed basis, because 
few MEC items were being found. Because of the regular discovery of UXO items in Area 4A, however, 
USA ordered explosives magazines to be delivered to the site. The magazines were delivered on 10 
October and set up on NCNG property off of Roberts Chapel Road. Grounding was completed on 12 
October, and explosives were delivered that same day. (Details of UXO items recovered in Area 4A are 
identified in Appendix B in Area 4A Grid Sheets and UXO Accountability Log.) 

2.8.4 MUNITIONS DEBRIS DISPOSAL 

USA collected an estimated 410 lb of munitions debris, which was stored in a CONEX on NCNG property. 

2.8.5 QUALITY CONTROL 

Of the 51 grids cleared, none were failed due to misses of QC seed items, but three were failed during 
QC inspections and re-cleared for missing a MEC item that met or exceeded the M9 rifle grenade target 
envelope. Three grids were failed during QA inspections and re-cleared for missing a MEC item that met 
or exceeded the M9 rifle grenade target envelope. The USACE MEC Safety Specialist issued CEHNC 
Form 948's, passing all grids (see Appendix B). 

2.8.6 DEMOBILIZATION 

All but four USA personnel were demobilized on 15 November 2006. The last four personnel departed on 
Saturday, 18 November 2006, after completing all storage and shipping tasks and shutting down the 
office trailer. 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 

Page 2-9 



2008 ANNUAL REPORT - REMOVAL ACTION AT FORMER CAMP BUTNER 
BUTNER, NORTH CAROLINA 

2.9 REMOVAL ACTION FOR AREA 4D - SUBTASK 3D 
2.9.1 MOBILIZATION 

The SUXOS mobilized to the site on 23 January 2007 to prepare for removal action at Areas 4D, 4B, and 
4C. He was met by the USA PM and USACE PM on 24 January, and for the next two days the three 
personnel toured all areas and visited all residents. In Area 4D, measurements were taken around 
residences to establish boundaries for clearing 2 acres around each residence. The SUXOS further 
coordinated with residents a week ahead of clearance to arrange for evacuations for the following week. 
A single clearance team mobilized on 29 January and received specialized training in Minelab II 
operation. 

2.9.2 FIELD OPERATIONS 

Removal operations were based on the 37mm projectile as the MGFD, with an MSD for unintentional 
detonations of 980 ft. The 37mm projectile was also the smallest target anomaly for depth of detection 
required by the SOW. Although the original requirement was to clear 12 acres, this was expanded to 24 
acres by modification to the SOW. 

Intrusive operations began on 29 January 2007. Detect /flag operations was standard practice for this 
site in early morning and late afternoon hours, as intrusive activities could only be conducted when all 
residents were outside the MSD for unintentional detonations, and some of the residents were not 
cooperative in leaving before 0730 hrs or returning after 1700 hrs. Durham County Sheriff Deputies 
provided traffic control on Isham Chambers Road during intrusive and demolition operations. On 19 
February, a second team was mobilized to speed up operations. 

On 28 February 2007, a 105mm HE round was discovered in Area 4D (see Figure C-10), forcing an 
expansion of the MSD for unintentional detonations to 1,969 ft. USA was forced to stand down for one 
week in order to allow one week notification of newly affected residents to prepare for evacuations. 
Clearance operations were completed for Area 4D on 11 April 2007. Figures D-6 through D-17 provide 
status of clearance activities for Area 4D under this task order for the overall area as well as for each 
individual residence. 

2.9.3 MEC DISPOSAL 

All 11 properties were brush-cleared where necessary, then intrusively investigated, and passed QC and 
QA inspections. The following table identifies the properties and acreages, along with number and 
density of anomalies investigated during the clearance. Of the 4 MEC items discovered in Area 4D, 3 
items were UXO and 1 was munitions debris. The UXO items were a 105mm HE and two 37mm HE 
projectiles (see Figures C-12 and C-13). A tree root had grown around and partially obscured the last 
item, which after blowing in place turned out to be a 57mm training round (see Figure C-11). (Details of 
UXO items recovered in Area 4D are identified in Appendix B in Area 4D Grid Sheets and UXO 
Accountability Log.) 

Table 2-1: Area 4D - Subtask 3d Properties, Acres, and Anomalies Investigated During Clearance 

Address 

Hunting Trailer 6245 Isham 

6301 Isham Chambers Rd 

7023 Isham Chambers Rd 

7025 Isham Chambers Rd 

6315 Mancour Road 

Anomalies 
Investigated 

1,854 

3,098 

2,811 

1,642 

899 

Area Cleared 
(Acres) 

1.2 

1.6 

2.2 

1.3 

2.0 

Anomaly 
Density 

1,507 

1,639 

1,244 

1,216 

424 

MEC Items 
Found 
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6317 Mancour Road 

6305 Isham Chambers Rd 

6245 Isham Chambers Rd 

6235 Isham Chambers Rd 

6221 Mancour Drive 

Anthony Howerton Silo/Trailer 
Area 

Totals 

1,221 

9,140 

5,278 

1,142 

839 

3,366 

31,290 

2.1 

4.8 

1.9 

1.9 

2.1 

2.0 

21.3 

581 

1,828 

2,513 

583 

383 

1,666 

1,291 Average 

1 

1 

2 

4 

2.9.4 MUNITIONS DEBRIS DISPOSAL 

USA collected an estimated 746 lb of munitions debris, which was stored in the CONEX on NCNG 
property. 

2.9.5 QUALITY CONTROL 

QC seed items were not planted during the Area 4D clearance. Two grids were failed and re-cleared for 
missing a MEC item that met or exceeded the 37mm projectile target envelope. The USACE MEC Safety 
Specialist issued CEHNC Form 948's passing all grids (see Appendix B). 

2.9.6 DEMOBILIZATION 

Work in Area 4D was completed on 11 April 2007, and all USA personnel moved to Area 4C to begin 
clearance. 

2.10 REMOVAL ACTION FOR AREA 4C - SUBTASK 3H 
2.10.1 MOBILIZATION 

The SUXOS mobilized to the site on 23 January 2007 to prepare for removal action at Area 4B, 4D, and 
4C. He was met by the USA PM and USACE PM on 24 January, and for the next two days the three 
personnel toured all areas and visited all residents. In Area 4C, measurements were taken around 
residences to establish boundaries for clearing 2 acres around each residence. The SUXOS began 
coordinating with residents a week ahead of clearance to arrange for evacuations during the following 
week. 

2.10.2 FIELD OPERATIONS 

Removal operations were based on the 155mm projectile as the MGFD, with a MSD for unintentional 
detonations of 2,577 ft. The 81mm mortar was the smallest target anomaly for depth of detection 
required by the SOW. Brush clearing began in Area 4C on 4 April 2007 and was completed on 12 April 
2007. Although the original SOW requirement was to clear 32 acres, this was reduced to 16 acres 
(8 residences) by modification to the SOW. 

Intrusive operations began on 16 April 2007. Two teams were able to work for one week at two 
residences, 4553 and 4559 Uzzle Road. On 23 April, however, the teams were unable to work because a 
resident within the MSD for unintentional detonations was unable to evacuate, because of vandalism to 
his property on the previous night. On 24 April, intrusive activities were cancelled, because hunters at the 
Foggy Bottom Hunting Lodge would not agree to hunt outside the MSD for unintentional detonations. 
USA demobilized one team on 25 April, and held the other team on site to give USACE time to resolve 
issues regarding MSD for unintentional detonations, and to see if the RAB meeting would result in more 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 

Page 2-11 



2008 ANNUAL REPORT - REMOVAL ACTION AT FORMER CAMP BUTNER 
BUTNER, NORTH CAROLINA 

agreements to evacuate. When issues were not resolved by the morning of 27 April, the work force was 
demobilized. 

USA remobilized on 21 October 2007, working under the 105mm projectile MSD for unintentional 
detonations of 341 ft due to Amendment 3 of the ESS. USA teams began clearance at the 4553 Uzzle 
Road and 4559 Uzzle Road properties. On 30 October, a 105mm HE projectile was found 16 ft from the 
house located at 4559 Uzzle Road (see Figure C-17). Based on guidance received from USAESCH, 
USA remotely moved and hand carried the round to a disposal site 85 ft from the house. The round was 
safely detonated without damage to the home. Clearance at the 4553 Uzzle Road property was 
completed, and one team moved to the 4542C Uzzle Road property. 

On 6 November, a 155mm HE projectile was found on the 4542D Uzzle Road property (see Figures C-19 
and C-20). Security was provided overnight, protective works were placed the next morning, and the 
round was blown in place (BIP). The 4542D Uzzle Road property storage shed was destroyed by the 
detonation, but the owner had removed all the contents they wanted. The teams completed clearance of 
the 4542C Uzzle Road property and moved to the 191 Falcon Lane property. The MSD for unintentional 
detonations for Area 4C was expanded to 395 ft due to discovery of the 155mm projectile. 

On 12 November, an 81mm mortar was found on the 4542D Uzzle Road property 15 ft east of the main 
house (see Figure C-18). Overnight security was provided for two nights, while protective works were 
placed. The round was BIP on 13 November. On 15 November, a 60mm mortar was found at the 191 
Falcon Lane property and BIP. On 19 November, clearance of the 4542D and 191 Falcon Lane 
properties was completed. The 190 Falcon Lane residence was completed on 21 November. Clearance 
of the 4535 Uzzle Road property started on 26 November. One 155mm HE projectile was located 125 ft 
south of the residence and was BIP without damage to the house or nearby equipment. Clearance was 
completed on 27 November and QC completed on 28 November. 

Clearance at the Foggy Bottom Hunting Lodge) began on May 19, 2008, and was completed on May 29. 
A 37mm HE projectile and a 155mm shrapnel MK1 round were found and BIP. Figures D-18 through 
D-26 provide status of clearance activities for Area 4C under this task order for the overall area as well as 
for each individual residence. 

2.10.3 MEC DISPOSAL 

All eight residences were brush-cleared, where necessary, then intrusively investigated and passed QC 
and QA inspections. Table 2-4 identifies the properties and acreages, along with number and density of 
anomalies investigated during the clearance. Of the 10 MEC items discovered in Area 4C, 8 items were 
UXO, one item (grenade, MK2 w/safety pin) was Discarded Military Munitions (DMM), and one item 
(2.36 inch practice rocket) was munitions debris. The UXO items were three 155mm HE projectiles, one 
105mm HE projectile, one 81mm HE mortar, one 60mm HE mortar, and two 37mm HE projectile. 
(Details of UXO items recovered in Area 4C are identified in Appendix B in UXO Accountability Log.) 

2.10.4 MUNITIONS DEBRIS DISPOSAL 

USA collected an estimated 2,809 lb of munitions debris, which was stored in the CONEX on NCNG 
property. 

Table 2-2: Area 4C - Subtask 3h Properties, Acres, and Anomalies Investigated During Clearance 

Address 

4C-1 4535 Uzzle Road 

4C-2 190 Falcon Lane 

4C-3 191 Falcon Lane 

4C-4 4542D Uzzle Road 

Anomalies 
Investigated 

2,501 

2,384 

3,730 

3,230 

Area Cleared 
(Acres) 

2.1 

1.9 

2.0 

2.0 

Anomaly 
Density 

1,163 

1,248 

1,828 

1,648 

MEC Items 
Found 

1 

1 

2 
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4C-5 4542C Uzzle Road 

4C-6 4559 Uzzle Road 

4C-7 4553 Uzzle Road 

4C-8 Foggy Bottom 
Hunting Lodge (Uzzle Rd) 

Totals 

2,146 

6,918 

5,420 

9,089 

35,418 

1.9 

2.2 

2.0 

2.0 

16.2 

1,112 

3,173 

2,737 

4,455 

2,188 (Ave.) 

3 

1 

2 

10 

2.10.5 QUALITY CONTROL 

Of the eight residences cleared, none were failed for missing a MEC item that met or exceeded the 81mm 
mortar target envelope. QC seed items were not planted for the Area 4C clearance. The USACE MEC 
Safety Specialist issued CEHNC Form 948's, passing all grids (see Appendix B). 

2.10.6 DEMOBILIZATION 

Work in Area 4C was completed on seven of the eight units on 28 November 2007, and all USA 
personnel moved to Area 4B to begin clearance. Clearance for the eighth unit, the hunting lodge, was 
delayed until 19 May 2008, at which time clearance activities resumed and were completed on 29 May 
2008. 

2.11 REMOVAL ACTION FOR AREA 4B - SUBTASK 3C 
2.11.1 MOBILIZATION 

The SUXOS mobilized to the site on 23 January 2007 to prepare for removal action at Areas 4B, 4D, and 
4C. He was met by the USA PM and USACE PM on 24 January, and for the next two days the three 
personnel toured all areas and visited all residents. The SUXOS coordinated with residents a week 
ahead of clearance to arrange for evacuations for the following week. 

2.11.2 FIELD OPERATIONS 

Removal operations were based on the 2.36 inch rocket as the MGFD, with an MSD for unintentional 
detonations of 809 ft. The 2.36 inch rocket was also the smallest target anomaly for depth of detection 
required by the SOW. Brush clearing began in Area 4B on 4 April 2007 and was completed on 12 April 
2007. Although the original SOW requirement was to clear 10 acres consisting of 3 residences and 4 
acres of open area, this was expanded to 14 acres (3 residences and 8 acres of open area) by 
modification to the SOW. 

One team laid out corner stakes for clearance areas on 21 November, began clearing the 4-acre open 
area on 22 November, and completed the open area on 4 December. Clearance of the 4149 Range 
Road property began on 3 December and was completed on 5 December. Clearance of the 4163 and 
4163A Range Road properties began on 5 December and was completed on 12 December. Clearance 
of the open area extension (4 acres) began on 13 December. All work in Area 4B was completed on 18 
December 2007. Figure D-27 in Appendix D provides status of clearance activities for Area 4B under 
this task order. 

2.11.3 MEC DISPOSAL 

All three residences were brush-cleared where necessary, then intrusively investigated, and passed QC 
and QA inspections. The following table identifies the properties and acreages, along with number and 
density of anomalies investigated during the clearance. Of the 48 MEC items discovered in Area 4B, 28 
items were UXO which was BIP and 20 items were MEC which were demilitarized. The UXO items 
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consisted of one 60mm HE mortar and twenty-seven 2.36 inch HE rockets or warheads. The MEC items 
were 2.36 inch HE rocket warheads or fuzes. (Details of UXO items recovered in Area 4B are identified in 
Appendix B in Area 4B Grid Sheets and UXO Accountability Log.) 

Table 2-3: Area 4B - Subtask 3B Properties, Acres, and Anomalies Investigated During Clearance 

Address 

Veazey open area 

Veazey residence 

(4149 Range Road) 

Woods/Carpenter residence 

(East Range Road) 

Open area extension 

Totals 

Anomalies 
Investigated 

4174 

465 

3709 

3132 

11,480 

Area Cleared 
(Acres) 

4 

2 

4 

4.3 

14.3 

Anomaly 
Density 

1,043 

233 

927 

728 

803 Average 

MEC 

Items 
Found 

38 

0 

0 

10 

48 

2.11.4 MUNITIONS DEBRIS DISPOSAL 

USA collected an estimated 756 lb of munitions debris, which was stored in the CONEX on NCNG 
property. During this task, the SUXOS inspected and packed all munitions debris from this and previous 
clearance actions in sealed 55 gallon drums. The shipping company sent a truck to pick up the munitions 
debris, but it did not have the proper loading equipment; thus, the munitions debris was held at the site for 
the next mobilization. 

2.11.5 QUALITY CONTROL 

Of the areas cleared, none were failed for missing a MEC item that met or exceeded the 2.36-inch rocket 
target envelope. No QC seed items were planted for the Area 4B clearance. The USACE MEC Safety 
Specialist issued CEHNC Form 948's, passing all grids (see Appendix B). 

2.11.6 DEMOBILIZATION 

All USA personnel were demobilized on 19 December 2007. 

2.12 REMOVAL ACTION FOR AREA 4, COMPLEX 2, UNIT 1 - SUBTASK 31 
2.12.1 MOBILIZATION 

The SUXOS mobilized to the site on 12 March 2008 to prepare for removal action at Area 4, Complex 2, 
Unit 1 (10 residences) and Unit 1 (five residences). He was met by the USA PM and USACE PM on 13 
March, and the three personnel toured all areas and visited all residences. Measurements were taken 
around the 15 residences to establish boundaries for clearing 2 acres around each residence. 

2.12.2 FIELD OPERATIONS 

Removal operations were originally based on the 105mm projectile as the MGFD, with an MSD for 
unintentional detonations of 341 ft. The 2.36 inch rocket was the smallest target anomaly for depth of 
detection. The MGFD was changed to the 155mm projectile after a 155mm projectile was found on Unit 
1-5 (507 Enon Road), and the MSD for unintentional detonations increased to 395 ft. 
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On 17 March, two work teams mobilized and on 19 March began clearance at Unit 1-1 (533 Enon Road). 
This residence was completed on 20 March and the teams moved to Unit 1-2 (535 Enon Road). Unit 1-2 
was 60% complete by the week's end. 

During the week of 24 through 27 March, Unit 1-2 was completed. Unit 1-3 (521 Enon Road) was 90% 
complete, and Unit 1-4 (509 Enon Road) was 50% complete. 

During the week of 31 March-3 April, Units 1-3 and 1-4 were completed. Unit 1-5 was 70% complete, 
delayed due to the finding of a 155mm projectile which required most of Thursday and a half day on 
Friday to set up and complete the demolition (see Figures C-23 and C-24). No damage was done to the 
residence. Unit 1-6 (505 Enon Road) was 40% complete by the end of the week. 

During the week of 7 through 10 April, Unit 1-6 and Unit 1-11 (495 Enon Road) were completed. Teams 
completed 80% of Unit 1-11, 90% of Unit 1-10 (627B Enon Road), and 50% of Unit 1-9 (627 Enon Road). 

During the week of 14 through 17 April, teams began work in Units 1-9, 1-10, and 1-11, and Unit 1-13 
(4715 Moriah Road). Teams completed 60% of Unit 1-8 (4709 Moriah Road), 50% of Unit 1-14 (4712 
Moriah Road), and 25% of Unit 1-15 (4710 Moriah Road). The USAESCH UXO Safety Specialist also 
issued a DD Form 948 approving our explosives inventory. 

During the week of 21 through 24 April, teams worked at Unit 1-7 (4763 Moriah Road) and Unit 1-12 
(4751 Moriah Road). The teams encountered heavy anomalies and were able to complete about 95% of 
Unit 1-7 and 70% of Unit 1-12. The lessee at Unit 1-12 was uncooperative, returning at odd times during 
the day and forcing the team to vacate the property several times. 

On 28 April, Unit 1-7 was completed. On 29 April, Unit 1-8 was completed. Units 1-14 and 1-15 were 
completed on 1 May, leaving only Unit 1-12 to complete. After a long delay due to the work schedule of 
the State Trooper tenant living there, Unit 1-12 was completed on 3 June and received QA approval on 4 
June. All work in Area 4 Complex 2, Unit 1 was completed on 4 June. Figures D-37 through D-51 in 
Appendix D provide status of clearance activities for Area 4 Complex 2, Unit 1 under this task order for 
each individual residence. 

2.12.3 MEC DISPOSAL 

All 15 residences were brush-cleared where necessary, then intrusively investigated, and passed QC and 
QA inspections. Table 2-5 identifies the properties and acreages, along with number and density of 
anomalies investigated during the clearance. USA located, identified, and disposed of two UXO items on 
the same day, consisting of one 155mm Projectile (HE M102 w/M48 fuze) and one M9 rifle grenade HE 
warhead w/fuze. The 155 mm Projectile was reported as being found at Unit 1-5, but was actually found 
within the boundaries of Unit 1-4. (Details of UXO items recovered in Area 4 Complex 1 are identified in 
Appendix B in Area 4 C2 & C1 Daily Dig Data and UXO Accountability Log.) 

2.12.4 MUNITIONS DEBRIS DISPOSAL 

USA collected an estimated 2,271 lb of munitions debris, which was stored in a CONEX on NCNG 
property. 

2.12.5 QUALITY CONTROL 

Of the 15 residences cleared, none were failed for missing a MEC item that met or exceeded the 
2.36 inch rocket target envelope. No QC seed items were planted for this clearance. The USACE MEC 
Safety Specialist issued CEHNC Form 948's passing all grids (see Appendix B). 
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2.12.6 DEMOBILIZATION 

After completion of Complex 2 Unit 1, all USA personnel shifted efforts to Complex 1, Unit 1, on 4 June 
2008. 

Table 2-4: Area 4, Complex 2, Unit 1 - Subtask 31 Properties, Acres, and Anomalies Investigated 
During Clearance 

Unit (Address) 

1-1 (533 Enon Road) 

1-2 (535 Enon Road) 

1-3 (521 Enon Road) 

1-4 (509 Enon Road) 

1-5 (507 Enon Road) 

1-6 (505 Enon Road) 

1-7 (4763 Moriah Road) 

1-8 (4709 Moriah Road) 

1-9 (627 Enon Road) 

1-10 (627b Enon Road) 

1-11 (495 Enon Road) 

1-12(4751 Moriah Road) 

1-13 (4715 Moriah Road) 

1-14 (4712 Moriah Road) 

1-15 (4710 Moriah Road) 

Totals 

*Actually found within 
boundaries of Unit 1-4 

Anomalies 
Investigated 

1,946 

1,043 

3,501 

2,013 

3,210 

1,400 

1,768 

1,615 

745 

1,225 

2,112 

6,517 

524 

1,884 

3,194 

32,697 

Area Cleared 
(Acres) 

2.5 

2.1 

2.4 

2.2 

2.1 

2.0 

2.0 

2.0 

2.0 

2.2 

2.1 

2.0 

2.0 

2.0 

1.9 

31.5 

Anomaly 
Density 

788 

494 

1,465 

919 

1,558 

714 

871 

824 

380 

567 

1,001 

3,226 

258 

956 

1,672 

1,044 

MEC Items 
Found 

1* 

1 

2 

2.13 REMOVAL ACTION FOR AREA 4, COMPLEX 1, UNIT 1 - SUBTASK 3F 
2.13.1 MOBILIZATION 

Mobilization for Complex 1, Unit 1 (10 residences) consisted of shifting the work force to this unit as tasks 
in Complex 2, Unit 1 were completed. The SUXOS was met by the USA PM and USACE PM on 23 April 
2008, and the three personnel toured all areas and visited all residences. Measurements were taken 
around 10 residences to establish boundaries for clearing 2 acres around each residence. 

2.13.2 FIELD OPERATIONS 

Removal operations were based on the 105mm projectile as the MGFD, with an MSD for unintentional 
detonations of 341 ft. The 2.36 inch rocket was the smallest target anomaly for depth of detection. 

A team began clearance at Unit 1-10 (564 Enon Road) on 1 May. During the week of 5-8 May, both 
teams completed clearances at Unit 1-10 (564 Enon Road) and Unit 1-6 (6613 Isham Chambers Road); 
and completed 95% of Unit 1-5 (6701 Isham Chambers Road). 
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During the week of 11-15 May, teams completed clearance of Units 1-4 (6703 Isham Chambers Road) 
and 1-5. They completed clearance of 65% of Unit 1-3 (6707 Isham Chambers Road) and 25% of Unit 1-
9 (6718 Isham Chambers Road). 

On 22 May, one team cleared vegetation at Units 1-1 (6805 Isham Chambers Road), 1-2 (6721 Isham 
Chambers Road), and 1-3 while the other team performed clearance at Unit 1-9, completing 75% of the 
property. On 30 May, Unit 1-9 was completed and Unit 1-3 was 70% complete. 

From 3 to 5 June, the teams completed Unit 1-3 and 70% of Unit 1-2. On 11 June, Units 1-1 and 1-2 
were completed. By 12 June, Unit 1-7 (6724 Isham Chambers Road) was at 75% complete and Unit 1-8 
(6720 Isham Chambers Road) was at 80% complete. All work for Area 4 Complex 1, Unit 1 was 
completed by 17 June. Figures D-28 through D-36 provide status of clearance activities for Area 4 
Complex 1, Unit 1 under this task order for each individual residence. 

2.13.3 MEC DISPOSAL 

For Area 4 Complex 1 Unit 1, ten residences were brush-cleared, intrusively investigated, and passed QC 
and QA inspections. Maps showing the cleared properties are shown in Appendix D. The following table 
identifies the properties and acreages, along with number of anomalies investigated during the clearance. 

Table 2-5: Area 4, Complex 1, Unit 1 - Subtask 3F Properties, Acres, and Anomalies Investigated 
During Clearance 

Unit (Address) 

1-1 (6805 Isham Chmbrs) 

1-2(6721 Isham Chmbrs) 

1-3 (6707 Isham Chmbrs) 

1-4 (6703 Isham Chmbrs) 

1-5 (6701 Isham Chmbrs) 

1-6 (6613 Isham Chmbrs) 

1-7 (6724 Isham Chmbrs) 

1-8 (6720 Isham Chmbrs) 

1-9 (6718 Isham Chmbrs) 

1-10 (564 Enon Road) 

Totals 

Anomalies 
Investigated 

1149 

2321 

3533 

2322 

1739 

1133 

1022 

1449 

511 

1366 

16545 

Area Cleared 
(Acres) 

0.7 

1.6 

2.1 

2.1 

2.1 

1.9 

2.2 

2.2 

3.0 

2.1 

20.0 

Anomaly 
Density 

1741 

1407 

1643 

1111 

836 

593 

454 

647 

172 

638 

821 

During the removal action at Area 4, Complex 1, Unit 1, approximately 16,545 subsurface anomalies 
were excavated. No MEC items were found during the clearance effort at Unit 1 of Area 4 Complex 1. 

2.13.4 MUNITIONS DEBRIS DISPOSAL 

USA collected an estimated 600 lb of munitions debris, which was stored in a CONEX on NCNG property. 

2.13.5 QUALITY CONTROL 

Of the 10 residences cleared, none were failed for missing a MEC item that met or exceeded the 
2.36-inch rocket target envelope. No QC seed items were planted for this clearance. The USACE MEC 
Safety Specialist issued CEHNC Form 948's passing all grids (see Appendix B). 
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2.13.6 DEMOBILIZATION 

After completion of Complex 1, Unit 1 on 17 June 2008, the clearance teams shifted to Complex 2 Unit 2. 

2.14 REMOVAL ACTION FOR AREA 4, COMPLEX 2, UNIT 2 - SUBTASK 31 
2.14.1 MOBILIZATION 

Mobilization for Complex 2, Unit 2 (10 residences) consisted of shifting the work force to this unit as tasks 
in Complex 1, Unit 1 were completed. The SUXOS was met by the USA PM and USACE PM on 23 April 
2008, and the three personnel toured all areas and visited all residences. Measurements were taken 
around 10 residences to establish boundaries for clearing 2 acres around each residence. 

2.14.2 FIELD OPERATIONS 

Removal operations were based on the 105mm projectile as the MGFD, with an MSD for unintentional 
detonations of 341 ft. The 2.36 inch rocket was the smallest target anomaly for depth of detection. 

Work began on the second unit on 18 June, with a single team completing Unit 2-3 (4696 Clayton Road) 
on that day. Both teams worked at Unit 2-7 (4679 Clayton Road) and at Unit 2-8 (Clayton & Moriah 
Road) on 19 June and from 23 through 26 June, having to perform considerable brush clearing prior to 
clearance operations. Unit 2-7 was completed on 25 June, and Unit 2-8 was 75% complete by 26 June. 
The teams demobilized on 27 June. 

The teams remobilized on 7 July. Unit 2-4 (5095 Clayton Road) and Unit 2-8 were completed during the 
week, passing QA on 10 July. During the week of 14 through 17 July, teams worked at Unit 2-1 (Berea & 
Range Road) and Unit 2-5 (5135 Moriah Road). Unit 2-5 passed QA on 17 July. During the week of 21 
through 24 July, teams completed Unit 2-1 and Unit 2-10 (5473 Range Road), and started clearance at 
Unit 2-9 (4669 Uzzle Road). During the week of 28 through 31 July, teams completed Unit 2-6 (5056 
Clayton Road). Unit 2-2 (5057 Clayton Road) was completed on 5 August. During the week of 11 
through 14 August, both teams continued to clear Unit 2-9, but were plagued by heavy concentrations of 
munitions fragments. A 105 mm projectile was found at Unit 2-9 on 7 August and was BIP using the 
"Buried Explosion Module" method for disposal (see Figures C-21 and C-22). 

Teams returned to Unit 2-9 on 8 September and completed clearance of the site (2.2 acres) on 11 
September. A 37mm projectile was found next to the pole barn, and special protective works were 
erected to prevent destruction of the equipment being stored there. The demolition was performed 
without incident, and work at Unit 2 was completed. All work was completed for Area 4 Complex 2, Unit 2 
on 11 September. Figures D-52 through D-61 in Appendix D provide status of clearance activities for 
Area 4 Complex 2, Unit 2 under this task order for each individual residence. 

2.14.3 MEC DISPOSAL 

All 10 residences were brush-cleared where necessary, then intrusively investigated, and passed QC and 
QA inspections. Table 2-6 identifies the properties and acreages, along with number and density of 
anomalies investigated during the clearance. Two MEC items, both classified as UXO, were found during 
the clearance effort at Unit 2-9 of Area 4 Complex 2. One item was a 105mm HE M1 projectile with M48 
series fuze, and the other was a 37mm projectile M62 with M58 Practice fuze. 

On 17 September 2008, approximately 3,211 lb of munitions debris were shipped to Demil Metals in 
Glencoe, Illinois. Approximately 2,700 lb of this amount came from the Unit 2-9 property. The munitions 
debris consisted largely of fragmentation from 37mm, 105mm and 155mm projectiles, and numerous fuze 
parts. (Details of UXO items recovered in Area 4 Complex 2 are identified in Appendix B in Area 4 C2 & 
C1 Daily Dig Data and UXO Accountability Log.) 
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Table 2-6: Area 4, Complex 2, Unit 2 - Subtask 31 Properties, Acres, and Anomalies Investigated 
During Clearance 

Unit (Address) 

2-1 (Berea & Range Rd) 

2-2 (5057 Clayton Road) 

2-3 (4696 Clayton Road) 

2-4 (5095 Clayton Road) 

2-5 (5135 Moriah Road) 

2-6 (5056 Clayton Road) 

2-7 (4679 Clayton Road) 

2-8 (Clayton & Moriah Road) 

2-9 (4669 Uzzle Road) 

2-10 (5473 Range Road) 

Totals 

Anomalies 
Investigated 

4707 

3627 

1206 

1128 

3844 

2300 

2192 

5042 

18,830 

1472 

44,348 

Area Cleared 
(Acres) 

2.4 

1.4 

2.0 

0.6 

3.0 

1.0 

1.4 

2.6 

2.1 

1.1 

17.6 

Anomaly 
Density 

1961 

2591 

603 

1880 

1281 

2300 

1566 

1939 

8967 

1636 

2372 
Average 

MEC Items 
Found 

2 

2 

2.14.4 MUNITIONS DEBRIS DISPOSAL 

USA collected an estimated 3,120 lb of munitions debris, which was stored in a CONEX on NCNG 
property. 

2.14.5 QUALITY CONTROL 

Of the 10 residences cleared, none were failed for missing a MEC item that met or exceeded the 
2.36 inch rocket target envelope. No QC seed items were planted for this clearance. The USAESCH 
UXO Safety Specialist issued CEHNC Form 948's passing all grids (see Appendix B). 

2.14.6 DEMOBILIZATION 

All USA personnel demobilized on 16 September. 

2.15 SITE WIDE INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS - SUBTASK 3J 
2.15.1 RESTORATION ADVISORY BOARD SUPPORT 

During the clearance actions at former Camp Butner, USA participated in all quarterly RAB meetings, 
presenting updates on progress of the work and recording minutes of the meetings. 

2.15.2 SIGN INSTALLATION 

The USAESCH sign installation tasking was issued on 13 August 2008, requesting completion of task 
within 30 days. Additional signs were manufactured and shipped to the site. A meeting with NCDOT and 
USACE Wilmington was held on 10 September to verify sign locations. A professional highway sign 
installation company conducted the installation of signs on 17 September. These individuals were 
escorted by the SUXOS, who provided anomaly avoidance support and recorded GPS locations of the 
signposts. He reported that he did not have the proper signs for locations 18 and 27, that he needed two 
Person County signs and had three extra Durham County signs. Two additional Person County signs 
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were ordered and mounted on 23 October. An as-built map was prepared to enable verification of county 
designations. A total of 35 signs were installed. (See Figure D-2 for sign locations.) 

2.16 EVACUATIONS - SUBTASK 3K 

During the clearance of the former Camp Butner, USA provided 288 total evacuations. USA coordinated 
with residents affected by the MSD for unintentional detonations a week ahead of clearance in that area 
to determine if they would be away from their home during work hours. If they worked out of their home 
or were homebound and had no other options, USA offered to evacuate them to a motel during clearance 
activities. An evacuation consisted of providing a motel room, and meals. Gasoline was also provided if 
requested. 

Evacuations were particularly heavy during the early clearance actions because the MSD for 
unintentional detonations was based on MSD. When the MSD for unintentional detonations was changed 
in October 2007 to hazardous fragment distance, evacuations dropped dramatically. 

Evacuations have been incurred in accordance with Table 2-7. While there are 575 funded evacuations, 
this task has 287 evacuations remaining as of 30 September 08. 

Table 2-7: Evacuations by Areas Cleared 

Area Cleared 

1A 

Lakeview Subdivision 

4A 

4D 

4B 

4C 

Area 4 Complex 2 Unit 1 

Area 4 Complex 2 Unit 2 

Area 4 Complex 1 Unit 1 

Total Evacuations 

Evacuations Incurred 

3 

23 

5 

113 

3 

47 

42 

6 

46 

288 
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CHAPTER 3 

3.0 DOCUMENTATION 

This section discusses the documentation generated during the Camp Butner project, operating 
procedures/issues, and lessons learned during the conduct of operations at the project site. 

3.1 GRID RECORDS 

Appendix B contains MEC and munitions debris accountability documentation for all properties cleared, to 
include grid tracking logs, a UXO accountability log (spreadsheet), explosive usage and accountability 
documents, munitions debris scrap destruction certifications with 1348 Forms, and grid records. (The grid 
records have been placed on munitions debris.) Grid sheets are missing for clearance operations 
completed in Area 4C as a result of records of those operations being lost during shipment. After an 
exhaustive search, all but one grid sheet for Area 4A were determined to be missing. 

3.2 SITE PHOTOGRAPHS 

Digital color photographs of major activities and MEC discoveries are provided in Appendix C. 

3.3 MAPS 

Appendix D provides maps that show the boundaries of clearance along with records and locations of 
MEC/UXO found during the clearances. 

3.4 QC/QA DOCUMENTATION 

Appendix E contains QC/QA documentation, including weekly and daily QC inspection records, HND 948 
forms, QC daily operator instrument test forms, and QC seeds documentation. Except for one QC 
inspection report, QC inspection records are missing for Area 4C, presumably having been lost during 
shipment. 

3.5 LOCATION SURVEY AND COORDINATE DOCUMENTATION 

Appendix F contains survey drawings with coordinates for those site boundaries established and certified 
by Acculine Surveying. 

3.6 WEEKLY REPORTS 

Appendix G contains weekly operations summaries documented by the SUXOS. 

3.7 LESSONS LEARNED 

This section documents the lessons learned during the course of site operations. 

3.7.1 MINELAB II OPERATION 

During the post-award site visit, USA used a Schonstedt GA-52Cx magnetometer to conduct a cursory 
check of anomaly densities in Area 1A. Anomaly density and occurrence of magnetic rocks were light in 
all the areas tested. The site visit team did not explore the northern and western boundaries because the 
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area looked no different from the rest of the site. On the basis of the site visit, the Schonstedt GA-52Cx 
was selected as the primary detection tool, with the Minelab II selected for use as a backup. 

During the removal action for Area 1A, the northwestern area was found to contain many "hot rocks" and 
heavy concentrations of anomalies due to an abandoned homestead. As a result, the MEC clearance 
teams had a low production rate until Minelab II metal detectors were shipped to the site. The Minelab II 
was set to filter out "hot rocks". The operation was changed so that the MEC Team Leader brought in the 
Minelab II, whenever a Schonstedt operator suspected that an anomaly was a "hot rock". Use of the 
Minelab enabled operators to bypass unnecessary digs, and production was greatly increased. The 
lesson learned was that concurrent use of Schonstedt GA-52Cx detect magnetometers and Minelab II 
metal detectors can effectively improve production rates in "hot rock" areas, instead of using each type of 
detector exclusively. 
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CHAPTER 4 

4.0 TESTS 

This chapter details the procedures and methods that USA used at the former Camp Butner and 
addresses equipment testing and calibration, QC inspections and audits, and reporting procedures. 
Throughout site operations the UXOQCS performed QC checks of equipment, procedures, and 
performance. 

4.1 INSTRUMENT AND EQUIPMENT TESTING, CALIBRATION, AND MAINTENANCE 

This section describes the methods and procedures used for instrument and equipment testing, 
calibration, and maintenance. 

4.1.1 TESTING PROCEDURES AND FREQUENCY 

Instruments and equipment (e.g., navigational, data analysis, and transfer systems) used to gather and 
generate site data were tested with sufficient frequency and in such a manner as to ensure that accuracy 
and reproducibility of results are consistent with the manufacturer's specifications. 

The method performed for measuring the instrument response was conducted at the start of each 
workday, over a test area, and comparing that response and position to a known response and position 
recorded prior to the instrument's initial placement into service. Instruments or equipment failing to meet 
the standard was repaired, recalibrated, or replaced. Replaced instruments or equipment met the same 
specifications for accuracy and precision as the item removed from service. Items such as cellular 
telephones and cellular walkie-talkies were tested for serviceability at the start of each workday. 

4.1.2 GEOPHYSICAL TEST STRIP 

USA established one test strip for detection equipment at Area 1A, of sufficient size and containing an 
appropriate number of inert target and clutter items. These seed items were of similar size, depth, 
orientation, and composition of MEC items expected to be found on the project site. The plot included the 
smallest item expected to be located on site at the MSD depth detectable by the instrument being used. 
For all remaining sites, the test strip was established at the office trailer compound, and contained the 
same items in the same configuration as the Area 1A test strip. Configuration and layout of the test strip 
at both sites followed the characteristics in Table 4-1. 

Table 4-1: Test Strip As-Built Characteristics 

1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

Seed ID 

Test Strip Start rebar 

MKII grenade 

MKII grenade 

MKII grenade 

MKII grenade 

MKII grenade 

MKII grenade 

MKII grenade 

Test Strip End rebar 

Local X (ft) 

0 

10 

20 

30 

40 

50 

60 

70 

80 

Local Y (ft) 

0 

-1 

2 

0 

-2 

1 

0 

2 

0 

Depth (ft) 

flush 

0.5 

0.5 

1.5 

1.5 

1.5 

2.0 

2.0 

flush 

Orientation 

NA 

Along-track 

Across-track 

NA 

Across-track 

Along-track 

Along-Track 

NA 

NA 

Inclination 

Vertical 

Horizontal 

45 degrees 

Vertical 

Horizontal 

Horizontal 

Horizontal 

Vertical 

Vertical 
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4.1.3 ROUTINE EQUIPMENT CHECKS 

GPS equipment was checked each day before being placed into service. Each detector was tested each 
workday prior to being placed into service. This test included a functions check and the locating of 
selected anomalies within the test strip. Moving the on/off/volume/range selector switches through the 
various positions and determining the serviceability/functionality accomplished the functions check. 
Selected anomalies were seed items that met the size and depth requirements necessary to determine 
the serviceability of the instrument. Instruments failing this test were repaired or replaced as directed by 
the SUXOS or UXOQCS. 

4.1.4 CALIBRATION 

Calibration of instruments and equipment requiring calibration or recalibration was completed in 
accordance with the manufacturer's recommendation or owner's manual. 

4.1.5 MAINTENANCE 

Scheduled maintenance of the following equipment was performed in accordance with the manufacturer's 
recommendation or owner's manual for equipment requiring regular upkeep: 

• Vehicles 

• Powered Equipment 

• Personal Protective Equipment 

• Communications Equipment 

• Navigational Equipment 

• Handheld Metal Detectors 

• Emergency Equipment. 

4.2 QUALITY CONTROL 

This section describes the QC methods and procedures used during site operations. 

4.2.1 QC/QA SEED ITEMS 

As grids were completed by the MEC dig teams, the UXOQCS would check the grid against the list of QC 
seeds. If the grid contained a seed item and the dig team recovered the item, the grid was passed. If the 
dig team failed to find a seed item, the grid was failed and was re-swept. Sections 2.6.5, 2.7.5, and 
2.11.5 provide results of the dig teams' recovery of seed items in Areas 1A, 4A, and Lakeview 
Subdivision, respectively. Seeds were not planted for any of the other areas of the project. 

4.2.2 HANDHELD METAL DETECTOR 

A QC survey was performed using a handheld locator of the same technology used for the original survey 
covering a minimum of 10% of each grid after field operations were completed. Excavations of any un-
dug anomalies discovered during the QC survey were thoroughly investigated and the results recorded. 
In addition, a QC check of selected investigated anomalies was performed to demonstrate that the 
excavation removed the anomaly and there were no remaining items of concern. Sections 2.6.5, 2.7.5, 
2.8.5, 2.9.5, 2.10.5, 2.11.5, 2.12.5, 2.13.5, and 2.14.5 summarize results of the dig teams' actions in 
response to QC inspections in all eight areas of the project. For all areas of the project, the USACE MEC 
Safety Specialist issued CEHNC Form 948's passing all grids (see Appendix B). 
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4.2.3 FAILURE CRITERIA 

During the USA QC or Government QA of any grid, if a piece of ferrous metal equivalent in size to the 
smallest target anomaly for that area (IAW the SOW) or larger or any UXO item was found, the grid was 
failed. When a team reported a grid as complete and the grid contained a QC seed item that was not 
reported as found, the grid was failed. No Government seed items were planted. 

4.2.4 CORRECTIVE ACTION REQUESTS 

During the course of the field effort, there were no corrective action requests (CARs) issued by the 
Government. 

4.2.5 MUNITIONS DEBRIS 

munitions debris was inspected prior to release for disposal. This property was 100% properly inspected 
in accordance with the approved Work Plan. Dual signatures for certifying and verifying the property 
were required on the DD Form 1348-1 a. The SUXOS and UXOQCS ensured that procedures were 
followed that precluded any explosive or energetic material from being released to the public, and 
required documentation was maintained on file for inspection purposes. 

4.3 QUALITY CONTROL INSPECTIONS, AUDITS, AND REPORTS 

The UXOQCS was responsible for the accomplishment of operational checks of instruments and 
equipment by site personnel and ensuring the appropriate log entries were made. The UXOQCS 
performed inspections and or audits at random (see Appendix E) and unscheduled checks of the site to 
ensure personnel accomplished all work as specified in the Work Plan. The UXOQCS conducted 
inspections of all grids, and all were checked and accepted by the Government (see Appendix E). 
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CHAPTER 5 

5.0 FINANCIAL BREAKDOWN 

Contract project tasks were a combination of Firm Fixed Price (FFP) and Time & Material (T&M). The 
following tables include costs for the project as of 31 December 2008. 

5.1 TOTAL PROJECT COSTS 

Table 5-1 includes total project costs through 31 December 2008 and details the task order progress in 
terms of percentage completed, costs budgeted, costs expended, and remaining funding for project tasks. 

Table 5-1: Task 3J Total Project Costs through 31 December 2008 

Task Order Progress - T&M Tasks 

Task 

Task 3j Sitewide Institutional 
Controls 

TOTAL 

Price 

T&M 

Budgeted 

$128,475.17 

$128,475.17 

% Complete 

39.7% 

Expended 

$51,058.47 

$51,058.47 

Remaining 

$77,416.70 

$77,416.70 

Task Order Progress - FFP Tasks 

Task 

Task 1 Project Preparation & 
Planning 

Task 2 Work Plan 

Task 3 Removal Action 

Task 3a Area 1A Flame Thrower 
Range 

Task 3b Complex 1 Area 4A 

Task 3c Complex 1 Area 4B 

Task 3d Complex 1 Area 4D 

Task 3e Complex 1 Area 4E 

Task 3f Cx 1 Area 4 Remaining 
Lands (QTY: 14 10-residence 
units) 

UNIT1 

UNIT 2 

UNIT 3 

UNIT 4 

UNIT 5 

Task 3g Lakeview Subdivision 

Task 3h Complex 2 Area 4C 

Task 3i Cx 2 Area 4 Remaining 
Lands (QTY: 8 10-residence units) 

Type 

FFP 

FFP 

FFP 

FFP 

FFP 

FFP 

FFP 

FFP 

LOT 

FFP 

FFP 

LOT 

Task Order 
Amount 

$19,321.29 

$22,790.83 

$216,136.99 

$334,355.91 

$172,224.20 

$269,413.20 

$72,970.34 

$3,826,102.00 

$273,293.00 

$273,293.00 

$273,293.00 

$273,293.00 

$273,293.00 

$264,238.52 

$154,599.68 

$2,339,508.00 

% 
Complete 

44 

100 

100 

100 

100 

100 

0 

100 

63 

0 

0 

0 

100 

100 

Expended 

$8,501.37 

$22,790.83 

$216,136.99 

$334,355.91 

$172,224.20 

$269,413.20 

$0.00 

$273,293.00 

$172,174.59 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$264,238.52 

$154,599.68 

Remaining 

$10,819.92 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$72,970.34 

$0.00 

$101,118.41 

$273,293.00 

$273,293.00 

$273,293.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 
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Task Order Progress - FFP Tasks (Concluded) 

Task 
UNIT1 

UNIT 2 

UNIT 3 

Task 3i Cx 2 Area 4 Remaining 
Lands (QTY: 1 5-residence unit) 

Task 3k Evacuations (QTY 575 ) 

Task 3m Mobilizations (QTY up to 
10) 

MOB 1 w/SUXOS & QC 

MOB 1 w/o SUXOS & QC 

MOB 2 of 5 w/SUXOS & QC 

MOB 2 of 5 w/o SUXOS & QC 

Task 4 Geospatial Data 

Task 5 Annual Report (2006-2008) 

Task 5a Annual Report (2009) 

Task 5b Annual Report (2010) 

Task 6 Project Management 

Total 

Type 

FFP 

EA 

1 

1 

6 

6 

FFP 

FFP 

FFP 

FFP 

FFP 

Task Order 
Amount 

$273,293.00 

$273,293.00 

$273,293.00 

$153,164.00 

$181,125.00 

$285,850.00 

$16,770.00 

$11,815.00 

$100,620.00 

$70,890.00 

$16,779.57 

$20,790.47 

$16,368.00 

$16,368.00 

$0.00 

% 
Complete 

100 

100 

0 

100 

288 

0 

100 

100 

100 

100 

60 

0 

0 

0 

Expended 

$273,293.00 

$273,293.00 

$0.00 

$153,164.00 

$90,720.00 

$16,770.00 

$11,815.00 

$16,770.00 

$11,815.00 

$10,067.74 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$2,745,436.03 

Total Funded FFP 

Remaining 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$273,293.00 

$0.00 

$90,405.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$83,850.00 

$59,075.00 

$6,711.83 

$20,790.47 

$16,368.00 

$16,368.00 

$1,571,648.97 

$4,317,085.00 

5.2 MAN-HOURS, TRAVEL, AND MATERIAL COSTS 

Table 5-2 includes T&M costs for Task 3J through 31 December 2008 for man-hours, materials, and 
travel. Man-hours and costs for tasks that are FFP are not included in the tables. 
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Table 5-2: Task 3J T&M Costs through 31 December 2008 

CLIN/ltem 

Labor 

Materials 

Travel 

Task #3j Description 

Project Manager 

Sr. UXO Supervisor 0% 

Sr. UXO Supervisor 4% 

Sr. UXO Supervisor 4% (O/T) 

Tech III 

Sub-Total Labor 

Subcontract (RAB Meetings) 
Brenda K. Daniel 

Protection Service (Signs) 

Gasoline 

Lodging & Travel 

Total Costs Task 3j 

Unit Price 

$88.22 

$78.72 

$81.86 

$122.79 

$61.45 

Total 
Hours 

351 

14 

5 

6 

4 

380 

Amount 

$ 30,965.22 

$ 1,102.08 

$409.30 

$736.74 

$245.80 

$33,459.14 

$1,107.75 

$5,410.65 

$790.17 

$10,290.75 

$51,058.47 
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CHAPTER 6 

6.0 SUMMARY 

USA completed all tasks safely and efficiently and in accordance with the SOW and approved WP. USA 
closely coordinated with the USAESCH, USACE Wilmington, and local officials. Table 6-1 summarizes, 
by areas, the MEC items recovered and disposed, while the following paragraphs summarize removal 
actions for each area. Figure D-2 provides the overall status map of all areas cleared under this task 
order. 

Table 6-1: Task 3J MEC Items Recovered and Disposed 

MEC Item 

M1A1 mine 

Smoke Canister 

M9 Rifle Grenade 

M9 Rifle Grenade Warhead 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 
Warhead 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket Mtr 

M 2 Hand Grenade 

2.36 inch Rocket (practice) 

2.36 inch Rocket, HE 

2.36 inch Rocket Warhead HE 

2.36 inch Rocket Fuze 
W/Booster 

37mm Projectile HE 

37mm M62 Black Powder 

57mm AP-T 

81mm HE mortar 

60mm HE mortar 

105mm projectile HE 

155 mm MK 1 Shrapnel Rd 

155mm projectile HE 

Area Found 

1A 

1A 

4A 

Lakeview Subdivision 

4A 

Complex 2 Unit 1-7 4763 Moriah Rd 

Lakeview Subdivision 

4A 

4A 

4C - 4559 Uzzle Rd 

4C-4553UzzleRd 

4B Open Area 

4B Open Area 

4B Open Area 

4D - 6305 Isham Chambers Rd 

4D - 6425 Isham Chambers Rd 

4C - 4559 Uzzle Rd 

4C - Foggy Bottom Hunting Lodge, Uzzle Rd 

Complex 2 Unit 2-9 - 4669 Uzzle Rd 

4D - 6425 Isham Chambers Rd 

4C - 4524D Uzzle Rd 

4B Open Area 

4C-191 Falcon Lane 

4D-6317MancourRd 

4C - 4559 Uzzle Rd 

Complex 2 Unit 2-9 - 4669 Uzzle Rd 

4C - Foggy Bottom Hunting Lodge, Uzzle Rd 

4C - 4524D Uzzle Rd 

4C - 4535 Uzzle Rd 

Complex 2 Unit 1-5 507 Enon Rd 

Grand Total 

# 
Found 

10 

4 

21 

25 

26 

13 

8 

130 
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6.1 REMOVAL ACTIONS 
6.1.1 AREA 1A 

During Area 1A removal action, USA cleared 20 acres and excavated approximately 6,343 anomalies. 
USA located, identified, and disposed of two UXO items. USA also collected an estimated 530 lb of 
munitions debris during this action. 

6.1.2 LAKEVIEW SUBDIVISION 

During the removal action at Lakeview Subdivision, USA was allowed to clear 19.01 acres of the 26.35 
acres scheduled for clearance. USA identified approximately 11,107 subsurface anomalies for 
excavation, but 5,881 flags were removed at homeowners' requests. A total of 4,819 digs were 
accomplished. USA located, identified, and disposed of two MEC items and collected an estimated 3 lb 
of munitions debris during this action. 

6.1.3 AREA4A 

During the removal action at Area 4A, USA cleared 51 grids (34 acres) and investigated approximately 
18,439 subsurface anomalies. USA located, identified, and disposed of 60 MEC items, of which 56 were 
UXO and four were DMM items. USA collected an estimated 410 lb of munitions debris during this action. 

6.1.4 AREA4D 

During the removal action at Area 4D, USA cleared 12 residences representing 24.23 acres and 
investigated approximately 31,290 anomalies. USA located, identified, and disposed of four MEC items 
and collected an estimated 746 lb of munitions debris. 

6.1.5 AREA4C 

During the removal action at Area 4C, USA cleared eight residences representing 16.19 acres, and 
investigated approximately 34,345 anomalies. USA located, identified, and disposed of ten MEC items 
and collected an estimated 4,039 lb of munitions debris. 

6.1.6 AREA4B 

During the removal action at Area 4B, USA cleared three residences and an open area extension, 
representing 14.3 acres, and investigated approximately 11,480 anomalies. USA located, identified, and 
disposed of 48 MEC items and collected an estimated 756 lb of munitions debris. 

6.1.7 AREA 4 COMPLEX 2 

During the removal action at Area 4 Complex 2 - Units 1 and 2, USA cleared a total of 25 residences 
(Unit 1 had 15 residences and Unit 2 had 10 residences). USA cleared 32,697 anomalies from Unit 1, 
representing 31.33 acres, and 44,348 anomalies from Unit 2 representing 18.7 acres. USA located! 
identified, and disposed of four MEC items and collected an estimated 2,271 lb and 3,120 lb of munitions 
debris from Units 1 and 2, respectively. 

6.1.8 AREA 4 COMPLEX 1 

During the removal action at Area 4 Complex 1 - Unit 1 USA cleared a total of 10 residences. USA 
cleared 16,545 anomalies from Unit 1, representing 20.14 acres. USA found no MEC items, but 
collected an estimated 600 lb of munitions debris from Unit 1. 
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6.2 INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS 

During the clearance actions at former Camp Butner, USA participated in 13 RAB meetings, presenting 
updates on progress of the work and recording minutes of the meetings. In addition, 35 highway signs 
were manufactured and were installed by October 2008 by a professional sign installation company to 
meet sign location requirements of USACE Wilmington and NCDOT. 

6.3 EVACUATIONS 

During clearance operations, many of the nearby residents voluntarily left their homes, while a total of 288 
paid evacuations of residences occurred on a temporary basis. USA hired off-duty personnel from the 
Butner police department and from the three county sheriffs' offices in which Camp Butner is located. 
The police and fire departments and sheriffs' offices were also very generous in providing other support 
during field operations. 

End of document. 
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APPENDIX A. SCOPE OF WORK 

This appendix contains a copy of the Scope of Work (SOW) for the Non Time-Critical Removal Action, 
Former Camp Butner, Butner, North Carolina, dated 27 June 2005, and revised 1 March 2007, 28 March 
2007,10 December 2007, 12 May 2008, and 30 September 2008. (on CD) 
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APPENDIX B. MEC AND MD ACCOUNTABILITY 

This appendix contains the following documentation: 

1. Grid Tracking Logs 
2. UXO Accountability Log 
3. Explosive Usage Logs & Accountability Documents (on CD) 
4. MD Scrap Destruction Certifications & DD Form 1348's (on CD) 
5. Grid Records (on CD) 
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701037 
701401 
701024 
701008 
701035 
701031 
701026 

701154 
700975 
701055 
701055 
701065 
701129 
701080 
701076 
701104 
701071 
701083 
701088 
701083 
701073 

Kta&j 
i t tWi l 

701210 
701047 
701043 

705235 
701160 
701136 
701139 
701139 
701121 
701110 
701124 

701167 
701188 

700972 

,lntrtisive§l3oritp; 
24-Jan 
24-Jan 
6-Feb 
2-Feb 

n/a 
14-Feb 

15-Feb 
30-Jan 
7-Feb 

26-Jan 

24-Jan 
13-Feb 
16-Feb 

16-Feb 
15-Feb 

1-Feb 

30-Jan 
30-Jan 
30-Jan 
9-Feb 

14-Feb 
8-Feb 

gps line 

1-Feb 

6-Feb 

t . . i„aia 
IntiWi^fBS 

1-Feb 

9-Feb 
9-Feb 

14-Feb 
1-Feb 

2-Feb 

9-Feb 
13-Feb 

1-Feb 

30-Jan 
8-Feb 
8-Feb 

30-Jan 
8-Feb 
8-Feb 

15-Feb 

*iQS&tBOtof, 
24-Jan 
24-Jan 
6-Feb 
2-Feb 
7-Feb 

14-Feb 

15-Feb 
30-Jan 
8-Feb 

30-Jan 

24-Jan 
13-Feb 
16-Feb 

16-Feb 
15-Feb 

1-Feb 

31-Jan 

9-Feb 
15-Feb 
8-Feb 

2-Feb 

6-Feb 

iiis^SB 
ipiiiipiii 

1-Feb 

9-Feb 
13-Feb 
14-Feb 

1-Feb 

2-Feb 

9-Feb 
13-Feb 

1-Feb 

30-Jan 
8-Feb 
8-Feb 

30-Jan 
8-Feb 
8-Feb 

15-Feb 

TJpe 

DMM .30 Cal 

m68 81mm mortar 
m68 81mm mortar 
smoke grenade frag x2 
Grenade spoon 
m1a1 practice mine 
m1a1 practice mine 
m68 81mm mortar 
m1a1 cartridge 

(11) m68 81mm mortar 
m1a1 mine 
m15wp grenade 
smoke grenade frag 
(7)m68 81mm mortar 
(6) m68 81mm mortar 
Grenade spoon 
m68 81mm mortar 
m68 81mm mortar 
m1a1 smoke cartridge 
m1a1 smoke cartridge 
m1a1 smoke cartridge 

smoke grenade frag 
m68 81mm mortar 
m68 81mm mortar 
(7) m68 81mm mortar 

flamethrower ignition cartridge 
grenade pins and spoons 
primer cart. 
smoke grenade frag 
smoke grenade frag 
smoke grenade frag 
smoke grenade frag 
smoke grenade frag 
m68 81mm mortar 
(2)m68 81mm mortar 

fc»s4 . 
teKWl-vpe 
m68 81 mm mortar 
m1a1 smoke cartridge 
m1a1 practice mine 

smoke grenade frag 
m1a1 smoke cartridqe 
m1a1 smoke cartridge 
m1a1 smoke cartridge 
m1a1 smoke cartridge 
m1a1 smoke cartridge 
m1a1 smoke cartridge 
(2) m1a1 smoke cartridge 

m1a1 practice mine 
m1a1 smoke cartridge 

m1a1 smoke cartridqe 

Condition 

on clip 

expended 
expended 
expended 

expended 
expended 
no cart 
expended 

expended 
for bip 
for bip 
md 
expended 
expended 

no cart 
no cart 
expended 
expended 
expended 

expended 
expended 
expended 
expended 

expended 

expended 
expended 
expended 
expended 
expended 
expended 
expended 
expended 

^, 
Condition 

no can 
expended 
expended 

expended 
expended 
expended 
expended 
expended 
expended 
expended 
expended 

expended 
expended 

expended 

(1) m15wp grenade, (1) m1a1 mine 

I 



GRID 

45-B29 
45-B30 
45-B31 
45-B32 

t;»fc« 
45-C29 

45-C30 

45-C31 

45-C32 

45-C33 
45-C34 

ttMHiiitk — — i 
45-D28 

45-D29 

45-D30 

45-D31 
45-D32 
45-D33 

45-D34 

imt f l i 

45-E28 

45-E29 

45-E30 

45-E31 

45-E32 

45-E33 

45-E34 

45-F27 

45-F28 

45-F29 

45-F30 

45-F31 
45-F32 

BRUSH 

Date 

9/26 
9/26 
9/26 
9/26 

•ilEi 
9/25 

9/26 

9/26 

9/26 

9/26 
9/26 

H H 9/25 

9/25 

9/25 

9/27 
9/26 
9/26 

9/26 

9/25 

9/25 

9/25 

9/27 

9/27 

9/27 

9/26 

9/25 

9/25 

9/25 

9/25 

9/27 
9/27 

TM 

2 
2 
2 

Mag/ 
Flag 

Date 

10/2 
10/2 
10/2 
10/3 

2 

2 

1 

1 

J 
IN 

2 

2 

2 

2 

1 

1 

10/30 

11/1 

10/24 

11/1 

10/3 
10/12 

WNI 10/11 

10/24 

11/1 

10/24 
11/14 
11/2 

10/26 

i M P M H " 

1 

1 

10/12 

10/23 

11/1 

10/16 

10/30 

10/24 

10/26 
:::if5»;h. .%•-•;• 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 
2 

10/4 

10/10 

10/23 

10/31 

10/31 
10/10 

TM 

1 
1 
1 
1 

1 

1 

3 

1 

2 
2 

HM| 1 

1 

2 

2 
2 
1 

3 

1 

1 

1 

2 

1 

1 

3 

1 

1 

3 

2 

2 
2 

An 
Marked 

545 
906 
609 
416 

121 

522 

214 

151 

7371 
1253 

^m 6 

161 

172 

244 
1252 
190 

349 

15 

305 

335 

2198 

1441 

266 

304 

2 

1834 

799 

215 

291 
4114 

Hot 
Rocks 

253 
612 
148 
331 

26 

5968 
583 

v/ma 

63 

12 

Intrusive 

Date 
Start 
10/30 
10/30 
11/7 

10/30 

Date 
Comp 
10/30 
10/31 
11/8 

10/30 

fartdfMf 
10/30 

11/1 

10/24 

11/14 

10/23 
10/24 

10/30 

11/1 

10/24 

11/14 

10/26 
10/24 

T 
M 

1 
3 
1 
1 

An/ 
Dug 
292 
294 
461 
85 

mmiw 
1 

1 

3 

1 

2 
3 

121 

522 

214 

125 

1403 
670 

QC 

11/13 
11/6 
11/9 
11/6 

QA 

11/17 
11/7 

11/17 
11/17 

11/6 

11/15 

10/26 

11/15 

10/30 
10/26 

IJjjv! 
11/7 

11/17 

11/7 

11/17 

11/17 
11/17 

mMMax:mm-§j:S;3E 
10/11 

10/24 

11/8 

10/24 
11/14 
11/14 

10/26 

10/11 

10/24 

11/8 

10/24 
11/14 
11/14 

10/26 

53 

156 

HUES 

1425 

2 

3 
3364 

10/12 

10/23 

11/9 

10/16 

10/30 

10/24 

10/26 

i l l t i l 
10/16 

10/16 

10/23 

11/13 

11/9 
10/30 

10/12 

10/23 

11/9 

11/15 

11/15 

10/24 

10/26 

f?4* | 
10/16 

10/16 

11/15 

11/13 

11/9 
10/30 

1 

1 

2 

2 
2 
2 

3 

H 
1 

1 

2 

2 

1 

1 

3 
pa 

1 

1 

3 

2 

2 

2 

6 

161 

235 

244 
1252 
202 

349 

mip.#-' 

15 

305 

358 

2198 

1285 

266 

304 

WPK 
2 

409 

799 

217 

288 
750 

10/18 

10/25 

11/13 

11/13 
11/14 
11/15 

11/14 

; * * 

10/18 

10/25 

11/14 

11/16 

11/15 

10/26 

11/14 
£^';;,„'-.••'; ; ' < ; ; * • 

10/18 

10/18 

11/15 

11/15 

11/13 
11/13 

§§» 
11/6 

11/6 

11/17 

11/17 
11/17 

11/17 

m 
1 

H i 

1/6 

11/6 

11/17 

11/17 

11/17 

11/17 

11/17 

1 

MEC 

2 ea.,2.36" Rkt 

?:umwm;mjm 

3 ea. 2.36' Rkt 
2.36"Rkt, M9 Rifle 

Grenade, 

MD 

2.36" Rkt. Mtr 
6 ea.,2.36" Rkt Mtr 
4 ea.,2.36" Rkt Mtr 
2 ea.,2.36" Rkt Mtr 

flMH9iiiiP^tTilHiHHS 
2 ea.,2.36" Rkt Mtr 

2.36" debris, grenade 
fuze 

3 ea 2.36" Rtk Mtrs 
3 ea. 2.36" Rkt. Mtr, 2.36 

Rkt debris 
4 ea. 2.36" Rkt. Mtr 
2 ea. 2.36" Rkt Mtr, 

&&w**3#im mmmm-smmmm. 

M9 Rifle qrenade 

IHMtiiHIfe.fe'^ 

2 ea. 2.36" Rtk, 7 ea. 
M9 Rifle qrenade 

7 ea. 2.36" Rkt, 1 ea 
M9 rifle grenade 

1 ea. 2.36" Rkt, 1 ea 
M9 rifle grenade 

6 ea. Grenade Fuze 
3 ea 2.36" Rtk Mtrs, 2 ea 

qrenade fuzes 
7 ea 2.36" Rtk Mtrs, 2 

ea. 2.36" Whds, 1 2.36" 
Practice round 

3 ea 2.36" Rtk Mtrs 
10 ea. 2.36" Rkt Mtrs 
3 ea, 2.36" Rkt Mtr 

4 ea 2.36" Rtk Mtrs, 
qrenade fuze body 

Comments 

2.36 

1 
6 
4 

+ 2 

3 

5 

3 
2 

m 
3 

10 

3 
10 
3 

4 

M9 

mm 

1 

»::.;•; 

Misc 

«ms 

1 

w 
6 
2 

1 

3 

1 

^mmm^mm-- ' • nun mm trm 
Grenade Fuzes -12 ea.; 

M8 Landmine 
(expended); 2.36" Whd 

Practice. 

2.36" Rkt Mtr, 2.36" cone 

13 ea. 2.36" Rkt Mtr, 2 
ea. 2.36" Rkt Whd, 

10 ea. 2.36" Rkts, 12 ea. 
M9 Rifle grenades and 2 

ea Hand Grenades 

10 ea. 2.36" Rkt, 1 ea. 
2.36" Rkt Mtr 

3 ea 2.36" Rtk Mtrs, 3 ea 
qrenade fuzez 

1 ea 2.36" Rkt mtr 

1 

3 

15 

10 

10 

3 

1 

12 

1 

11 

10 

3 

E U R ? f f : # r I I S S > r i f E f 1 ••K?«HKW l i t i 
1/6 

11/6 

11/16 

11/16 

11/16 

1 ea. M9 rifle grenade, 1 
ea. 2.36" Rkt 

2 ea. 2.36" Rkt Mtr, 1 ea. 
Grenade Fuze, 

4 ea 2.36" Rtk Mtrs 

4 ea. 2.36" Rkt 

6 ea 2.36" Rtk Mtrs 
4 ea 2.36" Rtk Mtrs 

2 

4 

4 

6 
4 

1 

MD Weight 

2 
12 
8 
4 

mrnrn- -.. 4 

5.5 

6 

11 

6 
4 

• m m ? 
9 

9 

21.5 

10.5 
20 
6 

9.5 

i d H M * 

18.5 

6 

30 

47 

21 

10.5 

2 
0 
0 

5.5 

8 

8 

12 
8 

Failed initial QC. Redone on 11/9 

Failed QC will be re-done. Re-done completed 
on 11/14 

QA Failure 2.36" Rkt Mtr 

Failed QA will be re-done. Re-done 11/15 

Failed QC will be re-done. Re-done 11/15 



45-F33 

45-F34 
MBSMmlWffliili 

45-G27 
45-G28 
45-G29 

45-G30 

45-G31 

45-G32 

45-G33 

rfppf-f 
45-H27 
45-H28 
45-H29 
45-H30 

45-H31 

45-H32 
45-H33 

HKB'41 
45-129 

45-130 

45-131 
45-132 
45-133 

9/27 

9/27 

• H P 
9/25 
9/25 
9/25 

9/27 

9/26 

9/26 

9/27 

ii§.# 
9/25 
9/25 
9/25 
9/30 

9/27 

11/2 
11/2 

* # 
27-Sep 

27-Sep 

2-Nov 
11/2 
11/2 

2 

2 

ut 2 
2 
2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

n 2 
2 
2 
2 

2 

3 
2 

10/10 

10/16 

m i 
10/4 
10/5 

10/18 

11/2 

10/23 

10/23 

10/23 

# : * 
10/3 
10/3 
11/6 

10/24 

10/23 

11/2 
11/2 

3 

1 

n 1 
1 
1 

2 

3 

3 

3 

V$ 
1 
1 
3 
3 

3 

3 
2 

S I M 
2 

2 

3 
3 
2 

10/27 

24-Oct 

2-Nov 
11/2 
11/2 

WBmnammmm 45-D-33 
45-D-33 

45-D-33 

45-D-33 
45-D-33 

45-D-33 

1/30 

2/2 

1 

3 

3 
3 
2 

713 

0 

wmm 
145 
367 
112 

159 

370 

218 

239 

K W 
267 
226 
152 
763 

308 

373 
52 

nam 9 

49 

25 
195 
0 

1 

1 

286 

91 

10/19 

10/16 

10/19 

10/16 

: a Si^BBHB 
102 
285 

5 

28 

0 

• H 240 
144 

32 
21 

met?. 
9 

6 
16 

10/17 
10/17 
10/18 

11/8 

11/13 

11/7 

11/7 

i- rtV:K; 

10/17 
10/17 
11/6 

10/24 

10/23 

11/6 
11/6 

$'€»U 
10/17 

10/24 

11/6 
11/6 

10/17 
10/17 
10/18 

11/8 

11/13 

11/7 

11/7 

10/17 
10/17 
11/6 

11/15 

11/8 

11/6 
11/6 

PPM 
10/17 

10/24 

11/6 
11/6 
11/2 

3 713 

1 

1 
1 
1 

3 

2 

3 

2 

1 
3 
2 

2 

2 

yiL • 
1 

3 

2 
2 
2 

43 
82 
112 

164 

370 

190 

239 

11/13 

10/18 

11/16 

11/16 

3 ea. 2.36" Rkt, 1 ea. 
2.36" Rkt Mtr 

mm mm mmmm mm 10/18 
10/19 
10/23 

11/9 

11/13 

11/13 

11/15 

27 
82 
152 
763 

308 

405 
73 

mm 
0 

49 

32 
211 

10/18 
10/19 
11/8 

11/15 

11/13 

11/8 
11/8 

••If* 
10/19 

10/25 

11/8 
11/3 
11/8 

11/6 
11/6 
11/6 

11/16 

11/16 

11/17 

11/17 

1 ea. 2.36" Rtk 

mm&wmmammm 
11/6 
11/6 
11/8 

11/16 

11/16 

11/8 
11/8 

M9 Rifle Grenade w/ Un-
Armed Fuze 

4 ea 2.36 Rkt Mtrs, 
Grenade fuzes / 

components. 

3 ea. 2.36" Rkt Mtr, MT 
5 ea. 2.36" Rkt Mtr, MT 

4 ea. Rifle grenade 
Practice 

2.36" Whd, MT 
2.36" Whd, 2 ea M9 

Boom 
2.36" Rkt Mtr, grenade 

Fuze 

4 

K i m s 
3 
5 

1 

1 

1 

':§mmmmm.0stmm 
3 ea. 2.36" Rkt Mtr, 

5 ea. 2.36" Rkt Mtr, MT 

2 ea. 2.36" Rkt Mtr 

2.36" Rkt Mtr 

3 

5 

2 

1 

4 

2 

fc« 

yawmmmmm mi i iaaKaHHnatira 11/6 

11/6 

11/8 
11/3 
11/8 

M9 Rifle Grenade, Un-
Armed 

2 ea. 2.36" Rkt Mtr, MT 

2.36" Rkt Mtr 

2 

1 

5 

13111 

1 

•-#d 

M!»i 

I I I M • ^mw&mimcfFi&M::,. .• •».*,.,.;... 61 

0 

1/30 

1/31 

2/2 

2/5 2/5 

1 

1 

1 

1 

225 

440 

127 

91 2/5 2/5 

(3) qrenade fuzes 
(3) 2.36" rocket motors; 
2.36" rocket nose cone 

MD pieces 

2.36" rocket motor nozzle 

155 I 20 

| |S3NMII 

3 

45 

3 

1 

12 

1 

15.5 

0 
0 
0 
6 
10 

4 

2 

4 

3.5 

0 
0 
6 
0 
10 

4 

2 
0 
0 
0 

4 

0 
2 

397.5 

0.75 

7 

4 

1 

Failed QA will be re-done. Re-done 11/15 

Disposed of in Grid 45-C31 



GRID 

30-R7 

BRUSH 

Date 

9/6 

TM 

2 

Mag/Flag 

Date 

9/3 

TM 

2 

Anomalies 
Marked 

0 

Flags 
Pulled 

Date 
Start 
9/13 

Date 
Comp 
9/13 

TM 

2 

ii,,,.-i .:*:..! n i l $Mf^mm:amMMma.Mz:::m 30-S7 
30-se 
30-S9 

30-S10 

30-T6 
30-T7 

30-T8 
30-T9 
30-T10 
30-T11 
lHK.*:-!^ 
30-U6 
30-U7 
30-U8 
30-U9 
30-U10 
30-U11 

9/6 
9/6 

8/29 

8/29 

2 
2 
2 

2 

"W".-: l̂ ./'r̂  
9/6 
9/6 

9/6 
8/29 
8/29 
8/28 

fr*#? 
9/7 
9/6 
9/5 

8/30 
8/29 
8/30 

2 
2 

2 
2 
2 

_2_ 

9/13 
9/11 
9/11 

9/12 

9/12 
9/14 

9/12 
9/13 
9/18 
8/30 

Burnt 
2 
2 
2 
2 

9/12 
9/20 
9/12 
9/21 
8/31 
8/30 

2 
2 
2 

2 

1 
2 

2 
2 
2 
3 

46 
136 
140 

18 

wmmm 
2 

37 

933 
794 
476 
565 

9/18 
9/18 
9/18 

9/18 

M mm 

794 
689 
324 

l l M i t n t H t 1 
2 
2 
3 
3 
3 

7 
197 
204 
1009 
806 
200 

69 
746 
733 

9/18 
9/18 

9/18 
9/25 
9/27 
9/5 

9/27 
9/21 
9/18 
9/26 
10/10 

9/7 

zamwrnwam k mvammimmnwm 30-V6 

30-V7 

30-V8 

30-V9 

30-V10 

30-W5 
30-W6 

30-W7 

30-W8 

30-W9 
30-W10 

9/7 

9/6 

9/5 

8/30 

8/29 

9/7 
9/7 

9/5 

9/5 

8/31 
8/29 

1 

2 

2 

2 

i f l 

• I 
1 

2 

2 

2 

2 

9/12 

9/14 

10/3 

9/14 

9/11 

9/11 
9/11 

9/20 

9/20 

9/13 
8/29 

1 

1 

3 

3 

•• 
• 1 

1 

1 

3 

3 

30 

570 

65 

1308 

453 

9 
56 

157 

245 

362 
167 

I « ! = i E i a i « l l « S ' 3 M t ^ l I l i 
30-X5 
30-X6 

30-X7 
30-X8 

30-X9 
30-X10 

9/7 
9/7 

9/7 
8/31 

8/31 
8/29 

• f & N t a 
30-Y5 
30-Y6 
30-Y7 
30-Y8 
30-Y9 
u ; - • 
30-Z6 
30-Z7 
30-Z8 
30-Z9 

9/7 
9/7 

9/28 
10/11 
8/31 

9/7 
9/7 
9/7 

8/31 

2 
2 

2 
2 

2 

i J 
§ # 

2 
2 
3 

J* 

9/11 
9/12 

9/20 
10/2 

9/12 
9/8 

9/11 
9/14 
9/28 
10/11 
9/12 

M M 2 
2 
2 
2 

9/12 
9/13 
10/2 
9/11 

1 
1 

1 
3 

3 
1 

21 
63 

89 
158 

506 
28 

20 

489 

1166 

383 

rfWH 

107 

9/28 

9/19 

10/3 

10/4 

10/4 

rat 
9/18 9/18 

9/20 

9/21 

10/3 
9/8 

. . . J I 5 / T , ';;;;••. ' ,•;• ," 

342 

9/18 
9/18 

9/20 
10/4 

10/2 
9/8 

9/18 
9/19 
9/18 

9/18 

wmm 9/18 
9/18 

9/18 
9/25 
9/27 

llllBMHHffll 
9/27 
9/21 
9/18 
9/26 
10/10 
9/7 

2 
2 
2 

3 

4* 2 
2 

2 
3 
3 
3 

m 3 
1 
3 
3 
1 
3 

9/28 

9/19 

10/3 

10/4 

10/4 

9/18 
9/18 

9/20 

9/21 

10/3 
9/8 

9/18 
9/18 

9/20 
10/4 

10/2 
9/8 

3 

3 

3 

3 

• 
•F 

1 

1 

1 

3 

1 

1 
1 

1 
3 

3 
1 

L:>\zMi'iJMimsmmt:Miism'mmt-^ 1 
1 
3 
3 
3 

44 1 
1 
1 
1 

26 
13 
39 
104 
177 

E:?3flKl 
0 
12 
86 

314 

9/18 
9/18 
9/27 
10/11 
9/20 

t m i e * « 9/18 
9/18 
10/4 
9/20 

9/18 
9/18 
9/27 
10/11 
9/20 

9/18 
9/18 
10/4 
9/20 

1 

3 

1 
3 
3 

Intrusive 

An/Dug 

0 

'^iiii-^i ?»IP 
46 
136 
140 

18 

2 
37 

139 
105 
152 
565 

*»llHfPM 
11 

197 
135 
263 
73 

200 

10 

81 

65 

142 

70 

9 
56 

157 

245 

255 
167 

21 
63 

197 
158 

164 
28 

| | r \ •"• ,:•! 

26 
13 
39 
104 
177 

0 
18 
86 

314 

MEC MD 

9 E ! ^ ^ • & • • • • 

BMHSE *•*"**• 

M9 Rifle 
Grenade 

m'WmSfw 

mzaam 
bUmrrTMortar 

Fin 

MD 
Weiqht 

QC 

10/3 

mr- ~i 
9/21 
9/21 
9/21 

10/3 

• H I :u.W 
9/21 

1 

9/21 

10/3 

10/3 
10/10 
9/7 

10/10 
10/3 
9/21 
10/10 
10/12 

9/7 

QA 

10/4 

9/25 
9/25 
9/25 

10/4 

WW 
9/25 
9/25 

10/4 

10/4 
10/11 
9/7 
H .-. 

10/11 
10/4 
10/5 

10/11 
10/31 

9/7 

10/10 

10/11 

11/1 

10/11 

10/12 

10/11 

10/11 

11/2 

10/31 

10/31 

Comments 

mm&torstmwmm*-*^!!* * 

Failed Initial QC, Re- Mag/Flag and dug on 9/27 
with additional 8 anomalies marked and dug 

•dH^fr.v^iHiiB*, -.mam. 
Flags pulled at request of homeowner. Failed 
initial QC. 
Flaqs pulled at request of homeowner 
Flaqs pulled at request of homeowner 

m;>r,Miit>swmmmisKmmMii^. + 

Flaqs pulled at request of homeowner 
Flaqs pulled at request of homeowner 

Flaqs pulled at request of homeowner 

Flags pulled at request of homeowner. 

South West 75% not Mag/Dug at owners 
request, NE of road Complete 
Flags in NW 80% pulled at request of 
homeowner 
Flags in SW coiner pulled at request of 
homeowner 

9/20 9/21 

2.36" Rkt Mtr 
empty 

60mm Mortar 
Fin 

1 

1 

9/20 

11/1 

9/21 

10/12 
10/10 

9/21 

11/2 

9/25 

10/31 
10/11 

MS^MESiE2.j;mm:'Mmcsi^s 

Partial 2.36" 
Rkt.Whd. 

i^ni^^HI •Pf. i - ' .# 

HHK»-''!HMlil 

•pm 

9/20 
9/20 

11/1 
11/1 

10/4 

10/10 

9/20 
9/19 
11/1 
11/1 
10/3 

9/19 
9/19 
10/12 
9/21 

9/21 
9/20 

11/2 
11/2 

10/5 
10/11 

9/21 
9/20 
11/2 
11/2 
10/4 

':WBM 
9/20 
9/20 
10/31 
9/25 

North side of Grid outside of property boundaries 
complete 

MD located at15mN/15mE 

Flags pulled at request of homeowner. 

WSflP I^MIHSIi^HS^^* * l l l H l i l H I 

Central area of grid not investigated due to no 
ROE 

Flags pulled at request of homeowner. 
Remenant HE in base. 196mN/15mE 

Maq and Diq same day 

Ks-^Mffliliift-i * r *« i i i * i f c i 

ms^mmm sr :^mmm f ^ ^ 

Grid M/F twice due to pit bulls 



Area 4 C1 

Unit 1-1 

Unit 1-2 

Unit 1-3 

Unit 1-4 

Unit 1-5 

Unit 1-6 

Unit 1-7 

Unit 1-8 

Unit 1-9 

Unit 1-10 

Unit 2-3 Little Mt 
Rd 

Unit 2-8 Little Mt 
Rd 

Unit 2-7 Little Mt 
Rd 

Unit 2-4 Range Rd 

Unit 2-5 Ranpe Rd 

Unit 2-2 Little Mt 
Road 

Unit 2-6 Little 
Mt/Jenninqs Way 

BRUSH 
Data Start 

22-Mav-0E 

22-May-OJ 

22-May-Of 

21-Auq-08 

Date Comp 

22-May-OS 

22-May-Oc 

22-May-0£ 

21-Aup-08 

TM 

1 

1 

1 

! 

Date 

9-Jun-08 

10-Jun-08 

4-Jun-0a 

S-Jun-08 

g.Jun-08 

10-Jun-08 

11-Jun-08 

14-Mav-08 

15-Mav-08 

4-Jun-08 

S-Jun-08 

12-May-08 

13-Mav-08 

U-May-08 

5-May-08 

6-Mav-08 

8-May-08 

12-Mav-08 

5-Mav-08 

6-Mav-08 

S-Mav-08 

11-Jun-08 
12-Jun-08 

16-Jun-08 

11-Jun-08 

12-Jun-08 
16-Jun-08 

17-Jun-08 

13-May-08 

14-Mav-08 

15-Mav-08 

22-Mav-08 

29-Mav-08 

30-May-08 

1-Mav-08 

7-May-08 

18-Auq-08 

19-Aug-08 

20-Aua-OS 

21-Auq-08 

25-Auq-08 

26-Aup-08 

20-AUQ-OS 

21-Aug-08 

25-Auq-08 

26-Auq 
28-Auq-09 

28-Aug-08 

2-Sep-08 

2-Sep-08 
3-Sep-08 

3-Sep-08 

4-Sep-08 

5-Sep-08 
8-Sep-08 

15-Sep-08 

TM 

1 

1 

1 8,2 

1 &2 

2 

2 

2 

1&2 

1 &2 

1 &2 

1 

1 &2 

1 &2 

2 

1&2 

1 

1 

1 

1 

1 &2 

2 

1 
1 

1 

2 

2 
2 

1 &2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

1 &2 

1 &2 

1 &2 

1 8.2 

1 8.2 

2 

2 

2 

1&2 

1 

1 

1 &2 
1 &2 

1 &2 

1 

2 
1&2 

1&2 

1 &2 

1 &2 
1 &2 

1 8.2 

MAG/ FLAG 
An Dug 

518 

631 

220 

825 

620 

520 

136 

860 

1423 

870 

380 

908 

1134 

280 

676 

520 

488 

55 

120 

438 

575 

209 
397 

416 

199 

230 
680 

340 

20 

25 

25 

235 

11 

195 

189 

1177 

1279 

1312 

620 

1150 

720 

230 
5311 

675 

720 

750 
2145 

950 

1070 
2020 

715 

680 
705 
1385 

330 

1405 
1735 

1280 
212 

335 
1827 

Data Comp 

9-Jun-08 

10-Jun-08 

4-Jun-08 

5-Jun-08 

9-Jun-08 

10-Jun-08 

11~Jun-08 

14-Mav-08 

15-Mav-08 

4-Jun-08 

5-Jun-08 

12-May-08 

13-Mav-08 

14-Mav-08 

5-May-08 

6-May-08 

8-May-08 

12-Mav-08 

5-Mav-08 

6-Mav-08 

8-Mav-08 

11-Jun-08 
12-Jun-08 

16-Jun-08 

11-Jun-08 

12-Jun-08 
16-Jun-08 

17-Jun-08 

13-May-08 

14-Mav-08 

15-May-08 

22-May-08 

29-Mav-08 

30-May-08 

1-Mav-08 

7-Mav-08 

18-Auq-08 

18-Aup-08 

18-AUO-08 

21-Auq 

25-Auq-OB 

26-Auo-Oa 

18-Auq-08 

21-Auq-08 

25-Aug-08 

26-Auq-08 
28-Auq-08 

28-Auq-08 

2-Sep-08 

2-Sep-08 
3-Sep-08 

3-Sep-08 

4-Seo-08 

5-Sep-08 
8-Sep-08 

15-Sep-08 

TM 

1 

1 

1 & 2 

1&2 

2 

2 

2 

1 &2 

1 &2 

1S.2 

1 

1 &2 

1 &2 

2 

1 8.2 

1 

1 

1 

1 

1 8.2 

2 

1 
1 

1 

2 

2 
2 

1&2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

1&2 

1&2 

1&2 

1&2 

1&2 

2 

2 

2 

1 8.2 

1 

1 

1 &2 
1 &2 

1 8.2 

1 

2 
1&2 

1 &2 

1 8.2 

1 &2 
18.2 

1&2 

QC 

11-Jun-0f 

11-Jun-08 

5-Jun-08 

14-Mav-08 

12-Mav-08 

8-May-08 

17-Jun-08 

17-Jun-08 

30-May-08 

7-Mav-OB 

QA 

11-Jun-0i 

11-Jun-08 

5-Jun-08 

14-Mav-08 

12-Uav-08 

8-Mav-08 

17-Jun-08 

17-Jun-08 

30-Mav-08 

7-Mav-08 

MEC/UXC MD 

Fragmentation, 105mm(155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation, 105mm/155mm HE projectile and 

Fragmentation, 1D5mm/155mm HE projectile and 
1 ea M47, M48, M51 series fuze parts and 1 ea 

Fragmentation, 105mm/155mm HE proJBCtlle 

Fragmentation, 105n.ni/155mitl HE projectile 

Fragmentation, 105mml 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation, 105mrr.l155mm HE projectile and 
1 ea M47, M4S, M51 series fuze parts and 1 ea 

Fragmentation, 1G5mmi155mm HE piojeclile and 

Fragmentation, 105mmi155mm HE projectile and 
1 ea 57mm APT 

Fragmentation, 105mm/155mm HE projectile and 

Fragmentation, 105mm/155mm HE projectile and 
1 ea 37mm (Empty) and 1 ea 57mm APT 

Fragmentation, 105mm/155mm HE projectile and 
4 ea 37mm (Empty) and 1 ea 57mm APT 

Fragmentation, 105m mf155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation. 105mmH55mm HE projectile and 
4 ea 37mm (Empty] and 5 ea 57mm APT 

1 ea 57mm APT 

Fragmentation, 105mm/155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation, 105mm/155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation. 105mm,155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation. 105mrW155mm HE projectile and 
2 ea 37mm (Empty] and 3 ea 57mm APT 

Fragmentation, 105mm(155mrn HE projectile and 
1 ea 37mm (Empty] and 5 ea 57mm APT 

Fragmentation, 105mmi155mm HE projectile and 
2 ea 57mm APT 

4 ea 57mm APTs 

Fragmentation, 105mmr155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation, 105mm/155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation, 105mm(155mm HE projectile, 1 
ea 37mm empty, 1 ea 57mm APT. and M4B.M47, 

nothing found 

ea 37mm empty, 1 ea 57mm TPT 

No MD found 

1 ea 37mm (TPT) 

1ea 37mm (TPT] 

Fragmentation, 105mm/155mm HE projectile and 
2 ea 57mm (TPT) 

Fragmentation 1D5mm/155n™ HE rojecllle 

Fragmentation, 105mmr155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation, 105mmr155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation, 105mmj155rnm HE projectile and 
1 ea37mm (empty), and M47. M48, M51 series 

Fragmentation, 105mm S 165mm HE projectile 
and M4B series fuze parts (21, PTTF Paris 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile, 1 
ea 57mm APT 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile, 
57mm Projectile (Empty]M51 Fuze parts 

Lp"s;~l1:„;"r=••, 

Fragmentation, 10.5mm & 155mm HE projectile. 2 
ea 57mm APT, M48 Fuse parts 

EA 37mm Projectile (Empty) 

Fragmentation 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation. 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

No MD Scrap 

Grenade Fuze Prac, Expended 

None 

Tail Bomb, Rrf Grenade (3) 
Mo MD Today 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile, 1 
EA 37mm Projectile [Empty) 1 EA 57 MM 
Projectile (Empty) M48 Fuze Parts 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile, 2 
EA 57 MM Projectile (Empty) 

57 MM TPT, Empty (2) 
^o MD Today 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

DMM COMMENTS 

90 lbs MD 

90 lbs MD 

50 lbs MD 

120 lbs MD 

35 lbs MD 

10lbsMD 

1 IbsMD 

.1 lbs MD 

1 lbs MD 

11 IbsMD 

14 lbs MD 

5 IbsMD 

105n.ni/155mitl
105mrr.l1


Area 4 C2 

RESIDENCE 

Unit 1-1 5 3 3 E n o n R d 

(Graves) 

« H i H i a 
Unit 1-2 535 E n o n R d 

(Blackburn) 

^*^8f9fflsSAiiSsl 

Unit 1-3 521 E n o n R d 

(Troulman) 

WSBSSSSS^^SWi 
Unit 1-4 509 E n o n R d 

(Duke) 

i K s » « a 
Unit 1-5 507EnonRd 
(McCorkle) 

WMBSEB&S> 
Unit 1-6 505 Enon 
Rd (M Duke) 

W S ^ P H i Q g i r 

unit 1-11 

495 Enon Rd <Kinq) 

KflSiffiliSsiffi^^ 
unit 1-10 627B Enon 
Rd (Robbins Jr) 

DtitJWT '̂jfff li'MMl'lf3 

unit 1-9 627 Enon Rd 
(Robbins III) 

^ ^ ^ H S M S I 

Unit 1-13 

4715Mor iah Rd 
Elvin Mangum 

Unit 1-14 

4712 Moriah Rd 

Manqum 

M K ' . v . . - ; : « 
Unit 1-8 

4709 Moriah Rd 

Fogleman 

BRUSH 
Date Start 

!i&ii2!ill 

! ' " ; ' ' - ' ' " " '•'• 

»• •'• •. 

i H 

* S « o 

I 

Date 

•/.'..:!•.» 

s V v : ^ " i v ^ 

I . ': ' " - • ,<• ; -

• - - • / x , - - : - ; : 3c 

' ' ' i . - ' J i ^K 

mmijipfij 

TM 

jtifaafajte 

r-v > " .p 

fc1;; •;..•/-; •:>Jr 

!••'• - ••". V i 

r P M ' - j B 

L^-^ -W^B 

I * O M M muni 

MAG/ FLAG 

Date 

19-Mar-08 

20-Mar-08 

MO&£&&: 

20-Mar-08 

24-Mar-08 

24-Mar-08 

25-Mar-08 

26-Pv1ar-08 

27-Mar-08 

31-Mar-08 
fl^Tf - i * * * . ; . ' ^ 

26-Mar-08 

27-Mar-08 

31-Mar-08 

2-Apr-08 

31-Mar-08 

1-Apr-08 

2-Apr-08 

3-Apr-08 

7-Apr-08 

8-Apr-08 

MB&WtA 

1-Apr-08 

2-Apr-08 

3-Apr-08 

7-Apr-08 

8-Apr-08 
! v i i £ - - ; - , ' ;'?:--; 

8-Apr-08 

9-Apr-08 

10-Apr-08 

14-Apr-08 

15-Apr-08 

K » f e i 
9-Apr-08 

10-Apr-08 

14-Apr-08 

9-Apr-08 

15-Apr-08 

16-Apr-08 

15-Apr-D8 

16-Apr-08 

15-Apr-08 

16-Apr-08 

17-Apr-08 

30-Apr-Q8 

1-Mav-08 

PPPHIIM 
16-Apr-08 

17-Apr-08 

28-Apr-08 

29-Apr-08 

TM 

1&2 

1&2 

1&2 

1 

2 

1&2 

2 

2 

2 

t i i i g H H 

1 

1 

1 

1 

2 

1 

2 

1 

1 

1&2 

w&m 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

1 

1 

1 

1 

1 

L^atJiMAite 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

!S21^KB 

1 

1 

2 

1 

1 

1 

• U S i 
2 

2 

2 

2 

A n Dug 

1414 

532 

lBi33i!fl!ii£lf! 

520 

523 

680 

1111 

730 

850 

130 

476 

560 

469 

508 

f•"..-•> .,:.'.:vf? 

439 

512 

230 

426 

536 

1067 

540 

240 

170 

270 

180 
.- j icn.- ' i - . .^ 

106 

541 

609 

548 

308 

325 

560 

340 
:?t~'•';,. *.,', 

100 

175 

470 

236 

288 

SiBaiBllfei 

340 

310 

318 

508 

408 

M m 
90 

680 

430 

415 

Date Comp 

19-Mar-08 

20-Mar-08 

24-Mar-08 

24-Mar-08 
^ .«£" l jE teB i 

24-Mar-08 

25-Mar-08 

26-Mar-08 

27-Mar-08 

31-Mar-08 

26-Mar-08 

27-Mar-08 

31-Mar-08 

2-Apr-08 

31-Mar-08 

1-Apr-08 

2-Apr-08 

3-Apr-08 

7-Apr-08 

I^Vpr-OE 

1-Apr-08 

2-Apr-08 

3-Apr-08 

7-Apr-08 

8-Apr-08 
d r.i rS.s= i.>^? !.V-i 

8-Apr-08 

9-Apr-08 

10-Apr-08 

14-Apr-08 

15-Apr-08 

9-Apr-08 

1Q-Apr-08 

340 

9-Apr-08 

15-Apr-08 

16-Apr-08 

15-Apr-08 

16-Apr-08 

15-Apr-08 

16-Apr-08 

17-Apr-08 

30-Apr-08 

1-Mav-08 
A'i*\:'.'£'j^ 

16-Apr-08 

17-Apr-08 

28-Apr-08 

29-Apr-08 

TM 

1&2 

1&2 

wmm 

1 

1 

H4itt~d:-'iW 

2 

1&2 

2 

2 

2 

m&ZK 

1 

1 

1 

1 

2 

1 

2 

1 

1 

1&2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 
t * - : i ; - V . --_-

1 

1 

1 

1 

1 
=- ; ' " - i --v ' . : - 'S 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

1 

1 

2 

1 

1 

1 

1 

2 

2 

2 

2 

QC 

20-Mar-08 

SKSTOSEISK 

24-Mar-08 

T^pl'^it^A' 

31-Mar-08 

& K & & K 

3-Apr-08 
t >•;• :- ;--• - - : : 

8-Apr-OE 

8-Apr-08 

15-Apr-08 

t i , - '•• • " - u . - ; - : i ' s i ; 

14-Apr-D8 

16-Apr-OS 

CStS^sBH 

16-Apr-08 

1-Mav-08 
*:••;?:• '.--"--""> . : - ! 

29-Apr-08 

QA 

20-Mar-08 

sffiSWSO* 

24-Mar-08 

' "af l l l i l lB 

31-Mar-08 

3-Apr-08 
, ^ r r ^ f a ^ p 

8-Apr-OE 

8-Apr-08 

15-Apr-08 

14-Apr-08 

16-Apr-08 
"jj ?'.-..-='.?- l (X--i:l 

16-Apr-08 

1-Mav-08 

K i i M 

29-Apr-08 

MEC/UXO 

£»,*•* W 8 B 

• l i i i i l i i ^ 

155mm HE 

projectile M K 1 

w/M48 fuze 

miiii^p™-* 

P 5 ' t jV ipSEi is 

MD 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

Fuze adptr for 8 1 m m mortar/M48 series fuzes (1) 

f - - t ; - - - . / ; ; , . : \ , s - - ^ . ! - : : ^--. - ••. A.i)'--\-Mi. 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

} = . - - • ' , : - % : « - - " • • • > • ; - - * -•>-:-••:-•.*•-•-:-<'.-?:-. 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 8 

M48 fuze parts (1) 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 8 

M48 fuze parts (1) 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile & 

M48 fuze parts (3) 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 8 

8 1 m m Tail Fin a s s y ( 1 ) 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectiles 

I l i l i i r t iWM^'-ifMiiMii 
Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile S 

1 each empty 3 7 m m projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile & 

M48 fuze parts (1) 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile & 

M48 fuze parts (4) 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile & 

M48 fuze parts (4) 

SEE C o m m e n t s Fragmentat ion, 

105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 8 M48 fuze parts 

(2) 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm S 155mm HE projectile & 

M48 fuze parts (2) 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm S 155mm HE projectile 4 

M4B fuze parts (2) 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile A 

M48 fuze parts (2) 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

Mortar Fin (1) 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

M 4 7 , 4 8 , 8 51 series fuze parts (1) 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

Expended 105 smoke cannisler (1) 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

Expended 105 smoke cann later (1) and M48 

series fuze parts 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

f **• :-."•-'y-t'.i-^-.-.i^s^^f^ 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion. 105mm S 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

and empty 3 7 m m practice rd (1) 

WR-.;;*.^ Ltfkiuwqm 
Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

and M48 series fuze parts (1) 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm S 155mm HE projectile 

» * * , W ^ j A » i > 3 i * 3 » # ^ f f l 
Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

and M 4 6 series fuze parts (1) 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 

and M48 series fuze parts (1) 

Fragmentat ion, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

and M48 series fuze parts (3) 

DMM 

fe^K!-:;-^ ,v* 

• a n m 

HffiMJfctft^" W S SE 

ws'fr.tis 

COMMENTS 

Mtfttfife; .£&?2MM$ •• 

WWWfigj^llHPflli^ft 

Round was 2 inches below 
surface of the ground, at 45 
degree angle pointing 40 
deqrees from north 

^^JsSfflW^^^S^jlilK^ 

W ^ P S f l r ^ l P ^ S - ' ^ I f i f 

I t t l l l B M M i H 

<mmmi&A^'^'ifif¥l¥ 



Area 4 C2 

: :.^i£#m 
Unit 1-15 

4710Mor iahRd 

Manqum 

•VtflbM»afflitftfagM.ii,, 

Unit 1-12 

4751 Moriah Rd 

Garrett 

Unit 1-7 

4763 Moriah Rd 

Manqum 

RESIDENCE 

Unit 2-1 
Berea & 
RanqeRd 
Nancv Manqum 

Unit 2-2 
5057 Clayton 
Rd 

iSji&^^^gfflfe^^ffi 

Unit 2-3 

4696 Clayton Rd 

Unit 2-4 

5095 Clayton Rd 

rIl5§!*K-T^*'"*"-"^!M' -

Unit 2-5 
5135 Moriah Rd 

xmmmam^ 

Unit 2-6 
5056 Clayton Rd 

Mmi^^^m 

Unit 2-7 

4679 Clayton Rd 

iBlliltl 

I t t t t & a 

W«9$a« 

C^wjwr 

M W 

BRUSH 
Date Start 

15-Jul-OS 

28-JUI-08 

i m a s i 

^J&f i iXMi l 

H W M 

23-Jun-08 

Date 
ComD 

15-Jui-oe 

29-JUI-08 

f^a^fmp 

SSlftSi^ 

m K 

23-Jun-08 

TM 

N/A 

*$ fWV 

N/A 

BJ£3|2J^|3 

:,•-+-:": V.;-!'Sf 

pfilllisiBI 

ffiyitafc 

1 

IHKU". 

17-Apr-08 

28-Apr-08 

29-Apr-08 

30-Apr-08 

1-May-08 
! P ? T -;!- -•«;-"• 

21-Apr-08 

22-Apr-08 

23-Apr-08 

24-Apr-08 

2-Jun-08 

3-Jun-OB 
te|,.>:\"v •'.-.-

23-Apr-08 

24-Apr-08 

28^pr^8 

SECO 

x-ms 

1 

1 

1 &2 

1 &2 

2 

;2l3iiI31 

1 &2 

1 &2 

2 

2 

1&2 

1 &2 

1 

1&2 

2 

$mm 
220 

603 

756 

890 

725 

1515 

1400 

690 

95 

1450 

1367 

ISKfv. m 

706 

987 

75 

ID SET OF HOUSES 

MAG/ FLAC 
Date 

7-Jul-08 
10-Jul-0E 

17-Jul-08 
21-Jul-08 
22-Jul-08 
23-Jul-08 

««*«•* 28-Jul-08 

29-JUI-08 

30-Jul-08 
31-jui-oa 
5-Auq-08 

17-Jun-08 

18-Jun-08 

Sift i iS%: 
9-Jul-OS 

10-Jul-08 

14-JUI-08 

15-Jul-OS 
16-Jul-08 
17-Jul-OB 

i ^ K f e s 

28-Jul-08 
29-Jul-08 
30-Jul-08 
31-JUI-08 

fc^vaasi 
18-Jun-08 

19-Jun-08 

24-Jun-08 

25-Jun-08 

TM 

2 
2 

1 
1 &2 
1 &2 

2 

£ ; - ; - - • : • • - • . • .= ; • 

1 

1 

1 
1 
1 

1 

1 &2 

ffifcttl 
1 

1 

i 'f. i.":-J 
1 &2 

1 &2 
1 &2 

2 

WslAKi i 

2 
2 
2 
2 

1 

1 

1 &2 

1 

A n Dug 

920 
320 

712 
1259 
1346 
150 

4707 
z""" ""'I*?"'-

726 

797 

708 
756 
640 

3627 

385 

821 

1206 
' . . ' * <:7*'$: 

481 

647 

1128 

lUfef; 
952 

1028 
1224 
640 

3844 

780 
510 
720 
290 

2300 
iluMto^Mih 

210 

526 

971 

485 
2192 

UPgflfw^ 

17-Apr-08 

28-Apr-08 

29-Apr-08 

30-Apr-D8 

1-Mav-08 
fi>--p--:-_--.r 

21-Apr-08 

22-Apr-08 

23-Apr-08 

24-Apr-08 

2-Jun-08 

3-Jun-08 

23-Apr-08 

24-Apr-08 

28^pr^8 

U n l t 2 ^ ^ 

^:r&&& 

1 

1 

1 &2 

1 &2 

2 

1 &2 

1&2 

2 

2 

1&2 

1 &2 

1 

1 &2 

2 

Date Comp 

7-Jul-08 
10-Ju!-08 

17-Jul-OE 
21-JUI-08 
22-Jul-OB 
23-Jul-08 

- , . . ^ - : : • - - . . 

28-Jul-08 

29-JUI-08 

30-Jul-OS 
31-Jul-0B 
5-Auq-OE 

17-Jun-08 

18-Jun-08 

: M ^ B H l M f f l 

9-Jul-08 

10-Jui-oe 

?4££*6QNI 
14-Jul-08 

15-Jul-08 
16-Jul-OS 
17-Jul-08 

28-Jul-OS 
29-Jul-08 
30-Jul-OS 
31-jui-oe 

immim 
18-Jun-08 

19-Jun-08 

24-Jun-08 

25-Jun-08 

TM 

2 
2 

1 
1 &2 
1 &2 

2 

1 

1 

1 
1 
1 

1 

1 &2 

l l i l l l l l l l 
1 

1 

1 &2 

1&2 
1 &2 

2 

2 
2 
2 
2 

1 

1 

1 &2 

1 

• K S E & S * 

1-May-08 
S K S I P P P 

4-Jun-08 

28-Apr-08 

QC 

23-JUI-08 

5-Auq-OE 

19-Jun-08 

• m m 

10-Jul-OB 

17-Jul-08 

31-Jul-08 

. - . . . ; ; ' - . : :-i.'j 

25-Jun-08 

M f t t W i 

1-May-08 

4-Jun-08 

28-Apr-08 

QA 

23-JUI-08 

5-Aug-OE 

19-Jun-08 

PgPElfTpS-

10-Jul-08 

M t e i 

17-Jui-oe 

JSS-Mi ' l 

31-JUI-08 

s-sjapf ia 

25-Jun-08 

• H M & & 

S l a « l i c £ i J j i . 1 

iff 

MEC/UXO 

^ ^ V ' i . ' - ' ^ l - / 

s-'sv"-.-''-,."--,*--'-1-̂  

ssssagssa 

r.T.;."rs5v7-°"7=?--;-

^ S S R J H ? . A * 

^,^*r$Mgg^ta*&1uk.v'~-*" 

FragmentaHon, 105mm S 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentaaan, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 
and M4B series fuze pails (1) 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 
and M4B series fuze parts (1) 

FragmentaHon, 105mm 8155mm HE projectile 
and M48 series fuze parts (1) 
Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile, 1 
sa 81mm mortarflns, and 1 ea M48 series fuze 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile, 3 
eaeimm mortarflns, and 3 eaM48 series fuze 

Fragmentation, 105mm 4 155mm HE projectile, 6 
ea81mm mortarflns, and 6 eaM48 series fuze 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile, 2 
ea81mm mortarflns, and M48 series fuze parts 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile, 2 
ea 81 mm mortar fins, and 3 ea M4B series fuze 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projecHle, 2 
ea 81 mm mortar fins, and 3 ea M48 series fuze 
parts, and 4 each 37mm TPT/Empty 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile, 1 
eaeimm mortar fins, and 5 eaM48 series fuze 
parts, and 3 each 37mm TPTVEmpty 

wmaauam* 3^&3b&a»<*r«<iPi 
Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 
and 1ea empty 37mm projectile 

SEE Comments Fragmentation, 
105mm & 155mm HE projectile and 1 ea81mm 
fin 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

MD 

No MD found 
No MD found 

No MD found 
No MD found 
No MD found 
No MD found 

^fi^s^s^MSSiWff*** *• ^'!* •'•''''•"***• 
No MD found 

Fragmentation, 105mm 8 155mm HE projecHle 

No MD found 
No MD found 
No MD found 

FragmentaHon, 105mm 4 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation, 105mm 4 155mm HE projectile 
and M48 series fuze parts (1) 

.- v--.:;-i__; ?:-,-:-_-.-! **Si«^4'"""r:>i-^--:.-iV;t>it?~ 

FragmentaHon, 105mm 4 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

««»;.:;.• .• ̂ dftsiSiBSttife 
No MD found 

Fragmentation, 105mm 8 155mm HE projectile 
60mm Tail fin assmy 
No MD found 

No MD found 
No MD found 
No MD found 
No MD found 

smaamtomim******* 
Fragmentation, 105mm 4 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

FragmentaHon, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

$m&^^ 

PESs ;«J - i ! I 

DMM 

w-.v.t'... esHB 

'aUHmm 

• i f - .hJHMMMHMW 

i^amB*#wmm 

Round was 10 inches below 
surface of ground, 
horizontal, pointing 160 
deqrees from north 

COMMENTS 

Big|fji|f!ii!igteiftii#o?g|,gi1-

memberfrom tm 1 used 
tractor/bushhoq 

MMTOHfiflilteBg^B 

IT'''WlTiiWffl[11lwir^^ 

t ^ ^ ^ j j j j ^ ^ R ^ S t f f f ^ f 

i%|]|PT^ 

^ t e m n a i S ^ ^ * 



Area 4 C2 

NMttttfctfHtdS 

Unit 2-8 

4710Moriah 

Rd 

immmmmm 

Unit 2-9 

4669 Uzzle Rd 

^i,,..,.,l,;l;,l >J; 

Unit 2-10 

WJIPS 

23-Jun-08 

24-Jun-08 

7-Jul-OB 

KNHi 

23-Jun-D8 

24-Jun-08 

7-Jul-08 

A W 

1 

1 

1 

i ^ • ; ; . - i , J % J ^ 

18-Jun-08 

23-Jun-08 

25-Jun-08 

26-Jun-08 

7-Jul-OS 

8-Jul-08 

9-Jul-08 

HWul-08 

24-Jul-08 

5-Auq-08 

6-Auq-08 

7-Aug-OB 

8-Auq-08 

11-Auq-08 

12-Auq 

13-Auq-08 

14-Auq-08 

8-Sep-08 

9-Sep-08 

10-Sep-08 

11-Sep-08 

23-Ju!-08 
24-JUI-08 

2 

2 

2 

1&2 

1 

1 &2 

1 &2 
2 

1 &2 

1&2 

18,2 

1 &2 

1&2 

1 &2 

1 &2 

1 &2 

1 &2 

1&2 

1 &2 

18,2 

1 &2 

1 &2 
1 

1110 

940 

355 

577 

60 

1163 

667 
170 

5042 

738 

707 

1225 

999 

1155 

1608 

1643 

1491 

1874 

1790 

1960 

1810 

1830 

18830 

764 
708 
1472 

•~&mm 
18-Jun-08 

23-Jun-08 

25-Jun-08 

26-Jun-08 

7-Jul-OS 

e-Jui-aa 

9-jui-oa 

IO-Jul-08 

*» M ^ w n 

24-Jul-OS 

5-Auq-08 

6-Auq-08 

7-Auq-08 

8-Auq-08 

11-Auq-08 

12-Auq-08 

13-Auq 

14-Auq-08 

8-Sep-08 

9-Sep-08 

10-Sep-08 

11-Ser>08 

23-Jul-OS 
24-JUI-08 

2 

2 

2 

18,2 

1 

1 &2 

1 &2 

2 

1 &2 

1 &2 

1 &2 

1 &2 

1 &2 

1 8.2 

1 8.2 

1 &2 

1 &2 

1&2 

1 &2 

1&2 

1 &2 

1 &2 
1 

10-Jul-OE 

24-JUI-08 

S^^fe^^? 

10-Jul-OE 

24-Jul-08 

AfliSMaWMWBPIfWMi^^MB 
Fragmentation. 105mm & 155mm HE prcjecdie 
and M48 series fuze parts (1) 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 
and 1 M9 Rifle Greti tan boom 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 
and M48 series fuze parts (1) 

No MD found 

1Ea 105MM 
M1 Projo w 
M48 

1 Ea 37 MM 
M62 Black 
Powder 
W/Fuze Prac 
M58 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 
and M48 series fuze parts (7) and 1 each 37mm 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 
and M48 series fuze parts (4) 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 
and M48 series fuze parts (3) 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 
and M48 series fuze parts (2) 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 
and M48 series fuze parts (4), 1ea37mm Empty 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 
and M48 series fuze parts (4), M58 Fuze Empty, 
PTTF Parts 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 
and M48 series fuze parts (10), M46 parts, PTTF 
Parts 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 
and M48 series fuze parts (8), 155mm shrapnal 
Round Empty, PTTF Parts 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 
and M48 series fuze parts (13) 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 
and M48 series fuze parts 

fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 
and M48 series fuze parts (13), PTTF M1907 (2), 
M58 Prac fuze 

"ragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projecBle 
and M48 series fuze parts (11) 

Fragmentation, 105mm & 155mm HE projectile 
and M48 series fuze parts (45) 

No MD found 
No MD found 

U S f ^ H M 0^^^^;^MMTT'-

?^m-mmm mmm*u*im*d&* 

13" deep and Hoz, 45degree 
NE 

305 lbs MD 

275 lbs MD 

380 lbs MD 

265 lbs MD 

170 lbs MD 

37MM Found 6 " deep, HOZ 
at 360 degrees Also 231 lbs 
MD 

310 lbs MD 

300 lbs MD 



Area 4B 

IRESIDENCE 

1 
Dpen Area 

Open Area 

Open Area 

Open Area 

Open Area 

Open Area 
Expansion 

4B-1 Vezey 

BRUSH 
Date 
Start 

r ...*rs«**rtfe 
4B-2&3 
Woods & 
Carpenter 

TM 
MAG/ FLAG 

Date 

11/28/07 

11/29/07 

12/03/07 

12/04/07 

12/05/07 

12/12/07 
12/13/07 

12/17/07 

12/18/07 

12/03/07 
12/04/07 
12/06/07 

TM 

1&2 

1&2 

1&2 

1&2 

1&2 

1 &2 
1 &2 

1 &2 

1 &2 

1 
1 
1 

12/05/07 
12/06/07 
12/10/07 

12/11/07 
12/12/07 

18.2 
1&2 
1&2 

1&2 
1&2 

Date 
Comp 

An Dug 

793 

1086 

910 

731 

654 
4174 

690 
1110 

810 

522 

3132 

381 
84 

465 

QC 

mm 

QA MEC/UXO 

2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket Warhead, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket Warhead, HE, 
2.36" Rocket Warhead, HE, 
2.36" Rocket Warhead, HE, 
2.36" Rocket Warhead, HE, 
2.36" Rocket Warhead, HE, 
2.36" Rocket Warhead, HE, 
2.36" Rocket Fuze w/ booster 
2.36" Rocket Fuze w/ booster 
2.36" Rocket Fuze w/ booster 
2.36" Rocket Fuze w/ booster 
2.36" Rocket Fuze w/ booster 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket Warhead, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket Warhead, HE, 
2.36" Rocket Warhead, HE, 
2.36" Rocket Fuze w/ booster 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 

2.36" Rocket, HE, 

2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket Warhead, HE, 
60mm Mortar, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE, 

2.36" Rocket, HE, 
2.36" Rocket Fuze w/ booster 

Mmmmit'mitmmmm»»'i'.i'1' -'r^^il^^mMmimMmmtitmaii^ 
453 
842 
1142 

817 
455 

3709 

11480 

MD 

Fragmentation, 2.36" Rocket 

Fragmentation, 2.36" Rocket 

Fragmentation, 2.36" Rocket 

Fragmentation, 2.36" Rocket 

Fragmentation, 2.36" Rocket 

2.36" Rocket, HE, 
Fragmentation, 2.36" Rocket & 60mm Mortar 

Fragmentation, 2.36" Rocket & 60mm Mortar 

Fragmentation, 2.36" Rocket & 60mm Mortar 

Fragmentation, 2.36" Rocket 
Fragmentation, 2.36" Rocket 
Fragmentation, 2.36" Rocket 

DMM 

Fragmentation, 2.36" Rocket 
Fragmentation, 2.36" Rocket 
Fragmentation, 2.36" Rocket & 60mm Mortar 

Fragmentation, 2.36" Rocket 
Fragmentation, 2.36" Rocket & 60mm Mortar 

;-'4i%i|iii 

.-m-

COMMENTS 

^^^BjB^fSfSsf j f f 

^•SM 



Area 4C 

RESIDENCE 

Foggy Bottom 
Huntinq Lodqe 

Subtotals: 

4535 Uzzle Road 
(Skinner) 

Subtotals: 

4553 Uzzle Road 
(Dixon) 

BRUSH 

Date 
Start 

3/1/07 

3/1/07 

Date 
Comp 

3/1/07 

3/1/07 

4/12/07 

TM 

2 

2 

1/2 

MAG/ FLAG 

Date 

03/01/07 

05/19/08 

05/20/08 

05/21/08 

05/27/08 

05/28/08 

05/29/08 

11/26/07 

11/27/07 

12/18/07 

04/16/07 
04/17/07 

04/18/07 

04/19/07 

TM 

1 

1 &2 

1 & 2 

1 & 2 

1 & 2 

1 & 2 

1 & 2 

1 & 2 

1 & 2 

1 
1 

1 

1 

An Dug 

911 

1483 

1264 

1569 

1441 

1414 

1007 

958 

1353 

190 
2501 

380 
641 

557 

544 

Date 

Comp 

05/19/08 

05/20/08 

05/21/08 

05/27/08 

05/28/08 

05/29/08 

11/27/07 

TM 

1 & 2 

1 & 2 

1 & 2 

1 & 2 

1 & 2 

1 & 2 

1 

1 

1 

QC 

05/29/08 

12/3/07 

QA 

05/29/08 

MEC/UXO 

1 each 37mm HE 
and 1 each 
155mm Shrapnel 
M K 1 

155mm HE, M107 
W M48 Series 
Fuxe 

MD 

SEE Comments 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/15SMMHE 
Projectile, and 3 
each M47, M48, 
M51 series fuze 
parts 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile, and 9 
each M47, M48, 
M51 series fuze 
parts 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile, and 7 
each M47, M48, 
M51 series fuze 
parts and 1 each 
37mm empty 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile, and 10 
each M47, M48, 
M51 series fuze 
parts 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile, 5 each 
M47, M48, M51 
series fuze parts, 1 
each 37mm TP 
(empty), and 1 each 
MK 1 shrapnel nose 
section w/expended 
fuze 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile, and 6 
each M47, M48, 
M51 series fuze 
parts 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 

Fins, Mortar, 81 MM 
(2) 
Cannister, 105 
Ejection Projectile 
(3) 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
Cannister, 105 
Ejection Projectile 
(3) 

Cannister, 105 
Ejection Projectile 
(4) 
M48 series fuzes 

(2) 
Tail Boom, Rifle 

Grenade 

DMM COMMENTS 

37mm was 3 inches 
below surface of 
ground, horizontal, 
pointing 45 degrees 
from north 

155mm was 18 inches 
below surface of 
ground in a straight up 
and down attitude with 
nose pointing down 



Area 4C 

Subtotals: 

4559 Uzzle Road 
(Forsythe) 

3/1/07 2 

04/20/07 

04/23/07 
10/22/07 
10/23/07 

10/24/07 

10/25/07 

10/29/07 

10/30/07 

10/31/07 

04/16/07 

04/17/07 

04/18/07 

04/19/07 

04/20/07 

04/23/07 
10/22/07 

1 

1 
1 
1 

1 

1 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 
2 

196 

123 

687 

444 

727 

561 

560 

5,420 

320 

623 

524 

590 

399 

360 

10/31/07 

1 

1 

1 

1 

1 

1 

1 

1 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

11/1/07 11/1/07 

Rocket, 2.36" 
(practice) 

2.36" Rocket Motor 

Fragmentation, 
1/5MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
Fins, Mortar 81 MM 

(1) 
M48 Series Fuze 

(1) 
2.36 inch Rocket 
Warhead Parts 
Cannister, 105MM 
Ejection Smoke (1) 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
Fins, Mortar 81 MM 

(1) 
2.36 inch Rocket 
Motor (1) (Fired) 
Cannister, 105MM 
Ejection Smoke (1) 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
Fins, Mortar 81 MM 

(3) 
M48 Series Fuze 
(4) 
2.36 in Rocet Motor 

(1) 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
Fins, Mortar 81 MM 
(4) 
2.36 in Pratice 
Rocket (Fired) 
2.36 in Rocket 
Warhead parts 
(practice) 

Fragmentation 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
M48 Series Fuze 

(2) 
2.36 Rocket Motor 
(Fired) 
Fragmentation 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 

Body, Mortar, 
81 MM WP (1/2) 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
M48 series fuzes 
(2) 
Time Ring, Powder 
Train Time Fuze 

Tail Boom, Rifle 
Grenade 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 

Grenade, MK 2 
w/safety pin 



Area 4C 

Subtotals: 

190 Falcon Lane 
(Kreidler) 

Subtotals: 

191 Falcon Lane 
(Sides) 

4/5/07 

4/9/07 4/9/07 

2 

2 

10/23/07 

10/24/07 

10/25/07 

10/29/07 

10/30/07 

10/31/07 

11/01/07 

11/05/07 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

375 

440 

475 

530 

675 

430 

415 

487 

275 

6,918 

237 

1425 

722 

2384 

685 

723 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

1/2 

1/2 

1/2 

1 

1 

105MM Projectile 
HE M1 W/M48 
Fuze 

37MM Projectile 
HEM62 W/M58 
Fuze 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
M48 series fuzes 

(1) 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
M48 series fuzes 

(1) 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
Fins, Mortar 81 MM 

(1) 
Cannister, 105MM 
Ejection Smoke (1) 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
M48 series fuzes 

(1) 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
M48 series fuzes 

(1) 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
M48 series fuzes 

(1) 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
M48 series fuzes 

(1) 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
M48 series fuzes 

(4) 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
Fins, Mortar 81 MM 

(1) 
M48 series fuzes 
(5) 
Cannister, 105MM 
Ejection Smoke (1) 

M11 Rifle Grenade 
105MM Ejection 
Projectile Base 
Plate 
105MM Ejection 
Projectile Pusher 
Plate 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
Fins, Mortar 81 MM 
(2) 
M48 series fuzes 
(5) 

M48 series fuzes 

(3) 
81 MM Mortar Fins 
(3) 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
M48 series fuzes 

(5) 
81 MM Mortar Fins 
(4) 



Area 4C 

Subtotals: 

\mmm~yr 
4542C Uzzle 
Road (Zanqerle) 

Subtotals: 

11/5/07 

-,.., -r^Mi 

11/5/07 

iW?--;*?KM 

1 

11/01/07 

723 

1414 

185 

3730 

mmnmimmH 

1 489 

487 

507 

663 

2146 

l i i l i i l l l i i i i l i i l i**»*r*» Y :. . :«-* : : ' * i l i ! fc l i^^Bl«8i lP* is : - ..__iilfit 
4542D Uzzle 
Road 
(Colclouqh) 

4/9/07 

4/9/07 
4/10/07 
4/11/07 
4/12/07 4/12/07 

2 

2 
2 
2 
2 

11/06/07 2 375 

740 

650 

875 

11/19/07 

•***» 

11/8/07 

1/2 

1/2 

1 

«.?*SJ: 

1 

1 

1 

1 

2 

2 

2 

2 

!|H^ : - . 

60MM HE mortar 
M49 W/M52 fuze 

81 MM Mortar Tail 
Boom 
105MM Ejection 
Projectile Base 
Plate 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
M48 series fuzes 
(4) 
81 MM Mortar Fins 
(2) 
2.36 in Rocket 
Motor 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Proiectile 
M48 series fuzes 
(4) 
81 MM Mortar Fins 
(3) 
105MM Ejection 
Projectile Base 
Plate 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 

105MM Ejection 
Projectile Base 
Plate 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
M48 series fuzes 
(3) 
M9 Rifle Grenade 
Tail Boom (3) 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
M48 series fuzes 

(3) 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
M48 series fuzes 

(1) 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Proiectile 

Etitto^..- .. ';^M ' •Isfe* •" 
layout 1 0 0 X 1 0 0 lanes 

155MM Projectile 
HE W/M48 Fuze 

81 MM Mortar HE 
w/M45 Fuze 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
M48 series fuzes 

(1) 
M11 Rifle Grenade 
Practice (1) 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
M48 series fuzes 

(1) 
PTTF Mod 
Unknown 
(Expended) 
M48 series fuzes 

(2) 
M11 Rifle Grenade 
Practice (2) 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 

81 MM Mortar Fins 
(2) 
M48 series fuzes 
(2) 
81 MM Mortar Fins 

(1) 

file:///mmm~yr


Area 4C 

Subtotals: 

TOTALS:! 

220 

370 

3,230 

TOTALS :| 27,240 

11/19/07 

2 

2 

TOTALS: 

Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
105MM Ejection 
Projectile Base 
Plate 
Fragmentation, 
105MM/155MMHE 
Projectile 
105MM Ejection 
Projectile Base 
Plate 



RES. E 

Hunting Trailer west of 6245 Isham 
Chambers Road 

Subtotals: 

•UllllllHHtHhPRnBBB^fT: ^'^m 
6301 Isham Chambers Road 

Subtotals: 

•L - i f c i f • ..:.. ...Jk>.im , . 
Anthony Howerton Silo/Trailer Area 

Subtotals: 

7023 Isham Chambers Road 

Subtotals: 

r T i r s r * ! — : -'-:i.ri»""iir;r" 

7025 Isham Chambers Road 

Subtotals: 

BRUSH 
Date 
Start 

Date 
Comp 

TM 

MAG/ FLAG 

Date 

1/29/07 
2/2/07 
2/5/07 

2/7/07 

TM 

1 
1 
1 

1 

An 
Marked 

123 
349 
12 

574 

1,058 

. . . x i , . , i r . • .. j f i i i l i r r : : . 

..... i t 1 ̂ dus i 

2/12/07 
2/13/07 
2/14/07 

1 
1 
1 

4/3/07 
4/4/07 

4/5/07 
4/9/07 

4/10/07 

4/11/07 

2/19/07 

2/21/07 
2/22/07 

2/19/07 

2/21/07 
2/22/07 

1 
1 

1 
1 
1 

1 

BH 

w 
1 

1 

^ 

¥ 
2 

2 

169 
219 
220 

608 

^ • • 8 

488 
701 

310 
112 
160 

152 
1,923 

1,532 

122 
30 

1,684 

581 

75 
54 

710 

Date 
Start 

1/29/07 

2/5/07 
2/6/07 

2/7/07 
2/8/07 

Date 
Comp 

2/8/07 

2/8/07 
2/12/07 
2/13/07 
2/14/07 
2/15/07 

2/15/07 
4/3/07 
4/4/07 

4/5/07 
4/9/07 

4/10/07 

4/11/07 

2/20/07 
2/21/07 
2/22/07 

2/20/07 

2/21/07 
2/22/07 

2/15/07 

.... < < * 

4/11/07 

2/22/07 

2/22/07 

TM 

1 

1 
1 

1 
1 

¥ 
1 
1 

1 
1 

1 

1 

j a 

" 
1 
1 
1 

• 2 

2 
2 

An Dug 

16 

414 
485 

379 
560 

1,854 

333 
667 
830 

1,070 
198 

3,098 

INTRUSIVE X 

- i 

2/14/07 

QA 

2/17/07 

MEC 

2/27/07 2/27/07 

wm&m mmmk • » *«» 526 
219 
851 

709 
344 
486 

231 
3,366 

1,250 
830 
731 

2,811 

690 

491 
461 

1,642 

4/11/07 

2/26/07 

2/26/07 

4/11/07 

2/26/07 

2/26/07 

MD 

57MM AP-T Projectile 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
37MM AP-T Projectile 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
57MM AP-T Projectile 

DMM C . <£NTS 

IK'iRaHBBHHIIil-iMillllllllllHHHNE.S*; flHlllIlll^ffiafP$llll^H^MUl^iilHHiHM^ilP 

57MM AP-T Projectile 

• I — iiiifa»aiisili«i ' i l l — ' la 

57MM AP-T Projectile 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
Fragmentation, 105MM HE Projectile (10 pes) 
Fragmentation, 105MM HE Projectile (12 pes) 
37MM AP-T Proiectile 
Fragmentation, 105MM HE Projectile (28 pes) 

37MM AP-T Proiectile 
105MM Ejection Projectile 

-m -. -.xm. i.ili.̂ ....:...... 

1 P 5 — I M 

"II il ryi'i'iiiiiiiiiiii 
«BT: * « n H 

Expended 

SI 

w::'M:-^:mmmryz:uw:'¥Mi:E; w. ~w~---- • •••-•.•.•• 6315 Mancour Road 

Subtotals: 

^ffll^iHte r ? sti *; * t 11 lit H i 
6317 Mancour Road (Trailer south of 
6315 Mancour Road) 

, . ' : . • . • ' I (. 

2/26/07 
2/27/07 

2/28/07 

(III-. *SII 
2/26/07 

2/27/07 

2/28/07 

2 
2 

2 

1 

1 

1 

107 
56 

126 
289 

, 
69 

146 

135 

2/26/07 
2/27/07 

2/28/07 2/28/07 

2 
2 

2 

" \ I f f lBf i f i f . IB 
2/26/07 

2/27/07 

2/28/07 2/28/07 

1 

1 

1 

S'.T •" ;""~fB3F. A .•••'.••: ^";:" - 1 5 ":^v « > ; l l : « f f e •„ 
425 
348 

126 
899 

' • «» • ! * 
426 

431 

364 

2/28/07 

XT-•" ' . • "• 

2/28/07 

Mm ism* 

105MM High 
Explosive 
Projectile 

57MM AP-T Projectile 
37MM AP-T Proiectile 
M48 Series Projectile Nose Fuze 

d 1 1 n < 11 aiidilWttlliilWitMMfrikliiiiii 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 
Fragmentation, 105MM HE Projectile 
Fragmentation, 105MM HE Projectile 
37MM AP-T Projectile 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
57MM AP-T Projectile 

57MM AP-T Projectile 
S7MM AP-T Prnientile 

;.:. 'JE» w :•:? ? i a n o 

f \ i « « L ' , J;.,..-.a* 

BIP 

file:///IfflBfif


6305 Isham Chai. Road 

Subtotals: 

6245 Isham Chambers Road 

Subtotals: 

^ _ 

:, g as; : . 

3/5/07 
3/5/07 
3/12/07 

3/12/07 

3/13/07 

3/13/07 

3/14/07 

3/14/07 

3/15/07 
3/15/07 
3/19/07 
3/19/07 

3/20/07 

3/20/07 
3/21/07 
3/21/07 
3/22/07 
3/26/07 

3/21/07 
3/22/07 
3/26/07 
3/27/07 
3/28/07 
3/29/07 

4/2/07 

4/3/07 

H ? 
1 

2 

1 

2 

1 

2 

1 

2 
1 

2 

1 

2 
1 

2 
2 
2 

K B 

w 1 
1 
1 
1 
1 

1 

1 

944 
624 
209 

253 

108 

274 

90 

402 

140 
379 
185 
603 

545 

591 
537 
632 
360 
31 

6,907 

84 
332 
448 

1,195 
1,026 
306 

1,060 

4,451 

^ ^ 

3/12/07 

3/12/07 

3/13/07 

3/13/07 

3/14/07 

3/14/07 

3/14/07 
3/15/07 
3/15/07 
3/19/07 
3/19/07 

3/20/07 

3/20/07 
3/21/07 
3/21/07 
3/22/07 
3/26/07 

3/21/07 
3/22/07 
3/26/07 
3/27/07 
3/28/07 
3/29/07 

4/2/07 

4/3/07 

3/26/07 

4/3/07 

• 
1 

2 

1 

2 

1 

2 

1 

2 
1 

2 

1 

2 

p 

2 
2 

• • 
^ 

1 

1 
1 
1 

1 

, 

600 

713 

319 

565 

493 

461 

234 
399 
615 
465 

839 

1,069 
396 
879 
998 
95 

9,140 

336 
602 
601 
698 
705 
989 

687 

660 

5,278 

Grid 4D5-B1 failed QC 

4/2/07 

4/4/07 

4/2/07 

4/4/07 

37MM HE 
Projectile 

37MM HE 
Projectile 

57MM AP-T Projectile 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 
.50 Caliber Projectile 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 
37MM AP-T Projectile 
Fragmentation, 105MM HE Projectile ( 4 pes) 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
37MM AP-T Projectile 
Fragmentation, 105MM HE Projectile ( 5 pes) 
37MM AP-T Projectile 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
37MM AP-T Projectile 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 

57MM AP-T Projectile 

57MM AP-T Projectile 
37MM AP-T Projectile 
37MM AP-T Projectile 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 

M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 

37MM AP-T Projectile 
37MM AP-T Projectile 
37MM AP-T Projectile 
37MM AP-T Projectile 

57MM AP-T Projectile 

mm n r a i 

BIP 

- T J 4 — 
itt—jui iiotaaii 
wmnmm-mmMiM 

BIP 
Tree had grown around the 
base, had to BIP to ensure 
not a 57MM APHE 



6235 Isham Chambers Road (Trailer 
north of 6245 Isham Chambers Road) 

::,!K. .„ ^ i M i i f : . : . 7 : : i i i i 
6221 Mancour Drive 

Subtotals: 

3/29/07 

4/2/07 

4/3/07 

4/4/07 

T.IIIO 
3/26/07 
3/27/07 
3/28/07 

3/29/07 

mmillMmmmM^MMiimmmmmM^t^iimm 
TOTALS: 

MUNITIONS DEBRIS (MD) 
57MM AP-T Projectiles: 
37MM AP-T Projectiles: 

37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectiles: 
105MM Ejection Projectiles: 

;ntation, 105MM HE Projectile (pes) 
M48 Series Projectile Nose Fuzes: 

MEC (UXO) 
105MM High Explosive Projectiles: 

37MM HE Projectiles: 

32 
17 
19 
1 

132 
1 

1 
2 

TOT 

rr 
2 

2 

2 

C M 
2 
2 
2 

2 

s 

42 

248 

301 

87 

678 

fmmss 
88 
204 
184 

89 

565 

19,223 

3/29/07 

4/2/07 

4/3/07 

4/4/07 4/4/07 

m 
2 

2 

2 

137 

210 

649 

146 

1,142 

i If i'im'\.Tl-Z"'-': 
3/26/07 
3/27/07 
3/28/07 

3/29/07 

i^stis 

3/29/07 

2 
2 
2 

2 

187 
273 
187 

192 

839 

i / 

4/5/07 

4/2/07 

4/5/07 

4/2/07 

IT 1IT ." W~W&'S"'M !•> : 
DIGS: 31,290 

|||i|ggb^yM«| 

37MM AP-T Projectile 
Fragmentation, 105MM HE Projectile ( 6 pes) 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
Fragmentation, 105MM HE Projectile (16 pes) 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
Fragmentation, 105MM HE Projectile (15 pes) 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
Fragmentation, 105MM HE Projectile (10 pes) 

* £*• ' ^ *'J? l i t ' - "«*-*' i f * i - ' ':'"'W" '• 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
Fragmentation, 105MM HE Projectile ( 4 pes) 
57MM AP-T Projectile 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 
M63 (37MM) 105MM SUBCAL Projectile 
37MM AP-T Proiectile 
37MM AP-T Projectile 
Fragmentation, 105MM HE Projectile ( 12 pes) 
57MM AP-T Proiectile 
Fragmentation, 105MM HE Projectile (10 pes) 

« • • f^ <::̂ «lshHkllRl̂ 4f < .<«AJlHllil JL. ilte. 

i? mstnm ftm 

*^^H^HK;HiiMHHitei^^|^^lPm 



Shot# 

1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 
16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

USA Environmental, Inc. 

SITE: ARNG Camp Butner, NC 

Disposal 
Date 

02/15/06 

09/25/06 

10/04/06 

10/10/06 

10/12/06 

10/12/06 

10/12/06 

10/12/06 
10/16/06 

10/17/06 

10/18/06 

10/18/06 

10/18/06 

10/18/06 

10/18/06 
10/19/06 

10/24/06 

10/24/06 

10/24/06 

10/26/06 
10/26/06 
10/30/06 
10/30/06 
11/07/06 
11/09/06 
11/09/06 

11/09/06 

11/09/06 

11/09/06 

11/09/06 

11/09/06 

11/09/06 

11/09/06 

11/09/06 

11/09/06 

11/13/06 

11/14/06 

11/14/06 

11/15/06 

11/15/06 

Area 

1A 

4A 

Lakeview 

Lakeview 

4A 

4A 

4A 

4A 
4A 

4A 

4A 

4A 

4A 

4A 

4A 
4A 

4A 

4A 

4A 

4A 
4A 
4A 
4A 
4A 
4A 
4A 

4A 

4A 

4A 

4A 

4A 

4A 

4A 

4A 
4A 

4A 

4A 

4A 

4A 

4A 

Disposal Grid 

41-B24 

45-E30 

30-X9 

30-V10 

45-E31 

45-E31 

45-E31 

45-E31 
45-E31 

45-E31 

45-F33 

45-C32 

45-F33 

45-F33 

45-F33 
45-E31 

45-C31 

45-C31 

45-130 

45-E32 
45-E32 
45-B32 
45-B32 

45-030 
45-E30 
45-F30 

45-E30 

45-E30 

45-E30 

45-E30 

45-E30 

45-E30 

45-E30 

45-E30 
45-F30 

45-D32 

45-C32 

45-C32 

45-09 

45-E31 

Location Grid 

41-B23 

45-E30 

30-X9 

30-V10 

45-E31 

45-E31 

45-E31 

45-E31 
45-E31 

45-E31 

45-F33 

45-C31 

45-F33 

45-F33 

45-F33 
45-E31 

45-C31 

45-C31 

45-C31 

45-E32 
45-E32 
45-B32 
45-B32 
54-030 
45-E30 
45-F30 

45-E30 

45-E30 

45-E30 

45-E30 

45-E30 

45-E30 

45-E30 

45-E30 
45-F30 

45-D32 

45-C32 

45-C32 

Various 

45-E31 

OE/UXO ACCOUNTABILITY 

Identification 

M1A1 mine, M15 WP grenade 

M9 Rifle Grenade 
M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket Warhead 
w/explosive remains 

M9 Rifle Grenade 

M9 Rifle Grenade 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 
M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket Mtr 
M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 

M9 Rifle Grenade with Safety pin 

installed 
M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 

M9 Rifle Grenade 
M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 
M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 
M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 
M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 
M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 

M9 Rifle Grenade w/ Safety Pin 

installed 
M9 Rifle Grenade w/ Safety Pin 

installed 
M9 Rifle Grenade w/ Safety Pin 
installed 
M9 Rifle Grenade Warhead 

M9 Rifle Grenade Warhead 

M9 Rifle Grenade Warhead 

M9 Rifle Grenade Warhead 
M9 Rifle Grenade 

M9 Rifle Grenade 

M9 Rifle Grenade 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket Mtr, 24 each 

M6A1 Anti Tank Rocket 

RECORD 

MEC Cat 

UXO 

UXO 

MC 

UXO 

UXO 

UXO 

UXO 

UXO 
UXO 

UXO 

UXO 

UXO 

UXO 

UXO 

MC 

uxo 
UXO 

UXO 

DMM 

UXO 
UXO 
UXO 
UXO 
UXO 
UXO 

UXO 
UXO 

DMM 

DMM 

DMM 

MC 

MC 

MC 

MC 

UXO 

UXO 

UXO 

UXO 

MC 

UXO 

Disposal Method 

De-Mil 

BD? 

De-Mil 

BIP 

BIP 

BIP 

BIP 

BIP 
BIP 

BIP 

BIP 

De-Mil 

BIP 

BIP 

BIP 
BIP 
BIP 

BIP 

De-Mil 

BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 

BIP 

De-Mil 

De-Mil 

De-Mil 

De-Mil 

De-Mil 

De-Mil 

De-Mil 
BIP 

BIP 

BIP 

BIP 

De-Mil 

BIP 

W921DY-04-D-0067TO-007 

Comments 

Located on surface while brush cutting 

Post Det. Inspection showed item was training round 

Post Det. Inspection showed item was training round 

Item, reported by home owner, located alongside his 
garage. Remotely pulled to adjacent grid and disposed 
of. Post Det. Inspection showed item was training round 

Post Det. Inspection showed item was training round 

Post Det. Inspection showed item was training round 

Post Det. Inspection showed item was training round 

Post Det Inspection showed item was training round 

Post Det. Inspection showed item was training round 
Post Det. Inspection showed item was training round 
Post Det. Inspection showed item was training round 

Post Det. Inspection showed item was training round 

Rocket motors that could not be positively identified as 
free from explosive hazard. 



22 
23 
24 

25 

26 
27 
28 
29 
30 
31 
32 
33 

34 
35 
36 
37 
38 
39 
40 
41 
42 

43 
44 
45 
46 
47 
48 
49 
50 
51 
52 
53 
54 
55 
56 
57 
58 
59 
60 
61 
62 
63 
64 
65 
66 
67 
68 
69 
70 
71 
72 
73 
74 
75 
76 
77 
78 
79 
80 
81 

Disposal 
Date 

02/28/07 
03/19/07 
04/03/07 

04/03/07 

04/18/07 
04/20/07 
10/31/07 

11/01/07 
11/07/07 
11/14/07 
11/15/07 
11/26/07 

11/28/07 
11/28/07 
11/28/07 
11/29/07 
11/29/07 
11/29/07 
11/29/07 
11/29/07 
11/29/07 
11/29/07 
11/29/07 
11/29/07 
11/29/07 
11/29/07 
11/29/07 
11/29/07 
11/29/07 
11/29/07 
11/29/07 
11/29/07 
12/03/07 
12/03/07 
12/03/07 
12/03/07 
12/04/07 
12/04/07 
12/04/07 
12/04/07 
12/04/07 
12/04/07 

12/04/07 
12/05/07 
12/13/07 
12/13/07 
12/13/07 
12/13/07 
12/13/07 
12/13/07 
12/17/07 
12/17/07 
12/17/07 
12/17/07 
12/17/07 
12/17/07 
12/17/07 
12/18/07 
12/18/07 
12/18/07 

Property Address 

4D 
4D 
4D 

4D 

4C 
4C 
4C 
4C 
4C 
4C 
4C 

4C-2 

4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 
4B 

6317 Mancour Road 
6305 Isham Chambers Road 
6245 Isham Chambers Road 

6245 Isham Chambers Road 

4559 Uzzle Road 
4553 Uzzle Road 
4559 Uzzle Road 
4559 Uzzle Road 
4542D Uzzel Road 
4542D Uzzel Road 
191 Falcon Lane 
4535 Uzzle Road 

Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 
Open Area 

Locaton from Corner 
Stakes 
SW 202'-SE 140' 
SW 225'-SE 343' 
NW27V-NE78 ' 

NW 234'-NE 99' 

SW=312"-NW=25' 
SW=284'-SE=213' 
SW=195,-NW=1331-

SW=232'-NW=67' 
N=61'-E=211' 
N=205'-E=104' 
SE=114'NE=160' 
0697521/4014423 

0702881/4013386 
0702881/4013386 
0702872/4013391 
0702812/4013388 

0702806/4013398 
0702784/4013389 
0702777/4013392 
0702740/4013395 
0702724/4013412 

0702812/4013388 
0702806/4013398 
0702784/4013389 
0702777/4013392 
0702740/4013395 
0702724/4013412 
0702812/4013388 
0702806/4013398 
0702784/4013389 
0702739/4013388 
0702759/4013350 
0702777/4013396 
0702805/4013399 
0702804/4013399 
0702777/4013396 
0702747/4013384 
0702749/4013392 
0702748/4013392 
0702748/4013393 
0702747/4013384 
0702749/4013392 
0702748/4013392 
0702747/4013384 
0702692/4013365 
0702686/4013335 
0702692/4013365 
0702692/4013365 
0702686/4013335 
0702701/4013383 
0702722/4013393 
0702722/4013393 
0702722/4013393 
0702722/4013393 
0702706/4013379 
0702706/4013379 
0702700/4013390 
0702751/4013334 
0702774/4013327 
0702751/4013334 

Identification 

105MM HiEh Explostve (HE) Projectle 
37MM High Explosive (HE) Projectle 
37MM High Explosive (HE) Projectle 

MEC Cat. 

uxo 
uxo 
uxo 

57MM AP-T MD 

M 2 Hand Grenade 
Rocket, 2.36" (practice) 
105MM, MI W/M48 Series 

37MM, M63 W/M58 BD 
155MM HE M102 w/M48 series 
81MM HE mortar M45 w/M45 fuze 
60MM HE mortar M49 w/M52 fuze 
155MM HE Ml 02 w/M48 series 

2.36" Rocket, HE 

2.36" Rocket, Warhead, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, Warhead, HE 
2.36" Rocket, Warhead, HE 
2.36" Rocket, Warhead, HE 
2.36" Rocket, Warhead, HE 
2.36" Rocket, Warhead, HE 
2.36" Rocket, Warhead, HE 
2,36" Rocket Fuze W/Booster 
2,36" Rocket Fuze W/Booster 
2,36" Rocket Fuze W/Booster 
2,36" Rocket Fuze W/Booster 
2,36" Rocket Fuze W/Booster 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, Warhead, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, Warhead, HE 
2.36" Rocket, Warhead, HE 
2,36" Rocket Fuze W/Booster 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, Warhead, HE 
2.36" Rocket, Warhead, HE 
2.36" Rocket, Warhead, HE 
2,36" Rocket Fuze W/Booster 

2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
60mm Mortar, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2.36" Rocket, HE 
2,36" Rocket Fuze W/Booster 

DMM 
MC 

uxo 
uxo 
UXO 
UXO 
UXO 
UXO 

UXO 
UXO 

uxo 
uxo 
uxo 
uxo 
uxo 
uxo 
uxo 
MEC 
MEC 
MEC 
MEC 
MEC 
MEC 
MEC 
MEC 
MEC 
MEC 
MEC 

uxo 
uxo 
uxo 
MEC 

uxo 
uxo 
uxo 
uxo 
MEC 
MEC 
MEC 

uxo 
uxo 
uxo 
MEC 
MEC 
MEC 
MEC 

uxo 
uxo 
UXO 

uxo 
uxo 
uxo 
uxo 
uxo 
uxo 
MEC 

Disposal Method 

BIP 
BIP 
BIP 

BIP 

BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 

BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 

Demil 
Demil 
Demil 
Demil 
Demil 
Demil 
Demil 
Demil 
Demil 
Demil 
Demil 

BIP 
BIP 
BIP 

Demil 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 

Demil 
Demil 
Demil 

BIP 
BIP 
BIP 

Demil 
Demil 
Demil 
Demil 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 

Demil 

Comments 

Tree had grown around the base, had to BIP to ensure not 

a 57MM APHE 

This round was moved with corps approval 

Destroyed storage shed 
Major engineering controls required 



/ 

82 
S3 
84 
85 
86 
87 

04/04/08 
04/24/08 
05/19/08 
05/19/08 
08/07/08 
09/09/08 

4C2U1 
4C2U1 

4C 
4C 

4C2U2 
4C2U2 

507EntmRd 
4763 Moriah Rd 
Uzzle Rd (Hunting Lodge) 
Uzzle Rd (Hunting Lodge) 
4669 Uzzle Rd 
4669 Uzzle Rd 

698171.685/4013567.03 
698723.129/4016854.75 
698813.01/4014915.52 
698764.76/4014895.56 

CALENDAR YEAR 2008 
155mmMKlHE 
M9 Rifle Gren Warhead w/fuze HE 
37MMHE 
155mm MK 1 Shrapnel Round 
105mm HE Ml w/M48 
37mm M62 Black Powder w/M58 Prac 

UXO 
MEC 
UXO 
UXO 
UXO 
UXO 

BIP 
Demil 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 
BIP 

Used "Buried Explosion Module" method for disposal 

Used "Buried Explosion Module" method for disposal 
50 Sand Bags and Protective works (next to barn) 



ANNUAL REPORT - REMOVAL ACTION AT FORMER CAMP BUTNER 
BUTNER, NORTH CAROLINA 

APPENDIX C. PHOTOGRAPHS 

This appendix contains the following photographs of major activities and MEC discoveries during site 
operations: 

Figure C-1: Top View M1 Training Mine, Area 1A C-3 

Figure C-2: 81 MM Practice Mortar, Area 1A C-3 

Figure C-3: M15 Smoke Grenade (WP), Area 1A C-4 

Figure C-4: Use of MOFB in Lakeview Subdivision C-4 

Figure C-5: Anomalies Flagged (later Removed), NW Corner Lakeview Subdivision C-5 

Figure C-6: 2.36 Inch Rocket, Lakeview Subdivision C-5 

Figure C-7: Layout of QC Test Strip at USA Field Office C-6 

Figure C-8: 2.36 Inch Anti-tank Rocket Prepared for Demo, Area 4A C-6 

Figure C-9: 2.36 Inch Rocket, Area 4A C-7 

Figure C-10: 105 MM HE Projectile, Area 4D C-7 

Figure C-11: 57 MM HE Projectile (Tree-Encapsulated), Area4D C-8 

Figure C-12: 37 MM HE Projectile, Area 4D C-8 

Figure C-13: 37 MM HE Projectile with Engineering Controls, Area 4D C-9 

Figure C-14: 2.36 Inch Rocket, Area 4C - 4553 Uzzle Road C-9 

Figure C-15: 2.36 Inch Rocket after Demo, Area 4C - 4553 Uzzle Road C-10 

Figure C-16: MK-2 Hand Grenade, Area 4C - 4559 Uzzle Road C-10 

Figure C-17: Engineering Controls for 105 MM Projectile, Area 4C - 4559 Uzzle Road C-11 

Figure C-18: Engineering Controls for 81 MM Mortar, Area 4C - 4542D Uzzle Road C-11 

Figure C-19: 155 MM Projectile, Area 4C - 4542D Uzzle Road C-12 

Figure C-20: Site of 155 MM Projectile, Area 4C - 4542D Uzzle Road C-12 

Figure C-21: Demo Operation 105 MM, Area 4 Complex 2 Unit 9 - 4669 Uzzle Road C-13 

Figure C-22: Demo Operations 105 MM, Area 4 Complex 2 Unit 9 - 4669 Uzzle Road C-13 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 Page C-1 
Original: 20 January 2009 



ANNUAL REPORT - REMOVAL ACTION AT FORMER CAMP BUTNER 

BUTNER, NORTH CAROLINA 

Figure C-23: 155 MM Projectile (59 ft from Edge of House), Area 4 Complex 2 Unit 1-5, 
507Enon Road C-14 

Figure C-24: Engineering Controls for 155 MM Projectile, Area 4 Complex 2 Unit 1-5, 
507 Enon Road C-14 

This space is intentionally left blank. 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 p a g e Q-2 
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Figure C-1: Top View M1 Training Mine, Area 1A 

Figure C-2: 81 MM Practice Mortar, Area 1A 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 

Page C-3 
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BUTNER, NORTH CAROLINA 

Figure C-3: M15 Smoke Grenade (WP), Area 1A 

Figure C-4: Use of MOFB in Lakeview Subdivision 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 

Page C-4 
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BUTNER, NORTH CAROLINA 

Figure C-5: Anomalies Flagged (later Removed), NW Corner Lakeview Subdivision 

Figure C-6: 2.36 Inch Rocket, Lakeview Subdivision 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 
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Figure C-7: Layout of QC Test Strip at USA Field Office 

< 

w . • 

Figure C-8: 2.36 Inch Anti-tank Rocket Prepared for Demo, Area 4A 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 
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Figure C-9: 2.36 Inch Rocket, Area 4A 

Figure C-10: 105 MM HE Projectile, Area 4D 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 
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Figure C-11: 57 MM HE Projectile (Tree-Encapsulated), Area 4D 

Figure C-12: 37 MM HE Projectile, Area 4D 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 
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Figure C-13: 37 MM HE Projectile with Engineering Controls, Area 4D 

3fgE2W 
Figure C-14: 2.36 Inch Rocket, Area 4C - 4553 Uzzle Road 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 
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Figure C-15: 2.36 Inch Rocket after Demo, Area 4C - 4553 Uzzle Road 

Figure C-16: MK-2 Hand Grenade, Area 4C - 4559 Uzzle Road 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 
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. 

Figure C-17: Engineering Controls for 105 MM Projectile, Area 4C - 4559 Uzzle Road 

Figure C-18: Engineering Controls for 81 MM Mortar, Area 4C - 4542D Uzzle Road 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 
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Figure C-19: 155 MM Projectile, Area 4C - 4542D Uzzle Road 

Figure C-20: Site of 155 MM Projectile, Area 4C - 4542D Uzzle Road 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 

Page C-12 
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V* 

Figure C-21: Demo Operation 105 MM, Area 4 Complex 2 Unit 9 - 4669 Uzzie Road 

Figure C-22: Demo Operations 105 MM, Area 4 Complex 2 Unit 9 - 4669 Uzzle Road 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 
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Figure C-23:155 MM Projectile (59 ft from Edge of House), 
Area 4 Complex 2 Unit 1-5, 507 Enon Road 

Figure C-24: Engineering Controls for 155 MM Projectile, Area 4 Complex 2 Unit 1-5, 
507 Enon Road 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 
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BUTNER, NORTH CAROLINA 

APPENDIX D. MAPS 

This appendix contains the following maps for the Butner sites: 

D-1 Location Map 

D-2 Status Map as of 10-21 -2008 

D-3 Area 1A Clearance Area 

D-4 Lakeview Subdivision Clearance Area 

D-5 Area 4A Clearance Area 

D-6 Area 4D Clearance Areas 

D-7 Area 4D-1 Clearance Area Michael Stewart 

D-8 Area 4D-2 Clearance Area John Hall 

D-9 Area 4D-3 Clearance Area - Hunting Trailer West of 6245 Isham Chambers Road 
D-10 Area 4D-4 Clearance Area Wayne Howarton 

D-11 Area 4D-5 Clearance Area Steve Neunkirchner 

D-12 Area 4D-6 Clearance Area Roger Johnson 

D-13 Area 4D-7 Clearance Area Irving Mancour 

D-14 Area 4D-8 Clearance Area Mancour 

D-15 Area 4D-9 Clearance Area Howerton 

D-16 Area 4D-10 Clearance Area 6245 Isham Chambers Road 

D-17 Area 4D-11 Clearance Area Anthony Howerton 
D-18 Area 4C Clearance Areas 

D-19 Area 4C-1 Clearance Area Marshal Skinner 

D-20 Area 4C-2 Clearance Area Ulrich Kriedler 

D-21 Area 4C-3 Clearance Area Scott Sides 
D-22 Area 4C-4 Clearance Area Karen Colclough 

D-23 Area 4C-5 Clearance Area Edward Zangerle 

D-24 Area 4C-6 Clearance Area Travis Forsythe 

D-25 Area 4C-7 Clearance Area Ronnie Dixon 

D-26 Area 4C-8 Clearance Area Foggy Bottom Hunting Lodge 
D-27 Area 4B Clearance Area 

D-28 Area 4 Range Complex 1 Unit 1-1 Albert Carrington 
D-29 Area 4 Range Complex 1 Unit 1-2 David Parker 

D-30 Area 4 Range Complex 1 Unit 1-3 Donnell Carrington 
D-31 Area 4 Range Complex 1 Unit 1-4 Joseph Ham 
D-32 Area 4 Range Complex 1 Unit 1-5 Robert Bailey 
D-33 Area 4 Range Complex 1 Unit 1-6 Michael Monsees 

D-34 Area 4 Range Complex 1 Units 1-7 & 1-8, Wanda Coleman, et al. Henry Kittrell 
D-35 Area 4 Range Complex 1 Unit 1-9 Linda Carrington 

D-36 Area 4 Range Complex 1 Unit 1-10 Colin Campbell 

D-37 Area 4 Range Complex 2 Unit 1-1 George Grimes 

D-38 Area 4 Range Complex 2 Unit 1 -2 Phillip Blackburn 

D-39 Area 4 Range Complex 2 Unit 1 -3 Heather Troutman 

D-40 Area 4 Range Complex 2 Unit 1 -4 Michael Duke 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 



ANNUAL REPORT - REMOVAL ACTION AT FORMER CAMP BUTNER 
BUTNER, NORTH CAROLINA 

D-41 

D-42 

D-43 

D-44 

D-45 

D-46 

D-47 

D-48 

D-49 

D-50 

D-51 

D-52 

D-53 

D-54 

D-55 

D-56 

D-57 

D-58 

D-59 

D-60 

D-61 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Area 4 Range 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

Complex 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

2Un 

it 1-5 Worth McCorkle 

11-6 Mary Duke 

it 1-7 Michael Mangum 

11-8 Linda Fogleman 

it 1-9 Phillip Robbins III 

11-10 Phillip Robbins Jr. 

11-11 Jim King 

11-12 Gary Garrett 

11-13 Elvin Mangum 

11-14 Mangum 

11-15 Mangum 

12-1 Nancy Mangum 

it 2-2 Christine Clayton 

12-3 Dana & Kyle Mangum 

it 2-4 Erdine Raynor 

12-5 Artie Averett 

12-6 H.Arnold Williams 

12-7 David & Carolyn Winfrey 

12-8 Mangum Properties Ltd 

it 2-9 Brian & Suzanne Lougee 

t2-10 Nancy Roberts 

This space is intentionally left blank. 
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ANNUAL REPORT - REMOVAL ACTION AT FORMER CAMP BUTNER 

BUTNER, NORTH CAROLINA 

APPENDIX E. QUALITY CONTROL/QUALITY ASSURANCE DOCUMENTATION 

This appendix contains the following QC/QA documentation: 

1. HND Form 948's 
2. QC Daily Operator Instrument Test Forms (on CD) 
3. QC Inspection Reports (on CD) 
4. QC Seeds (on CD) 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 

Page E-1 



•p - AHMY mGitiummG km SUPPORT CENTER, HLWTSV'LLE 

( __ _.. I P':-\,..,zcr i--:^fi,JlOh: : 

I - I 
SUBJECT 1TEM(S1 (Check aii that apply): } 

i ^ v. ir "J!3r, ^ " -Q Quality Contra! 

! • " " C'-^c.,. ,,u'?tiftri [_J Other : . . . j ^ " -

»• • _ -_ ._.. r.><\^:<-. : r»s 4 c i-W-c y _£fb, t\q±* •>*:. 

I if..., - rfiCtiCf". :jr mT iLnr . ^ . .. ' - -^ratri^t-. _Mi:at'C?r>s> iu •. ''lesied. j 

5 • - • . ' . i - n i t ' . * 
(• •_ USAGE Site Representative t 

« - - _ • 

;, fiECBc^ -.:..wAfLEDGED. 
L-u-i...- • ! - :* W^jresfr.-i.^.: 

" lfl~ C't'' ' ^KEN: 
1 4 

rCt i r iMr -'OP.V V'F 
! l «PftE£ 



w»&* ARMY ENGINffiRlNe AND SOPPOWT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE ©ROUP 

TO; 

U.S.A -E-Nv U N C 

DATE: 

5 A (A Jf 36 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO #: 
£?gQ7 

PROJECT LOCA 

ytVlZXii -04~T)-dC&£. fe^vgg- GIMP RmJEel 

KuTNfcRj NC 
SUBJECT ITEII(S} 
• Work Plan 
| | Safety Violation 

[ | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION7?^ M M l P <lL«Ar«*T£-C. 

{Check alt that apply); 
S s 4 j l Quality Control 

Q Other q - f g ^ * 3 Z . 

—Bi_ 

ISZ gyrv T * \ i ft^ 

a ^ g . j <v USAGE & A 

z£: 7 •A/DT-H i AJ ̂  po ^ , 4 - Q ^ 3 — 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: ̂  " " 

ACTION TAKEN; 

CEHNC FORM 946 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY i - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO; 

t î ft £^v-

DATE: 

\H 3un<L C* 

TIME; 

\P£C 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#; 
OCQ1 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEMfS) 

• Work Plan 

{ 1 Safety Violation 

| 1 Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: " T W M t A f t P C \ w 

(Check all that apply): 

- ^ H Quality Control 

• Other Q4Q-& £14 

^<U CiAyr^M fa 
Tgjfe <sCt 

Prompt correction ction or cojTtgliarjce with contradi specifications is requested. 

/ USAGE Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. <&***&( j * L & * < ^ ' 
ContracJoi's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FOAM 94B (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY1-



; z ftRr.' «NG'.«EER5NCS AN!'. hJP?^m C I ^ B . HUf;T<!VlLJ_.E , 

; ^ M&Mo _ ______ ._____. t 
f - - " " ^ •=-=-- —- ----- I IJATF- ' TIME- t 

i^__^iii. 
;" -MTHi, . «UM; . . i - : I PRO^t: "•" LOCATION: { 

I ~ j Safety v,,k.u_/-, • Q . i , - q < i t ^ ' - r j 

[ ] =^ ta -v ,_,.., •'Tlferl? « 
i. 

'! ~''EbU~.',- ";*~'N- T [ - \ ^ .._.';_.. hi\,li'. (_-J.<c~; „ , ' <<- ^ J 

h _._ ~!"''•• C\±-. .•L-.'-- > • ' ...•;.J..U..J -> i l l p ^ & ^ - r f 
*- , / ... *' I. 

I " 

• - - - « — — — — ' " • - - - ' — — — — " — — — — — » 

_____ „ I 

T~I\ uj.id.'uor •:•'-'"'• i in if. i. ,r ,,ifh c-'infrac-f bpyu i^^ l i j : : . "£ ?*c_ue:>'.-a.J, ' 

-,=iaidk»s4a»iJJJL_,t~-V— v '~^° — "--- - - - • 
f J.-V.CE Sua R»Wftto.iUij.L I 

J 

;>pr 4rKN0WLEDiii£ 
? c:.-r:i-actor's Representative 

M:~CH TAKEN: 

. I ' A F ^ ' 9 : J 



U.S, ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNlSv 
ORDNANCE m® EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO; 

mA E.nv INC. 

PATE; TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

yqta&¥«M-b"50Dfe 
DO#: 

DOOl 

PROJECT LOCA1 
Fefcrnep. CptmF BuTHEfc 

Suj ner. hie 
(Check all that apply): 
"""Q Quality Control 

Q Otter £f-4<g-# 3fc 

SUBJECT ITEMIS) 
[~] Work Plan 
[~1 Safety Violation 
P Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTtONTTWt. MlAfeP CU&Kf t f t r4C£ ^ T 

ft Uf»PvcE Q>^ i ^ p i c n o a . / - •—-/ 
Jz • N'C r-ri i /v & Ft) JU L.£> w^ <: 

Prompt correction or with contract 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED? CJ^^ 

USAGE SHe Representative 

lis requested, 

XQOK , 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CiHNC FORM fl4fi (RBWSWQ 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE ANO EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

l ^ £•**• lUfif* 

DATE: TJME: 

11 SO 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
Q Q O l 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

"""Ml Quality Control 

CI Other <9^^ i *3 j 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

1 | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:-?-^ M M g . P C.L&^&P&iCZ, r Y T 

SOS<U CLAiTflK £A < W T £-4) to*Mi\*s 

Qft I^P^CTIP^/ nzrr / 
A h/OTM irslC Pet L-&LSS," — - f 

n Prompt correction or compliance with contract s&eofltcations is requested 

RiCI iPT ACKNOWLf DGiDi 

USAGE Site Representative 

Contractor's Reoreserrtathre 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 94a {Revised) 
I APR §6 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U,S, ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSV1LLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO: 

JJ5ft E-NV. 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 

DATE: 

25-SiM ^ 
PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

* s * , 0 Quality Control 

P Other • q^&t f 55 " 

SUBJECT JTEM(S) 

Q Work Plan 

f~1 Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION; - ! - ^ t A i ^ R P ( L l g A f t A l & r f ' . g A T 

4l"7q C L P ^ T Q H £ i fe.-'T) Pa^Ets ft 

A fiteTH/tJA fvaLJ^afa>s 
^ 

I Prompt correction or 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED^ 
Contractor's 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM §48 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
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t • A, ARMY EfcGMEERING AMD5Urrf»Ri CiMTCR, HUMWVP.LC I 

_ __ _# ^ E g O 

H-j j _ ~ * _ '»-~ f S i . V . ,_ 

"bow TRACT Mil"**-rT 

tU 

7-,. JU- . I 

SUBJECT ITFfe* 2) 
* • , , . , /T r ( ' h i s . 

iCheck ait ih;;! spnif,';: 
tkJ Gua':fy Coi.lrol jj 

'• \ '-'B'̂ iy Violation [ ! Other ( . 4 4 ^ "fSO I 

!_j Safety Comr.ffncs j 

l->' - b ^ . c k..i. f.M ? I--' J...--IQ) f<V->^d/i ' 

1 ' • - ' I T -
I _ -—-. A, 

m - i y *~ i>--, c • 

fe l jg" •-' ;S_ 

1 .,..'• r^'Xriut ccf.'*c,""1toj,i. J .• i"t;,ij.ioc6 wf'̂  contract spfcVy*tions 3̂ r&qire&i&d 

u - f - " ^—JL_ «, r ^> ^ 

Rt-. L , rY ACKNOWLeoeeT" 

USftuL J f PMfK.6,-,i3l . 

Contractor's Representative 

- i 

ACTION TAKEN: 

j. Cbh^;., :-
> "1 APri .! 

;= i'qpi,r<sedi 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: DATE: 

W MM #<2 
TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
ami 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

"P I Quality Control 
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: A A A c r e f\oT U c 4 < i « i 

• Other t -

cuV t?53 EnoMg<i Cur\%iV 1~0 W 1 O ^ I A < ? V 

•4v> fae.flftta DAV/>J. S T ' ^ ' J P o s s e t dL Q A 
' • / 

- / 

/ - - - —- js/oTH tAJb fo Ul-b<£& 

r~~i 
I 1 Prompt correction or compliance with contract contract sp€cifjcptions is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 

USACE Site Representative 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 ~ Contractor's Representative 



US ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO 

•!S.Al*u^..L> 

TIME. 

CONTRACT NUMBER-

i——•• )—I I IMH—i i—i iw i i i i i i i i i i mm—i—in" i II 

0 0 #: 

JLLLLX 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

r-u'ivv (•- i V C 

''Check -Vi *hat apply'; 

f a j Qualify ControJ 

f~] Other 
t ^ " ' s_ / _ 

SUBJECT ITEMfS) 

f j Work Plan 

j ^ j .,';ctv Vk,.,a/t:r. 

£_! i>afet> Comments 

DESCRIPTION: f7.c '-,, //«:•• - . >*i. ti>, ^ . s . . . 

'A.. k'r^ii-Kr '^-:',^i Pf /.„ .' , <^±U':*;*;•*, ;, ^AA^i-s ,-».uAJ 

-*L f J 

/ > • <. _ _ : > / . • f f „ , / " £ * . 1L,L t\£ 

Prorrsps r;-rrectton o r oumplarrr? with contujc; ^ i . v ',cr-t rvs is requested. 

- H i W W • V,,̂  
USAGE Srte Resr«se«i|»?ive 

::.Airaclor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN; 

CFHNC F O R M 55P (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COW" 1 - Contractor's mpmsmmim 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

USA ILt^y 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
open 

DATE: 

5* % <* 
TIMii 

1300 
— I I — — M i l II 

PROJECT LOCATION* 
f&rmm. C A W B w f t s i t ^ 

SMJ A*r. fslC 
(Check all that apply); 
" ^ Q Quality Control 

SUBJECT ITENKS) 
C I Work Plan 

|~| Safety Violation 

|~) Safety Comments rr*»|' 

DESCRIPTION^,. Q l ^ a c c f e x , fio^W ^ 

A a a c r e , p t i W t A i &Jr ^ 2 i E.n«ft_(U» 

W i a r g m a 4 ^ Hfc iaAker V ^ M T r y m r y fo*_vt. v .3 . 

f r y 1M <llCMg-o433L/ ifcr.nr 

7: NtiHitft) f&lla t^-S • 
Prompt cof rection tit with ooniract .lions is requested 

USACF Site 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 

J * 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC TORy 948 {Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 -ContoMtoffe ftepreaenMiv* 

ifcr.nr


U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNT5V1LLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO: 

i l& f \ \LtVx 

DATE: TIME; 

133 O 2JMLJ 
PROJECT LOCATION: CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DOfc 
O Q O ' l 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

O WofkPIan 

Q Safety Violation 

|~1 Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 1 L _ k U o * 

(Check all fiat apply): 

""^Q Quality Control 

• Other ^ A 

i i iu OL-ftUv. p < s S " S f c g tX -
• L, 

c^a h<,\o^»rxc« -Vo fer^dt, K 4 \ f r ^ l .Dixkv., 
J I iHtiiil 

Q <>J , n/ 

Prompt correction or compliance with oorrtmct s 

•SKMMSI^SwW^ .H-TKj 
USAGEJ 

to requssted. 

Q^4J 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. , ^c^SAgJc-S" 
Conbacfcir's 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM S48 (Rwtewfi 
| j APR 96 

COPY 1 - OeBti»ctor,$ Representative 

file:///LtVx


U.&ARMY i AND SUPPORT OBITER, HUNTSV1LLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO: 

{JS^ En* 

DATE: 

•LOCA1 

f IMfc* 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
OOO'l 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

OMTl v~Htr, fsj<_ 
SUBJECT ITEIKS) 
Qj Work Han 

j 1 Safefy Violation 

r*] Safety Comments 

DESCHIPTICft i r f lU f J h i^'t-Vj +mo Afm*,s f>AS$a,d 

ft 4 ^ c r c p l / ) T . 6 r iP jctt.ch.ai t x t SO^J t r t c n 

(Check all that apply): 
c5 Qualify Control 
• Ottter _ 

t; *~ <3 gj tiAtk^H Diikt.-^<a'>gr) g-nj TJ* OTh 

| 6 C d > T e J <^T 5 ^ 1 fcnon £ d ( t e a . 4 k H f Q a r k L 

- O i & r ^ . r J t A — - — — ~ - ""'J 

f^—— f%/® T T f I h$q f p L L Q cQ s, — I 
1 

a Prompt corrscHon or requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contactor's Fteptwertstwe 

ACTION TAKEN; 

CEHNC FORM 948 CftetfiSMf) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contactor's Representative 

jctt.ch.ai


U a AMI¥ BtGWEEIWI© ANP SUPPORT CENTER, HyNTSVtULE 
ORDNANCE AND iXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO; 

ns f t £»4v. 

DATE: 

15 ho,- Cl 
LOCA1 

P O O 

CONTRACT NUM8ER; 

DO#: 
QD£T? 

PROJECT LOCATION: 
Periwig. Cf^Mp Su/mEP-

(Cheek all that apply): 
" 0 Quality Control 
• Other 

SUiJECTITEIHS) 
Q Work Plan 

Q Safety Vkslafori 

\~\ Safety Cwimerrts 

OESCPUPTION:"~TK.L. i - t *Uo i ^ <\f -. t.vfo'v. tirf,<-^ <]t <^ 
^ 

C\xe\\V^ r\s<^.>v-ruw ^ v/\s .f) ,Atcav>'. ft X front 

yU-lr IQCCA^A e-t 4/? 5 L o o n fcj ^ j 6d f tnyrtc 

•Vo H d . - I ••>. K, na / hiCTH I r^ fi?//j to.-, —f 

• 
Prompt correction or 

spedfications is requested. 

USAGE Site Represantertw 

RiCilPT ACKNOWLEDGED: "i-'J^^^/ / /^ 

Cwilractor's Representative 
ACTION TAKEN; 

CBHNcroflM we (RwAwfl COPY 1 - Contractor's Represents*! 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING A W SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO: 

jj%4\ Et%y 

DATE: 

IgQCj 

PROJECT LOCATION; CONTRACT NyMlEW; 

DO#: 
d£?OT 

(Check ail that apply): 

j y ] Quality Control 

• Other 

I 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Wan 

O Safety Violation 

f~l Safety Comments 

DESCRiPTIONiTlife-. to \ t» ^ , L,,< 

^t 

JJ2--

D Prompt coracttan or piiange withLeontrt>c1 spec Is 

USAGE SHB 

ACKNOWLEDGED; 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

? !SS^T 0 H M M a < f t e v i s # d ) " COPY 1 - ContaMtort Represented 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER HUNTSV1LLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

nsft Lriv 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D O * 

P o o l 

DATES 

I If flf r a? 
PROJECT LOCATION: 

w r ^ , r t 
lS$ ^ ^ 

SUBJECT ITCIUS) 
Q Work Ran 

Q Safely Violation 

j | Safety Comments I . « J -

(Cheek all that apply): 

" ^ 0 Quality Control 

D Other 

Q u o ] L Vyi A^.SUL<- ^ y \ L e ^ i S i ? £C7V^O q l le2 » 
ft £ V ) J . » . . [ y t i \ ( ^ T o ? K i \ \ , J R o b b i e s * S L 

a n d T I t S trsor t^W %d b<Uo<j in^ -Vr, 
£.L-Vi,rsj O ' f t K f a L U f O i . / « 4 o T V U ^ G EaUftuJsS. 

_ Prompt eorwctioct or coinnojtanoe with contort adecSWcafions is requested. 

USAGE Sfte Ftepnwolattve 

Rapresentatwv 

ACTION TAKIM: 

CEHNC FORM 940 (Bsvlsad) 
1 APR 98 

COPY 1 - Contractor's 3eprese«Mi« 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO; 

USti Er4v 

DATE; 

1? hoc &% 

TIME: 

ftp! 
PROJECT LOCATION: CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 

M^L 
(Check all that apply): 

n Quality Control 

"S7! °ther — *P 

SUiJICT ITEIIff) 

Q Work Plan 

• Safety Violation 

} | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:! c h s ^ r v d U S - f t f c n v . ConcLr t . ' rK j 

c\ itCVc tnvt,,rfc.iv of Ji* explosive / j ^ Q j i ^ c 

thrt itiLJ'rtit¥j, Mil t < J j k a - c i w u i O.CC limited for. 

1 inyu-'f-f-i d jiix. rnaCCL-^tHt,<JtrJ4y&y,-\* u r r ^ 

^U^L _yj V' 
& 

9 Prompt correction or eomptence wilh contract specMicstlons Is requested. 

USACE Site Representative 
• * ' ^ -

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
Coriractor"s Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

ca-wc FORM %m (R«HS«O 
1 APH SFB 

COPY 1 ~ contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY • AND SUPPORT CENTER, MUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO: 

tJSA Ei4y 

DATE: TIMI: 

U5& 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D O * 
QO 0 7 

PROJECT LOCATION; 

(Check all IMt apply): 

" " f i l Qualify Control 

Q Other frj€d 9 f f * / O 

SUBJECT ITEM{S) 
• Work Plan 

I j Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: T U & ffti- ' i-OVOihAfe ftgj£ft PftS>$€ t> 

ft C fee Pi-OT L g r . o J r e J aH- 4 1 4 3 M a f t i f t H fa 

ftEu^M^ T& K i C H & f t L - ¥\PMQut^ (un^l-lYj fit 

D Pnompl correeflon or 

RECEIPT ACKIWWLEDaiOi. ^^^jjS^t^^ 
Contractor's 

ACT10M TAKEN: 

C6HNC POflM 948 (Ftevtesd) 
1 APR 86 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Represents!TO 



US, ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

USA fc.KiM. 

DATE: 

k» A or £ft 

TIME: 

PROJECT L O G X T O N : r 

f-£jRrr\eP, CcVmp B « * V H € I K > 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DOt: 
QD07 

SUBJECT fTE«C6) 

LJ WotkPlan 

P I Safety Violation 

1~1 Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTIQN:~THti Y i 

(Check all (hat apply): 

"f^l Quality Control 

• Other f ^ V j # fl 

^ 

a 
Prompt correction or compliance 

with SKA specifications is 

USAGE Site 
S2kJ , ^ „ 

.X.^agSafi—C'.JL,^ 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

C6HNC FORM 9>« (Rafted) 
1 APR g8 

COPY i - Contractor1*' R6pre&ant$tfv9 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER. HUNTSVLLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

Jb^UJ JUL. 

DATE: 

-4-
JATK 

TIME: 

.o*fot> 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

OIJJWtwflilPin|^'i|ii!!aWjW"t*MI>w«M)lWftailWMWWWi»^wi 

DO#; 
OOfrl 

PROJECT LOCATION; 

i\e,f 

SUBJECT fTEM(8) 
O We* Plan 
f~ l Safety Violation 

n Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:-^ . ^ ^ ^ , W p t ^ O ; 

{Check all that appiy): 
l~l Quality Cootwl 

,tiif-.i^.t.Lft'> & 

fg f t f c^ t .A i n < i ^ ^ W v ^ - A 1 ^ 3 3 - \ b s ^ ^ g , IV\h **^?> 

OSiJi ^ J . . T i Cv \ockaA CtviST <Vft<\-M T V y refers, 4o 4 > .• 

Prompt correction or opmpManc*̂ with contract spechlications is requested. 

BiCflPT ACKNOWUEKliO-^iis^ 

USAGE SJIB ReprasBnlattva 

Contractor's Rapresentalive 

AeTJON-TAtCENt-QJh 

/ _ _ _ _ - - A r ' c T H i A f t F o i , c 6 « 5 - _ J _ _ ^ 

CEHNC FORM «4fl (Review*) 
1 APfise 

C O * Contract.'1'e -cw.ienr-w 

US. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVIUJB 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

_L££ fc"Y 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
AC-

DATE: TIME: 

i c r '••;•: 

PROJECT LOCATION: , 

^ T r u y , N , , C 
(Check all that appiy): 
" " 0 Quality Control 

• Other q+S* 13 

SUBJECT fTEM(S) 

[~] Work Plan 

|~ l Safety Violate 

[ 3 Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: Tr-\ C. V r u ^ ^ v-O. ^ C-, 3. K > i, .-. -, 

•^ T I C Mc?rjQ>k I U d W i V t ~ J 5 J W U v ^ y n a 

A A/C r H / A; 4 ^ , i1 rt u : • -* — : . / 

[ I prompt correction or compliance with contract sfteclfieatlons is requested 

tiarftjfta- £ 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 

USAGE Site Representative 

Contractor's RepresanlHUw 

ACTION TAKEN; 

CEHNC FORM 948 {FteviS«l> 
1 APR 06 

• U H '• ;-~Mi « ; ! ' 

file:///ockaA


UM. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT C O I T S t HUNTSWilJlE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

USf l £ ^ V t 

DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

\ W P T - 0 4 - T > -
DO#: 

oocn 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check a!! that apply): 

* ^ 0 Quality Control 

• Other °m&* Z 6 

SUBJECT !TEM(S) 

Q Work Plan 

[ " I Safety Violation 

f~*] Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: A \i*AG Q-<LX<L CLV"^(V W c d - f c J 

o A 4 r 7 ' 5 i twsRxRH R\> C u n V H - t f l &*yj 

&. U^r \Cfe & A t n S f c d i . a n . / - r / 
/ - tieTtitNt* fot-Mnofr ; / 

n Prompt corraetton or compliance with contract spssffications is requested, 

USAGE SHe Hepreseniaiive 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED ,{^M£/J-^*^^£~^--
Corrtractor's Rapre&entalive 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 Iftwises!) 
1 APRSi 

OOPYi^Con«»oiPi^f!tafNttMiwillw».. 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

_*£. )Sft Ej4vJ, 

DATE: TIME: 

M ffung. f>gf 1QQ6 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
OD07 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

FOOTER CAMP 6-UTMEJCL 

Burner . ^C» 
(Check all that apply): 

***"«5!] Quality Control 
other q4S^«^2> 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 
I | Safety Violation 
| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: T W hANvRP C L E f r R f t ^ C g 

^ 
-A/WV ̂ _ /^>LJ-OiOjg-- -J 

Prompt correction or ice with contrac/aMfcifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED^^ 

USACE Site Representative 

^;</ /i^^^kL 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 



US. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORfT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AMD EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO; 

USA E^S/, 

DATE: 

5 Km, eg luor> 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
aocn 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Cheek alt that apply}: 

"""IS] Quality Control 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

Q Work Plan 

(~| Safety Vioialion 

r i Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: T U g . KAJAtLP A f € f l L W a k A o J T 

blOl T ^ U f r i ^ QwufinPBG, QX f l l n f T l~T*\ 

Zn A/crfh;^ folfgcos / 

i — § 

I I Prompt correction or compliance with contract 

ACKNOWLEDGED:, 
(wtatctrfsltapHMefilaltve 

ACTION TAICIN; 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 9S 

C 0 F V 1 -



US. MWY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO: 

USft E»4^t 

DATE.: 

14 Ut^ 6% \Mh 
CONTRACT NUWBiBt 

D O * 
g o a l 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUB JECT UEM(S) 
• Work Plan 
Q Safely Violation 
[ j [ Safety Qanviwrts 

(Check all that apply): 
* ^ 0 Quality Control 

• Other «^4®* 1*7 

piaT W c eg- ea 6.T 

£ 
llllplll" ••••"• rl ft.*4 Afl.aicy%q.y.e,A U r ^ t \ ~ 4 . 7 -"J r T j . T- . w. . = — . 1 

=1 
Prompt correction or compliance with contract 

USAGE Site 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:, 
TrjlCi^tM^n-^tmrntwi U J U _ J X - I • 

Contractor's 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC F O B i 948 (Revised) 
1APR§§ COPY 1 - Contractor's Representetwe 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

•Hfift £ ^ 

DATE: TIME: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

Burner. ^ ^ 

CONTRACT MUMBEH; 

DO#: 
OOP I 

SUBJECT fTEM(5) 
• Work Plan 

j j Safety Violation 

|~~1 Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:/? -tuMs ri.rre. fL~t loCo-Tvi A T 

(Check all that apply): 
~~@ Quality Control 

Q Other <H8** /4 

-jrW t-Qltei^trq Ucajton f$f&triL &* 

j£^*{.dth.'''V\ fallow* — 
^ 

n Prompt corresctian or compliance with contract 

> t - < ^ f V C 
USAGE Site Representative 

R ECEIPT AC KNOWLEDG ED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (OtvtodJ 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 -Contractor's Representatrve 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVfLLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

US'/) £ nv. 
DATE: 

<g A^fty ^ g 

TIME? 

| 5 CJCJ 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

wquDy-oy-fr-aa&fc 
DO#: 

OOP 7 

PROJECT LOCATlOlt 

rn&r, A / C „ 
(Check all ttiat apply): 

^Q] Quality Control 

• Other f ^ f i # /£ " * 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

[~~1 Safety Violation 

j 1 Safety Comments 

DESCRlPTIONrTT^. ^//ooJ>iAa T lpe? 4Cirv. j f f / t fT 

o UJ/ fthln H re^_ " r ha-ne, c. Lv i n i Q.n*j c. ^ 
Z<zA> taU r> ce "Pes ^ ntf^ioft i .5 U n ' . t I - fe 

4 
Prompt correction or compliance witlT^oqiract specifications is requested. 

4^%£- "~yU Ĝfc 

BiCllPT ACKNOWLEDGED;. 

USACE Site Representative 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN; 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APnse 

GOpV : - Contractors Representative 



us. ARM¥ BMrnmsmm mm SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
©ROMANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

[ )S ft j j . K^V 

DATE: 

17 Jufre, Q& X^m 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D O * 

^ 0 0 1 

PfWWlCT LOCATION: 

f e f m & R C A M P Ou. \v \e f 

SUBJECT rTEM(S) 

Q Work Plan 

{~1 Safety Violation 

f~] Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: ~TY»< t V \ ^ \ R P C l ^ f t x o c g 

(Check ill mat apply): 
*"-£] Quality Control 

0 ot^r q4^« 2,5-

oc 
1 

^Af'uru\ V-^ au,-̂  (Q'734 XaofttA CU^/bf l i 

& i C . u K r V \ - j ) . / - A i d ^ . n e J F O L L ^ O S / — — / 

Prompt correction or ctton or^rtnlancB wWi contra 

/ USAGE! 

is requested. 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM S4S (Revlsad) 
1 ARR88 

COPY 1 - Cmtrmpr*?, ^prmmMlm 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER HUNTSVULE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO; 

0 3 J \ I M , 

DATE: 

Mm*CSL 
ICAftQN: 

\£OD 
CONTRACT NUMBER; 

0 0 * 
©00 1 

PROJECT L0CA1 
FefHwEft, C m ? 6ucr*l£.R. 

o**Tir*err.. *4C 
SUBJECT !TEM(S) 
• Work Plan 
n Safety Violation 
P I Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: ft*4 

(Check all that apply): 
"-CO Quality Control 

• Other q^<g& H 

:A*4^ cKr«,ô  ayy,r T ^ O ogres 
otr^ U C J A ^ J aA~ 471% Ts l rm^ Qfvu^K 

fellow 
**VS ¥"*%* \-£m f ^ n 

as. —/ 

j I Prompt correction is requested. 

USACfi Sfle ftepresenfatiw 

ACTION TAKEN; 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



US. AfWIY E N O U G H ! * ! AM> SUPPORT CENTS!, WWTBWJ-E 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO: 

IMP* Et4V. 

DATE: 

OCATION: 
f%60 

CONTRACT NUMBER; 

D0#: ofetn 

PROJECT LOCAL _ ... 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
[~1 Work Plan 
Q Safety Violation 

P I Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: T h e 

(Check all that apply): 
""fTI Qualify Control 

• Other ' f | 4 @ ^ | 4 

Mi (?v*\ "\U3Q f\c^L P l o V 

Sits A. tLrvtct^ 

C - f r y \*M 1 j ffe£ u^gnr ^*W.<»^ rwOrKM^: U' I to, 

7 
I Prompt correction or compliance with contract 

»L«r -g •HiiiMrfl, 

is requested. 

USAGE Site Representative 

ACKfWWUEBQED:. . , J_: • - v i V ^ - ' ^ / ^ ^ € C -"'L ~-
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN; 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's. Representative 



U.S. ARMY E PEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

OQD"7 1 9 C> 2^Ur, >l/C 
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I I Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 7 Z * •/%? / / £ 

(Check all that apply): 

0 Quality Control 

• Other 

£>6sJ//7.<!f ±U. Jj£ / / ? .Ofr-<^&-

Prompt correction or compliance 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

L. 

U.S. ARSWY ENGINEERBNG A N D SUPPORT CENTER, HUNT ILL 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

DATE: TO 
if S'/\ E 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

ITBW1E: 

DO#: 
c>6o7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

0 Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 7~n* ^ J A M U ^ ^ < | r i ( j ^ \f\ (Krst ;*. DESCRIPTION: < fT-^ " " i / o u ^ f i ^ <^, f - ld-5 in. r M <c <3̂  

<-Ud<- AyA3,MAKS.BZm , B4, 

I 
flS.cW/Csffi^A.t)^/ 

Prompt correction or cgmpliaTicewitn contract spfeifi6aJions4§ requested. 

K X /)-49Khk-*juLJ>*? 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 



U.S. ARMY £ PEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

y^AE 
DATE: J TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER 

Wy/i 
DO#: 

;/2bY-&/~D~<!}&A& 

OOOl 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

fner yVC 
(Check all that apply): 

R 1 Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

| j Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:??/? £>J}t7ijs>*~ ._ ...._. CS.Y'i X Ai h.2 '3S,a 0i<*i~ 

z 
-/A.KIT^,,^, PQ ff&u^fT-

u 
Prompt correction or cbmpliance \ «rfh/c 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 

requested. 

Contractor's 'Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENG8NEER1NG AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUP 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

USAE O 

DATE: 

Y-A3-0 7 
TIME: 

CONTRACT 

SUBJECT ITERfl(S) 

• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: '7%e ~fb //& 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

0 Quality Control 

• Other 

rJr /SS2.£r«SL 

/- ~/f\/otfot*•?<* fry/U<jj!?/ zot 

Prompt correction or compliance ywttv'cont ins is/requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY B, .MEER8NG AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSV1LLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER 

DO#: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

OOOT [ £f? Sciisr., A/C 
SUBJECT !TEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:"^ ^ ~fo Ij&£*,**<? 

(Check all that apply): 
IXl Quality Control 
• Other 

f 
y <<%£ A "> / ^ ^ 

]1¥: A t>4& *&&?? tn. t>%fcd¥ dz £ V? 
At>ga 4 D#/c3 J> A ^ / V 

•Z-S— V 

^ - V L ^ t 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HU 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
DATE: TO 

USAE 2-Z7-&~( 
TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: I PROJECT LOCATION: 
W ^ & Y - o y - D - O t f o ^ | Former 

DO#: 
<0 00'T Cp TBjfn^MC 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
[~1 Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: "7?t f fof
l(ouj>;„ 

(Check all that apply): 
j>s| Quality Control 
• Other 

~JV-< J'S /.<.-? V<s -fragyg-

Hh&L'. A\!A2 A3./4V 31. 69a\bl: 

A 2.A'~3 02.1)3. M. Bt W t 5 / :/. 

1 -/A/ojiu^ &l/c^> / • „y 
V 

I i Prompt correction or compliance \withycontrafcfsoeic1|)Qations is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY & . JNEERING AMD SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVJLLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

" TIME: TO: 

USAt 
DATE: 

)llO 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
0 0{5'7-

SUBJECT ITEIUl(S) 

• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

• Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: "7/ts -he> Uo<jJm 

PROJECT LOCATION: 
f o r m e r 

Cp- 'Bl/Tner^MC 
•t> 

(Check all that apply): 

IX l Quality Control 

• Other 

ttem A X^.3. 
y "2srsui&, 

7 Z '"P/Zw/yS firs (IS) Lett) 
*& 

n Prompt correction or 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 

ationsjs-retiuested. 

* Q * v 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUI 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

DATE: TO: 

<j 3-2. &•-•&*? 

DO#: 
aaaT 

J73V5 

CONTRACT NUMBER: j PROJECT LOCATION: 

<f Odfn net 
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: v%*? 

(Check all that apply): 

I2 I Quality Control 

• Other 

>1L 01 / <S>t*fmC* *3> ycrds /J?,-*& iHvli&&J 
dT7\ 

"cl n is <v (i.Ty /3 ̂ • j ' o i - s ^ - e cT <fr JU&, A**l. 4 hi 

C //J&fhxn^ f<* I{<*<*>?-/' Jr~ 

Prompt correction 

U > 3 0 S 1 * 1 * * * * . C * * f e 4 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

Contractor's Representative 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY I JNEERINQ AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AMD EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

USAE DATE: [ TSME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 0€>07" 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 
13 Quality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I I Safety Violation 

f~] Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:!"^ '£>/&+*,„- %rJ< ,* A 

2= A/0fih*&f&/A>i*e>* /^ 

Prompt correction or compliance witl 

( 0 3 0 ? / s f c * H O f r * * - * * 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUP 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 
W9m>r- QH-o-o<x><c p^r 
DO#: 

a 6 6 ( 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

'«>t<5.*-' 

(— p - Qit-iYt n<iz<c <c 
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 

(Check all that apply): 
P([ Quality Control 
• Other 

L,iX>IT> i s 1 a A 

7T~ r_ , r-i( fs 1 n ? I^c; c r / ' ,_ i cr - r cUc t r ; £15,01 tQ2tBS.BCi^ £ T 
7 W e f J i t n ^ rB-fi'otaAs/' / 

I I Prompt correction o&dompliance)wiHi coi 

Ci30 5 iS/WW-i C**rt! 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED; 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY i.... JNEER8NG AND SUPPORT CESSER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

C/SAE 
CONTRACT NUMBER: PROJECT LOCATION: 
w y / ^ p y - &y~br&>eA ^ p ^ t ^ 
DQ#: gz&ez'Y C^cr/, /ouyn&r 

(Check all that apply): 
Pfl Quality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I I Safety Violation 

I 1 Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: TJ'A -fe> J\i't> CJWI r>, 

A W A 4-D 
r M $ , **? 

3,*5 «gr*/ r ^ < r ^ <r X W >£ f / ^ V / ^ I V . A ^ 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

^ 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, I 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

)LLE 

TO: 

USA E 
PROJECT LOCATK 

—u 

/3u/htt-i r ./ c 
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

| [ Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: T%^ f& I'* 

(Check all that apply): 
J2J Quality Control 
• Other 

<? t^ari* •*• i.y?2 f O 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY t JNEER5NG AMD SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSV1LLI 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

USAE DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: . 

D0#: 0O07 
(Check all that apply): 

Quality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

j 1 Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: T%& £&!(<$ 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

£3 v*$& 
>«.! A 4 - , / -

'£fth***9 F&lloi&sr' 

Prompt correction or compliance • 
fe^dS lSHHr>A C** * ,& 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 

ACTION TAKEN: 

Contractor's Representative 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNt 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

:iLLE 

TO: 

U SAB 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
66^7 

DATE: 

3-?3'©7 
TIME: 

\T3o 
PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
f~| Work Plan 

| j Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: T £ i A 'foiUi^i 

(Check all that apply): 
[§[ Quality Control 
• Other 

«*-6 

tt 
rids tfi rire?S; Ai 

J~2 Aid. £• 3* /" 

•©= 

/-—^MdtUt** FZlL^f-
\ \ 
•? 

D Prompt correction or compliance 

(o305 ***** c**Prt 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 

\ OsjACE Site (Representative 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



|U.S.AFSMY( |INE£RING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVSLLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: DATE: S TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: | PROJECT LOCATION: 

DO#: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: "7~"he. 

OOP 7 
(Check all that apply): 

M Quality Control 

Other 

fa^e^T 
-f^f X <*• -f £?/s.£ 

7*z 

^ 

f\^triroritrac1r^WicS<Sns^e^uite&. Prompt correcti :ion or compliano 

E/9ite Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN 

L 

? APRC96 ° R M 948 (Rev ised) COPY 1 • Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUI ^ILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
" TIME: 

S CfXof U Q7 £*~ v/. 
DATE: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 
/J* 

DO# 

££f'7 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: V A < <pr^n *yfy g-h L 3 / ( i ^ ^ h a 

L'*• M_)'^
7$ lit't4.es , A^ C—• 

(ChecK all that apply): 

JX] Quality Control 

• Other 

r.Y y 
% • / 

#d/ / 

H 
t~/la^— 

I I Prompt correction or compliance witf? cofiifract'specificaHbns is requested. 

USACE Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: .SftU Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

? f Sn^ft O R M 948 <Revised) COPY 1 - Contractors Representative 
I n r n y o 

t4.es


U.S. ARMY i" )INEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSV1LLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

fcAX of CAT/? F~u , 
HUJLMMIIMU.M..JI.MHli.LXI.III-1-i 1L-L.1.II, | .ffffff M - B W — . . .. m. i .^ i • „ . • . « . - , , . , j , ^ 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 

DATE: TIME: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 
Pa -" ***- *~"^ 

OOol 
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: "fk 

A/c-
— —nrm iiiiniiiiiTiiiiiiiiiii inHIIITTTII m i mini i injuuim inn m i 

(Check all that apply): 

|X] Quality Control 

• Other 

« i 

U,4-&^T-

tx X^UAM /LZ*^— 
pliance with contract spec • Prompt correction or com ecifications is requested. 

»vtlS#CE/Bite Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 

ACTION TAKEN: J T W * - co^4*<J*i *• /o% Q4 im/cCt^ 

/ £ A i 4 * f - f - « r~/ 

?APR96 ° R M 948 (Rev ised) COPY 1 - Corrtraetafs Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGBNEER1NG AND SUPPORT CEMTER, HUI YSLLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP V '' 

MEMO 
TO: 

QJYOS UP? £^y 

DATE: 

«26 fe^C>7 

TIME: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 7 " X < 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

c_ 
(Check all that apply): 

121 Quality Control 

• Other 

p/o/'•ir/-~l~y *-T / Cy^J l,x-h.is-* 

+ T OA A -/1^-hX^Jh 

ACTION TAKEN: j'S U** c a - - d ^ / < , c / ^ / O % GPs? 

? APRC96 ° R M 948 (Revised) COPY 1 • CoRtraGtofs Representative 



U.S. ARMY, SNEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSV11LE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: I DATE: 

SlA XoS Us~4t En * WF4#7 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: _ 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

[ | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: / h 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 
R f Quality Control 
• Other 

4^-
o**Y+y < / - 7<$23 XJrLa <u^_ 

Qrt* /- 7 L*sj-J*k *.>**£ TL —f 
1/ 

/<L&S)AJLsiK 

Prompt correction or compliance witn contract^pecificafions is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: f Q > U ^ / L y ^ A A J ^ ^ 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: ^ A - * ^ OD-U<L«/»«L 4_ / o % Qfl&yedfa* 

£ f ^-U *.****• f>'o ftp?* A/9/V\EC ip« • * « . / , / — — / 

flpR^e ° R M 948 (Revised) COPY 1 • Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

S&XOS U?A £u*J 
DATE: 

l££F*J>C7 

TIME: 

\02do 
| CONTRACT NUMBER: PROJECT LOCATION: 

•"•""""• " "'"' ' " * • » ' "̂ "'«l £?£*- M.O' ^G^p&ljf'A**-1' 

B^-M-* 'n*^«j AJQ_ 
(Check all that apply): 

"JQ Quality Control 
Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: " " / "X i s . & V*JZJSL, j & i r d ' u ^ c L j-k-tt-

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 

uested. • 
Prompt correction or compl ia i rce^i f l i^o^f^t^p^cTf lcal ior^ i^^^e^e 

iJ^S^Site Representative 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN 
ur^V dftjen £«-*£-

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

file:///02do


U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

us4e 
DATE: 

& b4607 
TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
TD^B^l 

PROJECT LOCATION: , 

'Bidder /0<L 
SUBJECT ITEMfS) 

n Work Plan 

f l Safety Violation 

n Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:-^^ 

(Check all that apply): 

Jg§ Quality Control 

• Other 

yA/d6/£»/ff J&^i 

Hfl.5 passed a Goner* rrtaJT Qu*£Af O&uinniOt 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

ler\ 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 

r 

Contractor's Representative 
ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY t - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

usA-e 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

i^iL 
DO#: -f0^<oo1 

PROJECT LOCATION:^ , 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

f l Safety Violation 

n Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: ~72k> 

(Check all that apply): 

Quality Control 

Other 

lOpc 

8 
//</ tdfh/ii'^Jas te/j 

1 
SJaLi^ ipSUmUf. cJ te£ t*j U* &Lir*JC* 
arms uLdi£J( *>*) <tfe a.4*tLJrtap i -m^f 

CJmnd t jLaJLJUOtaP 

n Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED; 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractors Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSV1LLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

t^^g" 
DATE: 

IIP*, 07 
TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
TV-4-ceel 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

^ Quality Control 

\ \ Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

f~l Safety Violation 

n Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: T ^ ftXfiA* ^ J r C J t S 4tA'/ 

l/Q W£ PJ»/>s*Air* area tdsJ&QeJ c^ \Ue *4"L^{ 

map- - f a V ^m fim,eA: Jt, 6j2S~^df> 

L J Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. tance witn contra 

^ U S A G E 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: .ZZZL 
Site Representative 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

?fS&fORM 9m <Revis*» COPY 1 - Contractors Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

US-AB 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D O * : To^mn 

PROJECT LOCATjQN: 

%4iJ4tt A/t 

(Check all that apply): 

j P Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

• Safety Violation 

f l Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:^ ^ / T y X ^ JuA&A a<; 4&3< 

t*J M* C^tat+i*-* /?/>* ,Ja*£fu*( ^ Pi* 

I 1 Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

' J USAGE! USAGE Site Representative 

RECEIPT A C K N O W L E D G E D ; ! ^ , 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



US. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO*: 
-TD&0OC7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

"Former- Cdm/> /Sffivvi 

(Check all that apply): 
j f f i Qualify Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

f"l Safety Violation 

[~1 Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: ike fCCpiA^ tihWi £ * * / * « V ^ 

ttrStftftr/ i&& p t f S . W t f Covtnp'/niMt' 

^tfft^tte^gygg fAfcL ^ foe cXumwt— 

• 
Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

^ I y&wSteRenMawtBliYfl, ... A s <• 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

US, ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

US4& 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
"T"©***-CJUC5 "7 

PROJECT LOCATION: , 

(Check all mat apply): 
0 3 Qualify Control 
M Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
f~l Work Plan 

i~] Safety Violation 

n Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: *th flnf*>L dJ>*Jas l/CS:/*»*-( 

4ftif> r TB4J arm okuJt ?.fyZL/%&-

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested 

USAGE Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

u$4e 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO #: 
-Tb^CCol 

PROJECT LOCATION:. 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

f~] Safety Violation 

n Safety Commante 

DESCRIPTION: ~~!%& 

(Check all that apply): 

[ 3 Quality Control 

f hf/cu.1. JnatpJAT 4o$Z 

i>H Vpifi. CV-Wf ,A>y Ag?ggr? £ */7>fl I t W a & s s 

A3 fc) 6?7^3^, toff til W^?-239 

D Prompt correction or compliance * jjfications is requested. 

r ' USA(£^RepnK»rrtative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
r*s Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



us. ARMY mtm^mm AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVIUJE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

us^, PMV 

DATE: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

TIME:. 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

to gain -M-TwaoU 
0 0 #: 

0 0 O 7 

f \€ f 

SUBJECT ITEMfS) 

• Wei* Plan 
O Safety Violation 

P I Safely Comments 

DESCRIPTION:TKC. f o l l o w . m "ViQO A c f T , P U T 

(Check all that apply): 

"~pT] Quality Contra! 

• Other r H ^ | ^ 

fay*A 

^ c - ^ . / - — — — • • / 

/ fi/ctkfn folio *~Cii> 7 

Prompt correction or tone© with mn i r ^ j speeffieaBons is wquested. 

ISG^,-. -h^BLtAJt^^. 

USAGE SilG Repfesen.ialive 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. ^ 
<• j - h f t i ' 

iL-L 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

C-EHNC FOAM S48 CRwteai) 
1 APfl 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's I ' ^ s i G , 



J U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSViLLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: DATE: I TAME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
To^OCOl 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check ail that apply): 

[ j | Quality Control 

Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

J>0 Work Plan 

|~] Safety Violation 

f~1 Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:^J ttiPpup, J-ffpsyiK £~/6JCCAAJ 

spo 

I I Prompt correction or corrpiance wjth ( •r<aficatipns is requested. 

RECEIPTACKNOWLED 

USACE Site Representative 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

fCEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY i - Contractor's Representative 

ZO f *he+ 
200 /JOA e I 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

US*r£ 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO*: 
T&4hm7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT iTEM{S) 
• Work Plan 
f l Safety Violation 
f~| Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:*-/^ MhJtmt* 

(Check all that apply): 
P3 Quality Control 
n Other 

V^W 
a 6oim *>«*&" fkbJ/i & dc<brt*urr rtAttk /9 c 

arm rJ+**mti tf.OCL sr~// 

• Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 

, USACt Site Representative 

t-ee~s 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

t/LS-fC 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO*: 
TO^aeO^ 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 
@ Quality Control 
M Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

• Safety Violation 

f l Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:^ (imp,At* t d i J , ^ as */&! 

faeH.imyet (lUrlw i*) 44iO r wviradt* fi>(?<\ 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

USACE Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

'Vt^Ae 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
TT^o©o7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

J@ Quality Control 

D Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

• Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTIONf-f^ - Q k j / A M p n y i r ^ ,' 46 GfkAjarm. 

LrtJ*.tt fit <//¥? &. S&^&teLJ. A^ ptss«j£t„ 

C\*nxak% g*3* Ok// 

• 
Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

USACE Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

ICEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY SNEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

C/SAE 
DATE: 

©"Z-J 5 - O t 

TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
<^3^o7" 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

[ 3 Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I I Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPT ION:^ < - f o l \ Q c o t n g S , f i a L A c ^ - v J U 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 

ACTION TAKEN 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

i ) ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVIL 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

L/SAE 
DATE: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: | PROJECT LOCATION 

TIME: 

W 4 ('Z.p V - t? V -£) -toga & 

DO#: o a a'7 
Cj<3. lou/rt^r( r KfC 

(Check all that apply): 

[ 0 Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

| j Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: Th& T&lt<X*S(t>c> 5 lj& lA vrrtzr 

ua 

T 

A I # 

/ ^ o l t r t v * Fo-//c egyjp *£ 

Prompt correction or complianca 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 

USACE'Slfe Representative 

2i 
Contractor's Representative 

y 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 

77 



U.S. ARIVT GiNEERiNG AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

USAE 
DATE: TIME: 

1<US 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO #: _ ^ «~~» 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

33 Safety Violation 

"~~ Safety Comments 

(Check all that apply): 
03 Quality Control y 

1 1 - — J — " • • * " 

DESCRIPTION: The, « fc 11 o u> t t><3 S f f g 1A Q t s<j g 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - contractor11 

.mWN ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVIK 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEfyiO 

_ ^ 

TO: 

(J 5 A E 
DATE: 
e 2 - t 3 -CSfc 

TIME: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

r _ _ _ _ , ^ 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

r~) Safety Violation 

I j Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 7 % e Toll*. 

(Check all that apply): 
jX} Quality Control 

Other 

<s ttj/ JX< S,J<lA •tTllJ 
L • S U A - S?.J&£ 

# y/-&2-3 Wf l f - fore . t & £ b 3 i 

-m^i,;„ili.'.ti^sgft.w..M,^„.fc,ll.,..-w i.fliK.„,^^„.,]CT-.. ls»*~*~..ff. 

Z W & f T> V fft././ftlk,g,g/ 

f—1 ^<^"" 
I I Prompt correction or c»rftplianc^y|*fh coMflct .foafcfljGations is /equested. 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Represent 
1 APR 96 



U.S.ARMY 3INEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

USAE 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: ___ 

DATE: TIME: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

• Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

(Check all that apply): 

Q3 Quality Control 

• Other y 
DESCRIPTION:7~fc> £>>U<.imj SYfc. l A q r f ^ 

W-EW. 

D Prompt correction or compliance 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 

USACE Site Representative 

Contractors Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 

! ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVIL 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

l /SAE 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: I PROJECT LOCATION: 

D0#: d o o T » ' > 
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:"!^ -fat l<*u*x 

(Check all that apply): 

E§ Quality Control 

• Other 

=f 
S iTg / A «air*<i 

* 

Prompt correction or compliance 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARM\ 3INEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

USAE 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: ooo7 

DATE: TIME: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

net, Cp>"EuW^ AJC 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

• Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:Tie. £<£>lUt*j>it* 

(Check all that apply): 
S3 Quality Control 
• Other 

— % St-f« M ^ W * 
°ck: 

• Prompt correction or complianceWth cpnti 

USACE Sit̂ jRepresentative 
C X l L ^ * ^ Q f t ^ 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVII/ 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 
LJ-S/Sti 

DATE: J TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 
V A ? 12j)Y-<S »/- D - OOP & 

DO#: 
oooT 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 7%. g /to??* 

(Check all that apply): 
| 2 Quality Control 
• Other 

Guzvn StTe IA ^ f-tJ: 

Hi-Ark *nJ'Ht-c-zv h 
3 *.ru CSv*rr»cA*c: ssh 

I 7Akftuxw- ^ ( / e t ^ r j r ̂ = 7 
^ 

Prompt correction or compliance with cqntraeCs3el}jfirations if requested. 

Si 
RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 

ACTION TAKEN: 



rs S. ARWT\ 3INEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

USf\E 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
O D O 7 

SUBJECT 1TEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I I Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DATE: 
2 - o T - CXi 

TIME: 

' / S o 
PROJECT LOCATION: 

£i- 9>;&,7fe*er A/C 

(Check all that apply): 

| > J Quality Control 

• Other y 
DESCRIPTION:7%& F&IL^rr.^ S i t e I A flM^ 

2-:Z?25 ^ n ' 
k 

* 

• 
Prompt correction 

ore 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 

ACTION TAKEN: 

USACE Site Representative 

Contractor's Representative 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 r 

_ J 

w . ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVI! 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

(JSAE 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

W9/2 \ft- otf- fr -oaok 
DO#: 

OQQT 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

(Check all that apply): 

£ 5 Quality Control 

• Other 

DESCRIPTION: TJ& fi>fLt*»iin& Site IA Q r t 4<j 
^ ^ p a s •S^.^/ A 9 ^ a / f T y 5-S S~L3 r Z?rare c L 

? 
S±& 

7 

'• Prompt correction or eg 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 



U.S.ARM\ 3INEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

USAE 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
O O O T 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I I Safety Violation 

| 1 Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 1 7 t g fg\{& 

(Check all that apply): 
13 Quality Control 
• Other 

faat 

i. it & 
Sift 1A q^J W -̂» <* ? 

^ssaranc. 

h T^Jkt^q Tg/ f^cos/" 
¥ =3 

is/requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

I CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
I I APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

; ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVIU 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
" DATE: | TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: I PROJECT LOCATION: 
W f r Z Q Y - o y - p -ao&d C p Butn*T A / C 
DO#: Z I ' ' 

oao7 
(Check all that apply): 

5 J Quality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

|~~| Safety Violation 

( | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: \ ^.f^L 1A cmis 
f e rn -7 

J. % 
*-n«——»J " T ; — i j -

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 



U.S. ARMY! SINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

cf£A£ 
DATE: TIME: 

l 4 2 o 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 
W " 7 / Z D Y ~ Q 7 ~ P ~ O < 3 P 6 
DO#: oao y 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

Cf> Butne.r, A/C 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

I 1 Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: ~Tk*. -fj} //& 

(Check all that apply): 

[ 3 Quality Control 

• Other 

wm Sl f« JA QnJc 19 Crtl* 1M, Q 

V\2-Lr& MS. p2-<? s^ J sdt i 
£ 
Ar\-C±T a n j 4f-H2£/ 

£ £ S t A r a . f t £ g C ka 

7 Kjofh >r><? IZ[(<*** ̂  /-
$ 

) ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVIli 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

USAE 
DATE: 1 TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
O0O7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: The Tall&t^\n<f Stle. 1A 

(Check all that apply): 

153 Quality Control 

• Other 

r1 i 

2 /f\kf kin g J^lUujg / -

D Prompt correction or compj 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 

X USACE- îte Representative 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 



U.S. ARM\ 3INEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

USAE 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
00Q7 

DATE: TIME: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 
0 . Quality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: TU <£ f k I U M J t «ya 5/f<£ 1 A ^ n i qn<? 

l - A 2 ^ ' I y"Nc,1h»»,q g l i o m a / - - 7 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 8 

USACE Si(e Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 

}. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVIl̂  
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

u^^e 
DATE: TIME: 

\030 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

OOOY 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| j Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 7 7 L f z > J k > ^ . ™ » Site. l A a r - i W 

(Check all that apply): 
E i Quality Control 
• Other 

l&£_ ?r-ifmSr<i lA 2*. 
- * 

a^fcMr^<\c:-<-

/ 

cAeA; 41-A2&!/ - A J / 
t*ffvrv» T£ I [&**>?/ / 

I I Prompt correction 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S.ARM\ 3INEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

t » * » Q i ^ , , 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D O # : 

QQ(VJ. 

DATE: 

a* z»* h<^ 
PROJECT LOCATION: 

FC6 

TIME: 

i4on 

(Check all that apply): 

Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I 1 Safety Violation 

I I Safety Comments 

D E S C R I P T I O N : - ^ V n , t . , . , ^ SrU 1A 

tn<--g- C.Uo_c,k: 33 -7-23 , 

(f 't .ftme ~ j 

K O T H ^ P o i - i - n t J t ^ . / -

I—I Prompt correction or compliance with contact specifications is requested 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 

ACTION TAKEN: 

?APR C 96 ORM 948 (Revised) C O P Y 1 _ Contractor's Representative 

ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVIL 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

fhfte -M>f' 

DATE: I TIME: 

UH JAM 6b I i^Qo 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
000*7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

PCS 

(Check all that apply): 
N s >F1 Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

D E S C R I P T I Q N T l u ^ ^ t t L . L - f t U S t t ^ S i T F 4 A 

C+te.CK*. 4 \ ~ A Z * 7 . ^ T U J K X G , FoL- "" ~ 

/ 

• 
Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

* 1 tCAl^C Cita D f l « m « * n * « K . ^ S - ' USACE Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: $(AXOSJ U r * / f c " ° DATE: 

7f^ dG 
)CA 

TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: <?<&£> 

\AJ7/2/?yr-o(/-J?-
DO#: 

000'7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

D ^ Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: / A*J"rfosj-;o^ o"f 6-rl<LT'-// 

38 Ulz/bttvi 

u Prompt correction or compliant was-' 
e With contract specifications is-reqites 

specifications is-requested. 
i 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: The, *,}»„« d*sc r/l.J+.?* k<-J 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

fay F'tetf&J 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

S~6\X°J. lASA £KV/ 
DATE: 

7G£ £>6 
TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

ujf/ipy-eV' o -POOL 
DO#: 

0001 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: T%A" f feS-flG*^ o-f <£/jJ 6 f - / / 

(Check-all that apply): 

§ 3 Quality Control 

• Other 

-f-
<***-fk*f / / iv'fH'i*. -AL>. re.mfm. erf 4-L^ €LIO.^ 

-i'AtK osi**' fits f^r/ed Lir#t£wr***»*irf*-/ 

3 / 

* ^ * ^ 

^olt/-J ^ iW/g£«? 6/XQ^r 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 
i 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: y ^ ^ ^ ±«ja.fJ*l *"<^ ^S 

r-i: 

'AS/7j^'S7'&tfz:r 
-7 

?APRC
9f °

R M 948 (ReViSed) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

USqE 
DATE: TIME: 

o53a 

CONTRACT NUMBER: PROJECT LOCATION: 

DO#: HTZ "*"* J L.A&C i/f£<s 
OQOJ 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) (Check all that apply): 

f~| Work Plan fl^l Quality Control 

| j Safety Violation • Other 

[~] Safety Comments ffioOgcT ?/? &/ 

DESCRIPTION: GfrD S Z' 6f Z "? V Y6 Lsffa 

i I Prompt correction or compliancejvithjojitcact^peGi8eations-is.xequested. 

^ 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED : C^AitoJ* /sdf/^ 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 943 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contr8CtOf*8 Representative 
1 APR 96 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

te/?£ 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: oaoy 

TIME: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: C-&OS Z<^, Z 7 ^ ^6 fifes&> 

(Check all that apply): 

pTj Quality Control 

• Other 

D Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) QQpy,. Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

US&& 
DlklE:f/yfo{ TIME: 

/QOO 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 
\AJcfl\t>'j-o>1-& -VOOj Ce &UT«s£7£f / t / C 

DO#: 
C&y-J 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

U&/c£%/;£.i~t 

(Check ail that apply): 
P ^ Quaiity Control 
| | Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| [ Safety Violation 
• Safety Comments W^J^T'^ % r*J 

DESCRIPTION: Qp^'^S Y ^ X-<T -̂ U/< V ^ ^ € 

I I Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 

KiFlG AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
-ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 
US#£ 

DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D O # : 
C?&0 7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 
^ Quality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| j Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: /$7%<""".. ^ £ " ^ ^ ?*<££>£0 
• ^ 

^ 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 • Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 



U S : ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 
OS&6 

DATE: 

vafl 

TIME: 

o yoo 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D0#: &ce>~7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: GfaOS S7, S fr. .S 7, * & , >?. 

(Check all that apply): 

, 0 - Q u a l i t y Control 

• Other 

I I Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractors Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

?APRC96°RM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

05#e. 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
cxjoy 

DATE: TIME: 

PROJECTLOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: GfrfiS 37, S ? , S<7 . X 6 , Z ? 

TVfT7 Yl^Z (4£S£/) GM&**C*T Q « ^ 

(Check all that apply): 
0 Quality Control 

• 2ther _ ~ « - ^ - s> 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED; 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

f lSn^ f 0 R M 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
I n r n "D 



U!S. ARlOlY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

OS$(Z 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: OCQ 7 

DATE: TIME: 

/Q30 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) (Check all that apply): 

• Work Plan / 0 - J3ua l i t y Control 

[~~| Safety Violation Q Other 
• Safety Comments fficJfcr 9 Vf ft 9 

DESCRIPTION: GfiUO 3 / Q , fcl e T& .T9 . V? >* 

Q7 btestp Q A CfaAS T ^ Y T ^ IM£RP 

o(l QA'J X — X 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

? *K&T 0 R M 9 4 8 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 A r n 9b 

U5.'ARft'Y ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

US/9/s 
DATE 

^ 
TIME: 

C7-SC 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: O C 0 7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

(Check all that apply): 

© -Qua l i t y Control 

• Other 
filoJfcr 9vp -p^ 7 

DESCRIPTION: fog iCS S/O, R 7 f 77? ; 7 7 , Y^ Y U 7 

OrJfh usfts>T DoCr <,*/> flu fi&%>s f/u rs>y 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 * Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 r 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

u&£ 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTR^cfl^UMBER: fi>TOjicT LOCATION^ 

DO #: ^ _ 7 y . a ^ - ^ r ^ 
QOC-1 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

[ [ Safety Violation 

[ | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: O-fil^S 

(Check all that apply): 
<|?S Quality Control 
• Other 

&SC& fuC SA V s 

I I Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

USAet^ife Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: l - ~ y ^ £ - " 1 -
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
11 APR 96 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

V>hF 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 
W9'2 0y- o'-f'-Q -®0O& 

DO#: OOQJ 

DATE: TIME: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

[ | Safety Violation 

| j Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: G£(<0$ ^ 7 Y ^ V &%&£?£? 

(Check all that apply): 
I I Quality Control 
• Other 

• Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

? ASQ^rORM 948 (Revised> COPY 1 • Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

OS/9r 
DATE: TIME: 

o7co 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 
\l^<f (10 V-o V - O - °°°< 

DO#: C&0 7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

£ U) k£ (/(£ is) 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I I Safety Violation 

[ J Safety Comments 

(Check all that apply): 

Y\- Quality Control 

• Other 

DESCRIPTION: QQ-tOS )C /<$, b*"'&, ^6 V€ / / / Q 

I I Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 

USACE Site Representative 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 

L 

U S . ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

USAE 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
000 7 

DATE: TIME: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) (Check all that apply): 

• Work Plan |£<J Quality Control 

I I Safety Violation Q Other 

• Safety Comments fifa/&Zr~ 9f* & SO 

DESCRIPTION: fi&iQS fjC/Q , LJ/O OA. \/6 T~rO 

Y9 Q9 PASSM CGU^^^T Gift \ \ 

U 
Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

?!Sn^r0RM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 M r n yO 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 
U 3 ^ z r 

DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D0#: OCG/ 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| 1 Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: (IflipS 

(Check all that apply): 
0-Quali ty Control 
• Other 

//<? uete Tcrtsufo ovse. £6<t a/) \ K 

I J Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

ACE Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED.^!^ 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
11 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

a^fii 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
oo&y 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 
J 3 - Quality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: &£tPS ~ZK Q/Q, W C? LJ ?. fu9 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNCFORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 A r l i yo 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

as/9/5 
DATE: 

///->/o£ 

I PROJECT LOCATION: 

TIME: 
0 7&& 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
oocn 

(Check all that apply): 
J ^ Quality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

| j Safety Violation 

[~~| Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: GfrJ>3> Uf7. XS , XI, ?7, #"Q VSc 

Lj£(l£ JVtWtf/9 Q ^ Pofl Q$. / W ftWT Or-

7J&& Qe-to±> Tkfi-T M£ O T^9 fifefe/fty of 

CLP/iO (J?> <~"?S TtA*&> Gvfs? Fail Q#..fii^y 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

CJ5/9c 
DATE: 

9 f* 
TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D 0 # : ©eo 7 

PROJECT LOCATION 

fU)icF\s,'£u^ J 

(Check all that apply): 
13-v-Quality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 
I | Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: T 9 , T A > . U7.vH.v7 V*0. • <C V7. 

PR. vi, vto <i^7. x7. XP. K9 yy.y?.^ 
HUE pF>e~~T<ftL QP-ios,, 77Lg me** OP "These /Zt?,^ 
JJflT -ffii-c Q/u P/Zcffrtly it/fT Ati& /"-Q floe GiC 

Ous^,?£ DidsvT 'LJ&~7 CtS/}fiZ/) .'mas AfdT~ 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

iSite Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGE 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

? A£Kc
0f

ORM 948 <Revised> COPY 1 - Contraetor's Representative 
1 APR 96 

U7.vH.v7


U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

user-
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
GoO—p 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 
I I Quality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I 1 Safety Violation 

[ I Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: pP/2 T/A<L C/2</?S LU7, U%, Xff. 

fay Pfl&T OF jt^tF Cfu/)s ~rUr A/?£ o^ 
G^P cy& CSX Irtt&WP^ U£tc /^OT C1&/ZF/J 

ac o^Q^i 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED; 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
l l APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY 3INEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

05/)5 
DATE: 

/o/y/cc 
TIME: 

0 7&e 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

LogaOY-OLf-o -oaob 

DO#: 
Gc&7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: C'ti/fiS 

(Check all that apply): 

0 -Qua l i t y Control 

• Other 

/ f S ' ( 

V^t L^J f 3 V F2Z fn.7 f/17 £2? 

<** \ - — v 

• Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

SACE-SiteyReptiesentative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 

/IjJSACE-Site.RepJie! 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

I CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
I I APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVIli 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 
VSti£ 

DATE: 

11/6 fob 
TIME: 
/3<o 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
OOO? 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

W , Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I j Safety Violation 

I j Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: &//2S ZJC. Dl*} £ ^ C^7 -12^ 
Qggr £-2% f^r GX<6 f/X? Fay £27 ¥ 
A"27 pnss&r /^u£^r^r(>?4V— \ 

1 1 Prompt correction or 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLED 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

* ^ / ^ -

SED: L < ^ 

COPY1 

•^!i—^*^^Tzsis*— 

U^AS^Site Representative-"*""-—^^^ j 

Contractor's Representative 1 

- Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY . JlNEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

OSfl£. 
DATE: TIME: 

/3od 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
Oood 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

R ] Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: QAPS £ 3 / V *£& R , LStf 

Ccxj£fr*"Aer <3A* F3t /f/&A X^TPMC) 

L-/hitfW frr A OePT^ of1 S'f {3° tfi£ /? 

^'36"(Zcckf? / ^ ^ / e Cfe&££)\ LriTk. ff^5 /?? P 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

ICEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

TO 

.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSV 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
" \ DATE 

OS>Pt 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: o&c7 

///%<?£ 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

0") 
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| J Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: /C&*£ TZ~l UX\ AOZSM 

(Check all that apply): 
__ Quality Control 

• Other 

. T V fi^cl *M UffOF Tu(Uf£ Ov£/l F&rt. G?4 

[~| prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 

USACE ^ite'Representative 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1APR96 _ ^ _ _ _ _ 



U.S. ARMY i JNEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

OSW 
DATE: 

frA/c>6 
TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
o^c 7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

CP Bcjr/^e£e sue 

CM J 
(Check all that apply): 

- Q L Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I 1 Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: /?&£$ J5>? M31 K33J32J3/ V29 

D Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:, 

ACTION TAKEN: 

USACE Site'ftepHisentative 

Contractor's Representative 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
\ 1 APR 96 

I AFfMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVII( 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

^1 

TO: 
usftc 

CONTRACT NUMBER 
- ccxrt 

DO#: d>c&7 

DATE: TIME: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 
Qjf DoT^Ffi, --^C 

(Check all that apply): 

P%. Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

I | Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: £ / ^ D32., 33Q V 9 <~29 

UJ££C TV(*•*/& o\s££ &°£~ Qd\ ~\ 

I I Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

*=T5§AG€>.Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

" 
CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative I 
1 APR 96 I 



U-.S/ARMY, SNEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

us/9 a 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
oco' 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

O) 
(Check all that apply): 

,~l_,Qual i ty Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I I Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: CtWS CJ> I 32>CJ Y<^tf /fasSj? 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractors Representative 
1 APR 96 r 

S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSW 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

(JSAB 
DATE: l TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

NC 
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: J%A T^l/c 

(Check all that apply): 
[ 3 Quality Control 

D other 

^ 
4 -

__£3C 

J5 k &S*1 

15~F33% HS-G'Zci fry-6-31, yg-M3q 

uested. 

________3̂ |L 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

?APRC96°RM 948 (Revised) C 0 ^ 1 * Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY JHNEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

USAB 
DATE: 

U-l4-a4 
TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: otofp 

DO#: 

°*>7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

C a m * ? S v i C 

JVC 
s 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPT1QN:T%A f<*X\<St*> t*n 

(Check all that apply): 

E Quality Control 

• Other 

•fatM *f- tLLsi Lk &2L 

i4_a^ gs^r-aTs f[jfi SJIM rV <fts^l 

z 
yocn 3 2,36-meft r d c l A V5-F3 2J 

3 a 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

?APRC96°R M 948 {Rev ised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

). ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSW 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

VSPt &Ju\RWMto%L 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO# 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

OHO &>$»*•% 

(Check all that apply): 

I | Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 7 fr£ PnLLoyJ/AJCj 4 R)d /4A5 

— AJQ>-)IMAJG foLChaJl 

I I Prompt correction or compliance wifli contract specifications is requested. 

'LSL 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

? ! S R ^ R O R M 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 1 APR 96 



U.S. ARMY JINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

U?A ZVOMOAJMeAJfoL 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO# 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

' / /C 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: T/J £ P P L L Q U J / A ^ &RM 

(Check all that apply): 

• Quality Control 

• Other 

Ey/VAJrUi 3.3k facte]" Mo-for , , / T H 

= A/PUh/6 pnl/^j5 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

? I P R C 9 6 ° R M 9 4 8 (Rev ised) COPY 1 • Contractor's Representative 

.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSV 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

03A£ 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

\ji)<irl'Q\/'Oil-D'ODoL 
DO#: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

I | Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| j Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: fM Fr>\(o\JML C*QU)3 #AUP fyttFA 

A 

W'D&'W' M& Q5'03*f <*T-E3b QS~m 

/V3f?- Tot/)L ft F '/* gfi//>J, 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

Spresajtative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

?APRC96°R M 9 4 8 (Revised) COPY 1 • Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSViLLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

T^J^flXWBZ^ DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

UrtQ9i~d<l-0-otH 
DO#: 

Pool 

PROJECT LOCATION; 

SUBJECT JTEMff} (Check all that apply): 
• Work Plan J 2 Quality Control 
Q Safety Violation Q Other 

Q Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: (yrl ^ 0*3} h<XT P*e.*± r*-uJ 4'tLd. 

BECEIPT ACKMOWLEOGED: 
Contractors Representative 

S~M®7 y / .7 . 

?APR°96ORM 948 (ReviS9d) C O ^ ' " Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

U$*r£ 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO*: 
-n&iml 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

• Safety Violation 

f l Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:^ f^MA 

(Check all that apply): 
G0 Quality Control 
• Other 

tm P/J>p4*4tf *•{££ a**J 

arm cllttwfi $.26<t*o// 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNCFORM948(Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO*: 
TX)^L(jW~l 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 
051 Quality Control 
M Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
Q Work Ran 
• Safety Violation 
|~] Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:̂  pmp,Ai* ,.J*J,4kJ *.K <*/&/ \ 
{ GvO*)*V'/l 

n Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED; 

USACE Site Representative 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

IA£ he 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
TO^mol 

PROJECT LOCATION: 
Former (%nfl T&tw 

(Check all that apply): 
J g | Quality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Ran 
• Safety Violation 

f l Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:̂ ^ •QILK/^ fRlpi4f I Jti @fr*J0 ra t ; 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: & . 

USACE Site Representative 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSV1LLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

U54l? 
DATE: 

iihit 07 
TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
TD^mdi 

PROJECT LOCATION: , 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

• Safety Violation 

f l Safety Comments 

D E S C R I P T I O N ; - ^ 

(Check all that apply): 

J%ft Quality Control 

• Other 

& , 
J?J,£*J**> 4&H* 

Ck**y iiJ UP ^Wna / Jc f a r e a * \A<4*dit:i*d 

X*i\Z ^t*f . 

n Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

*K A) h " " ^ 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY t - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

USA-F 
DATE: 

mmo7 
TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: -To-^cco1 

PROJECT LOCATION:^ , 

farmer- £&m.f) txCp^- i— 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

|~1 Safety Violation 

f l Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: T ^ 

(Check all that apply): 

Quality Control 

Other 

<SfciK>Afers J r v , s { V K W A fonJetrJ mv^T 

arms uLdi£*4 *»} <& a.4»tU*fiap i T Z ^ / 
arm CAmnd i 

Prompt correction or compliance wjth contract specifications is requested 

>r^<-
RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED; 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractors Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

%{£%er 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
TP-^a^l 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
D Work Plan 

n Safety Violation 

r~l Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: Tk* 

(Check all that apply): 
Quality Control 
Other 

1*h timJJ.{tfJ.*\.,*i.,r&,/l-*i—^L 

map: -fe^/ ^rm zJmttl: £ 0JS'*£.4g* 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 

USACE Site Representative 

Contractor's Representative 
ACTION TAKEN: 

?SK&f 0 R M 9 4 S <««•«« COPY 1 Contractors Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

V&AE 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
TO ±<r$t> 7 

PROJECT LOCATJpN: 

(Check all that apply): 
O Quality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

• Safety Violation 

f l Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:^ f>top,rJy JuA^CK 4^3, 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

' T USAQE! • Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

USA& 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
-ft? ft Pool 

PROJECT LOCATION: 
"former- C4m/9 13tfi?vei 

(Check ail that apply): 
JJtP Quality Control 
D OBier 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

n Safety Violation 

[""I Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: ike pOoptA^ til*A,fiJ ** V < ^ ; 

•IGCMTX4 Of jSS^ Mtt?4 fofr WW? fafuMii 
Pbrztf//*.; -has p*<s,J .* 6ou*r-*/M<*J±' 

n 
Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
t APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

US4& 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
TD^tfW~7 

PROJECT LOCATION: . 

(Check all mat apply): 
Q3 Quality Control 
M Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

f"l Safety Violation 

|~] Safety Commente 

DESCRIPTION: l j pn*»A uLdLtJas 4{LS:/*»*-( 

A §hgnrtY acta /«fe*^<fr«/ ^L^L> a^Ju^f 
/y ly f TidJ Arm chatJi ^.r?SL0^ 

u Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

USAGE Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

US4F 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
-Tb&QOQl 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

3«&l€>~y w<L 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• WorkPlan 

I"] Safety Violation 

n Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: ~T?if 

(Check all that apply): 
P£) Quality Control 
D Other 

DESCRIPTION: 7 / f c prvprfk* /htf/,***/ h^ ^U 

2/f/Tj NntJtfks ho/cul. /nrapsJ*T 45S3 

^^k* Cjsrtrart^j ^Shceri £ tfTrt CMxbcU 

Prompt correction or compliance wiĵ coqtracijfMCjications is requested. 

' „ USAC^ Sfe Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
r*s Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

v^w^^ei.22n fro wy777. rssr 

CEHNC FORM 946 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY t - Contractor's Representative 



US. AND SUPPORT GENTIR, HUfffSVtLLi 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO: 

U S * ^ f 4¥ 

QATfc 

OCA110N: 
J4JC 

CONTRACT NUMBfiR: 

0 0 #• 
00 &1 

PROJECT L0CA1 

(Check all that apply): 

" - 0 J Quality Control 

SUBJECT ITEM(S| 

• Work Plan 

f~ j Safety Violation 

I j Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: TWa f n t U i ^ r n " V ^ Q r \ c r g . F l a t 

<6*TU^ l U ^ L c ^ e (AM U*^W U), *Wl 
I 

1 

Prompt eorrecttan with 

tkfgsa, 

Mmtraef specif(cations is requested. 

CU<LKW.... 
USACE Site 

RECEfPT ACKMOWLEDQCOi. j L ^_ 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN; 

CEHMC FORM 948 (ftevtend) 
i Arose 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Repfassrtmfiea 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE QRQUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

\ASAE 
DATE: 

3ioijjm7 

IE: 

c f30 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

1 PROJECT LOCATION: 

DO#: 
— — — . . — . . • i i — • — . . ' i - n — inn? , 

tftfver, &,£., 
(Check all that apply): 

• Quality Control 
Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
] 0 Work Plan 
I | Safety Violation 

n Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:Ipt (A?pOj&^fS'pAto £-/fi}CU/(to/ 

Vk/tnrliAiHtJvA *sii!J*«/ce. Idas *mipetfcr*i\. flft/fccW aJgy jkc Rv~ 

Prompt correction or comi cjfications is requested. 

<h dAr^Jff-

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDi 

, USACE Site Representative 
'-6srfbm-Ob - $ 

>$10&. 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

200 A?A <? I 

file:///ASAE


U.S. ARMY E iNEERMG AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSV1LLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

CONTRACT NUMBER: J PROJECT LOCATION: 

OPO'7 X \L 
(Check all that apply): 

0 Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

• Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 7 Z * fa f{&&**.* *S^,JJ£ / / ? ?4*-<A& 

__ _ — 
I I Prompt correction or compliam 

\ /USACE Sit^ Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED A l& 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUM 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE QROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 
/ 

DATE: IE: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: I PROJECT LOCATION: 

DO#: - ^ ~ T \cpi>3h*z*j tic 
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: Tn-< X ^ j / o t ^ < - »•, 

(Check all that apply): 

£ 3 Quality Control 

• Other 

£ <y,nd-5' m A r<e: x. 

I I Prompt correction or compliance wfitp comtrc bt sp^cifj6aiions/i§ requested, 

AGE Site Representative 

/ / RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY L PEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

USAl 
DATE: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D 0 # : OOCl 

PROJECT LOCATION: 
W W * * 

-A/C 
(Check all that apply): 

R 1 Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT 1TEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:'^ /> / £ / X ~ ^ . . , . . . . . . - , , „ i a j «5 v' i idi h.~c ? W C? f̂̂  

Hm\v-hiK\.c\*<j.t>i./ z 
~/A/<nr/,t(+% Pz> fi&LAjj n~ 

u Prompt correction or compliance wiflyci 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 

/requested. 

Contractor's f̂ presentative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HW 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

L/SAE 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

W 9fZffr-a y - £>-<xsso 
DO #: ^ ._ 

1-43-07 
TIME: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

|%H Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 7%& "fb //&<-ixris. •& o * * v V . - X s t > r « £ . 

'L ^b&$:'A \. XT. A3j A V a j g / / 
/n *? ft#7o: 8-z B ̂  B *j, B 5 c a c ?. <c # <cs, 

*fiAb5. Aj*Lj A&, ?—-—i— - / . 
_ — . — / 

Prompt correction or compliance ymh^or/t 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

J 



U.S. ARMY E. PEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVIUJE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 

DATE: J TIME: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

OCOT [ £f?'Boi^r.lAfC 
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:77J * -fa If &**, 

(Check all that apply): 

0 Quality Control 

• Other 

^ < y C J I - (c f" i* fa ^ 7*\/T&-

Ah** 4b3?&7 &7.&-3.CZC3C4 P2 h3 

Area 4D#/<5>AL '/—- '. / 
L 

, A s -
'fsTh i A 'f- FA i I/O CiS£ f~~ V 

• Prompt correction or corpi 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENQINEERSNG AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNt 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
0£>OT 

PROJECT LOCATDON: 

hSUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

[ | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: Tfie fol to UJ; n 

(Check all that apply): 
UQ Quality Control 
• Other 

-' <A L?v*s ±t^4 

Ibtfi: A\!.A 2. A3.A? GL 8* a bf 
b 
~A 2. As 02.1)3. M, BZ unj t 3 / i. 

1 
I ! Prompt correction or compliance w/itrycontrabfsl^pQations is requested. 

iZ.*-
> V U S 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ft. jNEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSViLLE 
ORDINANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

LA' 
CONTRACT NUMBER: I PROJECT LQCATSON: 
WHlZQy-OY-b -<iQQ^ Former 

DQ#: . 1 £ n "8o'n<srx AfC 
OQ&'T r (Check all that apply): 

0 Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: "77i<e -fk> f/&<^S/nc? Cf.rtb fr> /4p°.£ 

4-D^fO XiiVT? p7*^**jci^Jdfa/r/y -2?sur3ty< 

eke,aj<: <E 4 inj£"5«/-1 -^— 7. 
/ - — — ^ ^ £Z/Uu*</- — / 

Prompt correction or cBrfipTian^witl^onW 

3ACE Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HU» 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

'JSAE 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

\tJ9iZb y-g^-o-oood. 
I I l l l l | | | | | | | f i i « - i ™ M l L J . W " . i . ••l..«J.ii.i-..iiHWltfW«D_llll. i i i - m n « ^ W m r m n p u J 4 H u i i - . - m 

DO#: _ 

ooo7 

PROJECT LOCATSON: 

Cf Odfn net 
(Check all that apply): 

[ 2 j Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT STEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 'The 'To/focs-ir,* <yrJs />,••<# *>&&&/ 

sfJ&ikxn<$ f<* iI 

file:///tJ9iZb


U.S. ARMY t JNEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: USAE 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: a&o?" 

PRgJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 
I x l Quality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
n Work Plan 

I I Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:^ *fiL fL+*,»- qnM t A j\ 

E T/~- — 
Z tf(Mfal^9f%//c>±*P* f "*" 

Prompt correction or compliance 

t3csS /«WrH Ot^«e! 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 

ACTION TAKEN: 
Contractor's Representative 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNf 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: U SAE DATE: 
l - X f - 0 7 173c 

CONTRACT NUMBER: j PROJECT LOCATION: 

DO#: 
l<nt-«s-r 

QO>Cz { L- p. C3^'f~n <St i- hJ <C 
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 
I | Safety Violation 

| j Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 

(Check all that apply): 
\ A \ Quality Control 
• Other 

ca^ t -O ty> 9 ,g ,n -a 5 i a Ai-s • j - ^ 3 

/ — — / <at>j.5j 

I I Prompt correction ô dompliance)wiwi cpi 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 

^ USACE SiteRepresentative 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY k JNEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVULE 
ORDINANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

C/SAE 
DATE: 1 TIME: 

3-ft-o7 \l7SO 
CONTRACT PROJECT LOCATION: 

•r-
SUBJECT ITEfW(S) 
• Work Plan 

I j Safety Violation 

I 1 Safety Comments 

(Check all that apply): 
[XI Quality Control 
• Other 

DESCRIPTION 7 6 e -?^g //o <JLfj r?£ 3 ^ ^ e ^ 
1 Aaw^ / ? a ^ - g ^ ^ ^ / i C * — _ ^ — , 

3<g *r* ri*r,<?& e A W >£ f / ^ V / ^ / ^ , 

( t ^ o f / « * * * * » 0*W*nn 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUM. 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

USA E 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO #: ^ ^ ~y-

DATE: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
I | Work Plan 

| [ Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: / 

PROJECT LOCATOON: 

(Check all that apply): 

I^j Quality Control 

• Other 

]'C 

<y <tv»<y-?« iA t- ? 4-$>—< n. 

/——/AjXf L,!j fiiL-l^A ± 

Prompt correction or compliance vMr/cojItrj fequested. 

JSAOE^SÎ vRapfesentative 
-

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 

USAfiE^SlKkRefiresen 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

file:///l7SO


U.S. ARMY 1 SNEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVSLLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
DATE; 

CONTRACT NUMBER. 

DO# 
oaoT 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

C-grmp &LH#frve*• / I / O 

(Check all that apply): 
I X Quality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I 1 Safety Violation 

I I Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 71? a* 

mAp<A4-Qf 8^ ,62 ,63 gy /•!«; A^ 

<3 qf- «* i*1*^ K^y**. 

(e3dS IS****-* C#nv**fti 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 

ACTION TAKEN: 
Contractor's Representative 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUN( -lLLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

C5'AE 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 6667 

3 - j 3 ~ 3 7 jT3o> 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

C ^ m P - S f An--er; A f C 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
n Work Plan 

I i Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 7 7 i A ^ b / / < 

(Check all that apply): 
[§} Quality Control 
• Other 

<Hi^>lTi •rid$ it\ f^r€Si 

cA^Jc : A'l A£ Afr A6fflf. £2 g 
F2 ^ J p Q 

£5, 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY'- JNEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: DATE: TIME: 

^LjYoS (JC4£^. \fM4S#?\o7»o 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
. oooy 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

CA,' =£ ..t HA- T lA e S, x/c_ 
(Check all that apply): 

M Quality Control 
Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: "The. ^ > r y < ^ y *c+ £?/$.£ 

CryW (Road. A<LX J3t{ rT* <L LstSrf £> 

fs^C "^^ i y 7 * T - f v G ^ *t>̂ <s£ i j- ir»e<$Lr—fids 
9*1 *A u *'u^ - ~ - r <$/? /—/J.*r / L j r / g^ /—y 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

1 /6pb 
"The. &b^^ fsOtoesyf fa r*-£e,V «-<£. 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGSNEERiNG AND SUPPORT CENTER, HU| 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

VSLLE 

TO: 

fO(Xof 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DOtq 

DATE: 

£ w . WSPcU&l 
TIME: 

DO#: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 
52 Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: "TTv-r. /prhnp.JY g-h . O / C ^ W M I , 

¥• s 

I I Prompt correction or compliance witf? confract'specificaubns is requested. 

USACE Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. )̂̂ U Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

* /0 
fcKEN:-^ ifa»t jy*V*'iy W )<CZi ^<?J 

nfmj if60 

^ A P R ^ I
 ORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Cortraetofs Representative 



U.S.ARMY 

TO: 

JEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSV81LE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

fc-JX of Uf/f F~u . 19-7f*b 6 7 
TIME: 

O 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I 1 Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: "TA 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(ChecR all that apply): 

£ 2 Quality Control 

• Other 

PTOOKAY *-•+ C3o/ ILs £ 
J7W •' \ i ' / tic 

0«.**-V 
• • • •'••• ' i g . n - * - . . . t — .&• — . * . . . - * '".iii.ii r r .i f 

Uf/f 
iz^o. C'JCl i t 

l/~—Jju<+T&~-T-

ffi± JrfjM A*. 
(vifh contract sped D Prompt correction or compliance ecifications is requested. 

/ 
f€fe,j{CE/6ite Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: J T k**/*- c o ^ d W * / o ^ o Q/4 i^/cCt,i. 

JL _—-y Ue&+^ ^Jb1
 r—/ 

^APR^B ° R M 948 (Revised) COPY 1 • Contractors Representative 

SUyos ur* £^y 

U.S. ARMY ENGJNEERSNG AND SUPPORT CENTER, 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

ILLS 

TO: DATE: E: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

G<* m,£ VCA. rirt <~r, ^(-— 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

UJ fig-Ov-oV ~P &-* <*j 
D0#: oon-

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 7 7 t a. pros^-^y *-f 70^T X r l ^ ^ 

(Check all that apply): 

I2f Quality Control 

• Other 

C-h.CK.1*-, b& ^J ftn<zA- ro^S/f-f-'t *•* <$-r ^ ^ r r-jJ^AcKj 

/ 
SCLA uc/>r-,.-j Or 4, <̂v ''a- i, c" r g-o^ 

g^t^^^f QA. / •/*i«j"hLL-£z^h 
C^ 4* •-

/ 

ACTION TAKEN: XT A*** ct-dc^/<.»(£ ^ /0 % (0/f 

T<\Spe<-^fO^ <o-f ike. A boo* f^fGi^/, MO 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY jllNEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

SlA XoS U&. B 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO# 
O B J E C T I T E M ( S ) 

• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:"?^ 

T". 

DATE: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 
Fa f ***•*-*' 

(Check all that apply): 

I X Quality Control 

• Other 

ofi*s 
•$r*£ 

+y«.J- 7*2? XrL £L^K. 

QA*f- 7 / * S i-JxfccL n* / -y 

2 
? / 

-d^L 
iance witn contract'specifications is reques D Prompt correction or compliance 

/^4*A 
specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 

.CfcBite Representative 

//^Asis^, 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 7 ? A, 

?APR C 96° R M 9 4 8 (Rev i sed ) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

IS. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUF / i t 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO #: . ^ ^ _ * 

60G7 

DATE: 

O7do 

SUBJECT JTE!Vl(S) 

• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: ~T~A-C~ 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

^3 Quality Control 

Other 

^ T>\ CJ?4> *->h 6 *^ / 7J>?>fhX4><i.t~. / '/ 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 

uested. • 
Prompt correction or compliance wimcontfacfspecifications is requests 

Site Representative 

— ^ 9 < . ' 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: rC k * v « - f<wP0r> 1 JO^cp 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
"U ""TIME: TO: 

USA Ja^i E.»Wt 

DATE: 

ioo6 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
dc©7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

Burner t *\(L 
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I I Safety Violation 

I I Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: T W , 

(Check all that apply): 

•*"*^fi*] Quality Control 

g j^Other (M&&42. 

kftOS (Unf i t - f t TLSttftM CHA»AB€RS RCL 

D Prompt correction or with contrac/Sweifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 

USACE Site Representative 

•;y ;„j^^^L-
Contfactor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO; 

U S A E.AM. 

DATE: 

[ 5 K&v Qg 

HUE; 

l£2a 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
0001 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

6 u W i r , KiC_ 
(Check all that apply): 

"SD Quality Control 

• Oiher C ^ q ^ m 

SUBJECT iTEM(S) 

j ~ ] Work Plan 

f l Safety Violation 

f~l Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:~Tu* hAtAg-P ftfea W a U i aJr 

P o ^ g ^ O. U £ A C £ & A i r v s p g c V l e n r w 

n Prompt correction or oompllartct with contract 

c t j ^ m . ^ 
USACC Site ftai 

ions ts rapestecl 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Heprese* 

4 ^ -
lepresentative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FOAM M l (fliwised) 
1 APR 96 

•COW 1 -Conteactw's-Rjipwwftithw 



OS. ARMY ENGWEER1NQ AND SUPPORT CENTS!, HUNTS¥1JJE 
A M EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO: 

US ft E.i^J, 

DATE-. 

14 Hw^ 6% Î CJJC '̂ 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D0#: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

ft &*£*. C^wf SuTrtfiS-

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

|~1 Safety Violation 

[~~] Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: A 4t*io a c r e 

(Check all that apply): 

* i 0 Quality Control 

• Other <^4©* 1*7 

ptoV W c ^ e i d.T 

>ft^g,gj *». uSft^g 

V\-^ \o KR I Uftfi M^»-\, THIS. 

^"AWIJ» ^re<i> 4 RA 

V̂*A u^V Ir l , /— 
A/CTHfMC Fn I /to o 3 £ 

I J Prompt correction or compliance with contract 

C^ 't&itstlMt 

Is requested. 

USAGE Site 

t^A[ "t&'^M****^— 
Contractor's 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 
1 APR 86 

{Rwted| COPY 1 - Contractor's Pppreeentetive 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, MJNfSYUf 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

•lagft fenfr 

DATE: TIME: 

H3o 
PROJECT LOCATION: 

fDlT<\%%. Cmf Dinner 

Btrbe,, */C 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 

OOP 7 
SUBJECT !TEM(S) 
• Work Plan 
Q Safety Violation 

{Check all that apply): 
" - Q Quality Control 

• Other CHS** ^ 
f~) Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:^ 4^£> <s.rr<L plt>f /OCAT^J &T 

•ikiL PoiU^lnf UcoSton f>a<L<.^d. Q^ 

'••¥> 

/ 

D 
Prompt correction or cnmpfiance with contract s^^T^Hations te requested 

RECEIPT ACJCNOWLEPGEPs . j f f ^ W 

USACP Site RepTesentative 

•rt Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 946 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

-COPY 1 -Cortt»tortflfl|»*Mnuifrv 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO; 

US'/} £nv. 
DATE: TIME; 

isoo 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 

ooe:7 

PROJECT LOCATION! , 
si s-i ff I * 

SUBJECT !TEM<S) 

Q Wort? Plan 

f*1 Safety Violation 

f " l Safety Comments 

(Check all that apply): 

1 ^1 Quality Control 

• Other f ^ f # /^~ 

DESCRIPTIONrT7i«. ^//at^'mq 7JU# / k l f g . ig/tfT 

•frk/g 3L&HAM-.CnA±,ijrE&£..GA B^lmMfm 
- 4 -A(£t MAS M&nSiLtL^ This preprA 

>ftht 
pr§P 

<i" terrhtn fireA,^ K&n^*- C&mpMk-Z . 
%z£tek».ce t^es-qfudf on tJS* U n i t t - fa> 

d 
D Prompt correction or specifications is requested. 

^•fek-.iP^r-.jtMi.. 

ACKNOWLEDGED; 

USAGE Site Representative 

Ccmtractor's 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM MS (HwiWid) 
1 APR 16 COPY' 1 ~ Contractor's Representative 



yM. mm ENGINEERING AND SUPPPOT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

USA Eiav 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
6001 

DATE; 
i 17 *T 
1 f <Jmf urc 6S 

TIME; 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S} 

f~1 Work Plan 

r~l Safety Violation 

| j Safety Comments 

DESCRiPTION: T v ^ g 

(Check all that apply): 
•""-{0 Quality Control 

•i 

& A f U r A \ - 5 ^ ! a , ^ j <oT 3 4 X s I4AM C Utfo^I <rr S 

J J Prompt correction orwn^ams wrtft contra^ specifications, is requested. 

•4/fe&c£ 

AEC£IPTACtCNOWUE0QBX 

USACE Sfte Representative 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN; 

I CEHNC FORM 94S (Revised) 
h APR 96 COPT 1 - Contactor's Representative 



US. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER HUNTBVILLE 
ORDNANCE AMD EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO; 

03 f\ . S A M , 
CONTHACT NUMBER; 

0 0 * 
oocl 

DATE; 

r LOCATION: 

V£Q0 
PROJECT! 

Bt-4-frtey,.. t ^ C 
SUBJECT ITENI(S) 

• Work Plan 

f~| Safety Violation 

[**"| Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: ft »4 CKTg ft. 

(Check all that apply): 

*"H3] Quality Control 

• Other q4<g# (^ 

i» /e r Vu^o QsC.res 

< ^ \ttMJr^ <**, WM *U' 
g j ( i W ^ . C o - r n r q W fea>&*r*.fc 

/—"ticrUstridh fiJUu^ » $ —/ 

Prompt eonreeUon or is requested. 

ACKMOWLHJQED; 
{ / Contractor's nepnwertattw^^^ 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FOAM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 86 COPY 1 - Contractor'* Representative 



US. ARMY ENGWBOTNe AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLI 
ORDNANCE M B EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO: 

USft fcta%/. 

DATE: 

7 NL.K f660 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
OC>0^ 

PROJECT LOCA-

SUBJECT 1TEM(S) 

[~1 Work Plan 

n Safety Violation 

P I Safety Gommeots 

DESCRIPTION: T h e ^ 1 U ^ 

(Check all that apply): 

" ^ fH Quailty Control 

Q Other f}4@^ 14 

^ % 
Tux, fro*. PwV 

C ^ y U * ! , fes,^arecTbe^i^io*:Unrt 1 H O . 

D Prompt correction or 

ACKMOWflJEDQED;,̂ : ;, **^*&£ ~J^Vj£g?r j ^ ^ ^ ^ j f i - a ^ ^ ^ W * '* 'tiBK,,—-—™~" 

Contractor's 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
!APft9i 

CCFY '< - Gonlvact '̂-'s ftef.irc.^rtfsU'a 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

USB Btf/* 
DATE: 

Uj? /MM * S 

TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
0507 

PROJECT LOCATION: 
f 0#» M€ P- CAIA p DM'T IS) € t 

(Check all that apply): 

• 0 Quality Control 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

~^J Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: A ^ A c r c f\oT U c ^ - f e i 

| I other 

- / 

/, (sft>TH IAJ Qj fo LU)faOS 

I Prompt correction or compliance with contract 

I us* 

is requested. 

ifl&vg> 
USAGE Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
s Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHIMC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



1 U £ ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPP0R1 CENTER. nUNTSVILl eT) 
* ORGMANCE AND EXPLOSiVt GROUP ! 

MEMO 

TO DATE 

ifcllllili 

T\U:Z 

GUN IHACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 

tri i t S ' 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

£>-

Ifr^Mf- -'Us 
SUBJECT ITEMIS) 
[ J W..rkP»an 

|_j "a'efy v'i««a.;iori 

[_j :»r'ety Comments 

sCheck all that applyj 

"^.] Quality Control 

vs. ̂ r* , 

Dt^MlFTiON:' .;' : . : i / c u . _ f / J ^ / - j / n | f f \A-

i _ . , 

J: »•' <>'v L .C I - ^y 
Prompr f;-irrsct»£;n or nam;" .•.r~ ~.>"tr:K* ̂ per^icaTionB is requested. 

JSACE Stte Rapr#senlati%'e 

•r 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED^-' >**£?' ^-'T^^'S^ <'"-
Cnntwcffir's Reprfc ivtotive 

ACTION TAKEN; 

CEHNC FcmM 9« jReweti) COW 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 9g 



U,S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTBVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO. 

LrS A | l t4 y 
COMTRftiCT NUMBER: 

DO #: 

DATE: 

13* fyr<* 
TIME: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

B^ fver 
4-

N C 
SUBJECT I T E M ^ S J 

Q Work Plan 

P I Safety Violation 

f ~ l Safely Comments 

(Check all that apply): 

^~\ Quality Control 

Q Other 

/ « f J i 7 7 
mi ITIMJB • •••! • Ti• i - T T — r y — — 

Prompt oarraction or [icalions Is requested. >n or cpmpteoce with contract snerffiealions Is r&que 

i USAGE S«*e Rapwwntative 

RECePT ACKN0WLEDGED:„_£f^2! 
£.. f / /-•> „ J*1**' <*i.^. 
Contractof s Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 | Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - C©nt»ctaf% ftsprssertiivfj 



U.S. ARMY BiGtNEBWNG AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO: 

i l $ i \ t i 4v 

DATE: 

3 km Ot 13 3» Ci 3 no* < 
PROJECT LOCATION: CONTRACT NUMBER: 

0 0 * 
000*1 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

f~| Work Plan 

f l Safety Violation 

f l Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 1 L _ Q> U« 

(Check all that apply): 
**-(7] Quality Control 

D o t l l e r -ti A A 
fr£*|«ct 

t i ^ g 0^« t_-iv 6.?Se i c:̂  
u < ^ i h G>f\ ^ p * c V ' t < w A 'X t ic re p U i 

t ^ . 

— } , r % — " ' -"•—' 

D Prompt correction or compliance with contract 

111 
> requested j with contract sradficatiorB Is requa 

USAGE < 

/ ' 
RECEIPT AeKMOWLEPQEP: -J-'***:•& / /-A 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (RavfeMQ 
1 APR96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



UM. mm Emmmmmmo SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

USA Bny, 
DATl: TIME: 

fss*6 
PROJECT LOCATION; 

pM~rn<itri N j C 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D0#: 
O0O1 

SUBJECT mEMtS) (Check all that apply): 
• Worts Ptan " ^ 0 Qualify Control 

• Safety Violation • Other 
• Safety Comments F ^ e c t 1 1 ^ * 0 ^ 

DESCRIPTIONHT", * k j l ' l o w " ' " ? -fo6^ / ) / ^ s O&SS t f l 

ci OSflCc. Q n i ' \ f y f t -TiOt j - te^ch ftrt'x J-

a. ^ / l u c p U + . I W . iotc-h.c! art SO^ £ n « n 

ICC.L^- | - ^J c-f 5 0 1 E n o h Rd Gio i - ik JA^Go'kL 

• _ — _ y 'c"fcrJt ,/~r: 
/ -— A / ' O T f t l M ^ f Q L L C o o S " " 

D 3rcmpi correction or compliance with CQintî Qt specification's is requested. 

s 
e with cojitra 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGE 

USACE Site Representative 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORH 948 ifflevised} 
1APH96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGJNEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVIIXE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO: 

fft>ft E M V . 

DATE: TIME: 

2Jw 
PROJECT LOCATION; 

6uTf4.£R, t 4 c 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
®mi 

SUBJECT ITEMP) 

n WorfcPlan 

[~1 Safety Violation 

|~] Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION" u, ._ 

(Check all that apply): 
•fl] Quality Control 
• Ottier 

r-vtdWtL,, i-W 
* • 

>«^;i f \̂ <• J \1\<, .peuJuto* f - t ^ » . : ft X fto-c 

•*0 iHfc. X ~ K,n* / tiCTHth&Felh^ 

L J Prompt correction or with specifications Is requested. 

/ ; -ffWrO 
USAGE She 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CCHMC FORM 948 (fi<wts«f) 
1 APR 96 

CC?V" i ~ Corrtrador-e ^epressRicii-.'.: 



UJS» ARMY 1 AND SUPPORT CINTGfl, HUNTSVtLLE 
ORDNANCE AND BIPLOSfViOROUP 

TO; 

U€l* Erw 

SATE: 

If fCD .1 nfi 
PROJECT LOCATION: 

D o t h 

CONTRACT NUMKR: 

DO#: 

°^1 • ¥TE* t\t€-
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Mm 
(~~J Safety VWaflon 

f~} Safety Comments 

PESCRIPTlON:TW £ ̂I ' P W I ^ 

(Check all ttiat apply); 

" Q Quality Control 

I " ! Other 

J | -

-Jpf 

ft 2 -f t f . iv pl.vfr \ftco--ViL<i cd- 1 , 3 1 6 fcnort 

f tQ 'fcua. ipv^- i i irTaft TQ P h i l i p &obbtA<, J r ^ 

a Proust e«rr»eiot¥ or 

^ \fJrA -~~-

USAGE Sis 

, <^u+£l/ /C A^-^X-, 

ACTION TAKEN: 

i f j g g f j j 1 ^ " * fR"*«!> ' COPVi-ConBMtort-RiprtSBnWlw 

file:///fJrA


U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSWIXi 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
1 IPBIC-P TO 

JJ^B £>rtY, 

DATE: 

1L A^f OS 
CA1 

J46Q 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
OO O "1 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

btfT rve . r t 
^ C _ 

SUBJECT ITEMCS) 

• Work Plan 

Q Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

PESCfllFTIONTTW ^oWnw 

(Check all that apply): 
""-fT] Quality Control 

O Other 
ProtCt." 

Lv^t fr 
-r'UQCi OS<L<i-lj 

ft £ *b rson • & i W » . . ^ \ r\^ -T"c PkI\ \ l i ) Kobb i n S H L 

£. \- V \ K- fo ftU k u fo, u / M CT V^ tNsLi 

I j Prompt correction or eongfane© with contract aptecificattons is requested. 

USAGE Site Bepreswrtathra 

RicapT AamomiJEtmBQ^^f^-
Coniractoi's Ftepresentalive 

ACTION TAK1N: 

CEHNC FORM MS (Revised) 
1APfiS6 COPY 1 -Csrttt«elor*sR©pr«trtativ© 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE ©ROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

t JS rt £ N V 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D0#: 
GLCuL 

DATE: 

17 har 0% 

TIME: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 
fftKMEft, CAM? B v C T ^ t ^ 

(Check all that apply): 

O Quality Control 

"ST] Other _. ^ f i 

SUiJECT ITEM(S) 
Q Wort Ran 

[ " ] Safety Violation 

P I Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:! c k r , r r V . J U < , f \ f c n V . C o n t L r t i V t t ) 

-?-

A ins. TMtyK ̂  f i v v / " ^ A ^ ; :ifc-

3 
n 

fr /^ / ) . flq <s.»J u&Kd -fL^i ^f^A^s*^ 
Prompt correction or compliance with contract 

USAGE Site Representative 

RECHPT ACKNOWLEDGED: L.^r^^^_ y^^*StS^^~*-
ir*s Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CBHNC FOBM 948 (Rffvisw!) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S, ARMY iNdNEEFMNQ AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUMTSVUJLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO: 

1.'5* ^ y 

DATE: 

aB Aflr CM 

TIME; 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

0 0 #: 
.OPCLI . 

PROJECT LOCATION; 

(Check aH that apply): 
""ED Quality Control 

Other Fr^«c# f f g w /© 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
Q Work Plan 

Q Safely Violation 

f~| Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: T u e foix.o<>ot»&& ftfc£ft PftSSgb 

_ f t _ U £ A C E . O f t i K J ^ P E o T f a ^ fl Tfa&c* 

ftcfce 
.. — --— - - — - — — - -----

^ T b MICHE.ftL. fr\fttfeu<u / W ^ l l 8 | t 

a Prompt corractiQn or with contract spJeciMtiona is 

4e*£&*4y±r3_ 

requested. 

USAGE Site Represwutahve 
"CQC*-~-

Bf CBPT ACKNOWLEDGED^. *Z*yjj£~t^^ 
Contractor's 

ACTION TAICIM: 

CEHNC PORM 948 (RivissdJ 
1APR96 

COPY 1 ~ Contractor's Reprassntaiwi 



u,& ARMV eeweewc AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVULE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

U S A fc-MM, 

DATE: TIME: 

PROJECT LOCATION: CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D 0 # : 
0007 

{Check ai tiat apply): 

"^Rl Quality Control 

• Other ft^c4 ^ « * JI 

sya i i cT ITEMCS) 
Q WoAPtan 
f~l Safety Violation 
| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTIQN:THt- VoL- i .C i lOH^( i <\ r ^ v . rt\i£*i D 

t>**Ac t M , , n :, -V E. '*-' ^ ^ c y Po<Ag. rO.^VN ( U Q V T \ --%") 

/ ~ x , c~hiu\.u{ i-~o i t o L c •-—• •—/ 

Prompt osmsotion « wmpltoce with coi specifications is requested. 

Jt 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 

' USAGE S«e RepresantalMe 

Contractor's Rsp«safflatlve 

ACTION TAKEN: 

OEHNC FORM MB {Revise* 
1 APR m 

COPV 1 -Coatr«Cl«i'r*»'R«sres«nlftlf» 



UA ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CEIfTER, HIMTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

Hsu fc-iw 
DATE: ' TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
0 0 0 "7 

PROJECT LOCATION; 
™ & t J V. L% T tS\T(\St 

p w u f , K C ^ 
(Check ail that apply): 

• Quality Control 

^ - 0 Other P ^ e j - £ H < j 3 * l 2 _ 

SUBJECT !TEM{S) 
Q work Plan 

f~ l Safe^f Violation 

(~~| Safety Comments 1 

DESCRIPTION:! , q < , , , f t W 4 - - W P U ^ C D > n * f > . A ^ * , 

.-., m ^ r JJJ-- vr-l c- \&cl„aA C^AT ̂ ^*r T W K EC-air A _TO TK>_S 

Prompt correction or compliance With contract specifications is requested. 

USAGE Site Representative 

flIECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: (^,'j-j/ * / . ' : ~ ^ _.'_ 
Contractor's Representative 

A©fleN^AKHfe^lV. ^ 

K.- m t» \ ^ s t * *»> Skipped r f ( - s A o . . f^e , U b c W i c 

/ - -™ A/or>MNG, f - f , t _ t . o t j - J . — / 

CEHNC FORM 948 {RevlMWi) 
1 APR 96 \iCn Ccntracj.-'s lu«"5ts t|«tfv 

U S . ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVUXE 
OR0MANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO; 

•Li.5^ k I2JL 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
mt%i 

DATE: TIME: 

115'^ 
PROJECT LOCATION: i 

1 v r N> 
ii 

(Check all that apply): 

~^t£l Quality Control 

• Other < M B " * 13 

SUBJECT !TEM(S) 
Q Work Plan 

f~1 Safety violator) 

f l Safety Communis 

DESCRIPTION: Tt-X C t r i- t-O ^ > *> ^ ^. f\ T e ̂ - % . .._. 

4 7 1 C M & r i a- k R. I (^^ \.-\S) )aPA i> * ^ . . ft c 

C L ^ Y Y > - \ A N b e W f r ft^ •VIJ U f c . . >Aa..>Cju Bft t 

/ A J g r H < >\) £ f v • / / r t L O U — — — / 

n Prompt cormcUon or compliance with contract pfntifications is retjw&stwl 

flECEIPT ACKMOWLEDOiO:. 

USAGE Site Ripresantativo 

Contractor's RapraMfflatlw 

ACnW TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 94B (Rewte»d) 
1 APR 98 

1Q* \\ -.-;I.-,I .nnti".'1^ 



U.S. ARMY ENGiNEERiNG AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

j j S f l £ f s i V , 

DATE: TIME: 

0£5Q 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
0 0 0 1 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check ail that apply): 

^iZ\ Quality Control 

• Other <W<8* ZD 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

( | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION. fK \*sg a P T C QLre.0. W « 4 e < i 

Z •tiOTHtNGj feU-O^fr' = ^ / 

n Prompt correction or compliance with contract tcations is requested. 

J *r@ihJMQ KXXK^_ 
USACE Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED *<£*£&/^/£**&-^ 
Conlractor*s Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM S48 (Rented 
1 APR §t 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



! '' x AW?"* £NG.ui£ERINt; AJ-JD SUPPORT CPN ,-^R, HUNTSVtU .& . 
>.''-IDNAfoC- ; WH EXPLOSIVE Ghi/JP l 

IT-:- } t-^TE- . ""•« 

t?3 X,-_'.J3J_1±CUL_J 
CT -R&CT.'. /v"BEFL ^aOJECT'..OCjaTION: 

*oo V i , ; 

| SL&.-; f ;TtTEM(&; i'Chec> all that apply,, 

[ 2 ^'u.HpJa:. Q QuaGtyC. .\ • j 

i ! "* f la le^ VK.L-;..»'; | [ j Other L^ ^ ^ • ."••'' f 

r • , Safe1'.;i '"rJiiiisnUi ' 
» — " , , i <• 

^'v' C ' * ' '• ^ ^ i 

l ) _j ; , '.-'iif!?;.. .:rnpi;anc.c -\- *.*-. T^'rac* .specifications it, ii^uttSied 

|_ 
._.i::32xX: 

seCESK'' '.CKNOWLeiK»e»;_;4i^; 
effractory Hepmssniative 

i HON "••<-••'PN: 

N 



US. ARMY ENGINE1RING AND SUPPORT CSNTER, HUNTSVIUJi 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO; 

Ufa A Et4v LNCL 

DATE: 

(/k 
TIME: 

If 36 
PROJECT LOCATION 

femvpit GIMP 6tmJE&| 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
i?gD7 

SUBJECT rTEM{S} 

f*~l Work Plan 

Q Safety Violation 

F 1 Safety Comments 

DiSCRIPTlONrirtg 

(Check att that apply): 

~^Cn Quality Control 

• Other <M8"** 3X-

ftn J Jg 
HTQNl; pA«eJ ^ UgACE ^>A 

l n 6 
z ^ -A/OT*A lN& P& L-U&LS$ — 

y/Z 
RECEIf T ACKNOWLEDGED: 

Cocuraetoi's 
ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 9*6 (Rwised) 
1 APR 96 

;OPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSV1LLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

MSft E ^ v . 
DATE: 

iq 3une O9L 1 b c o 

TIME; 

CONTRACT NUMBER; 

DO#; 
£CC7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

K H I ^ , tte 
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

|~1 Wortt Plan 

Safety Violation 

Safety Comments 

(Check all that apply): 

"*—•&] Ouftity Coptrol 

• Other <t-f6*& Q)\ 

DESCRIPTION:"TK^ N \ K £ P C \eib-rtiS\Ce. dCT 

£ -(VOTHlhit^ PoL.U>u><> — -I 

a Prompt correction or corrjaliaQce with conirgqj specifications is requested. 

USACE Site Representative 

REC1PT ACKNOWLEDGE! 

USACE " " 

Contractor's Rtprsssmtalw 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 94S (RwriMdl 
lAP f lW ' 

COPY 1 -Contractor's Representative 

file:///eib-rtiS/Ce


*' ' ?i muy ewNeeRP!^ ANU ̂ ; W «T I : L ~ R HUNTS.' ,,r - =? • 
OH DN A f-i C : " . v ' ' t: XP LC Cf: r. ' - NO U ? I 

. ^ E M Q _ _ _„_ [ 

i i -CONTPA.::7 "-."JVC"?0: • cRv.<ut..- «' L ^^ " T 'O i v ; 

*~- v. 
I * *- J--1 J » ^ " - • y w ~ r -

•'Jhecv*: all thai apply!; 

L_J Quality Control 
SUBJECT iTEM(S} 

' l-vcrk Plr.n 

• i I Saie:v Vkk'-r-'~ 
1 !~~I Satei'.- Cur>u,,i- t" 

f QEscgiPTioN- _.4,. r"iN\ii.P_..„.i^Jr<^s-i-i .... 

t 
T 1= 

- — A •' "<" -J - , i ti J ^ 

P'-iRpT C"-:r.^.. j J ^jnqplVsnnr- rtii!" conlrae' L'rc>:' f ''ryt f " f n - e ™ i » 

I - -
:.r^r,iWt,iw*UA-~-V- r&i 

UhY-JJt Sne Representative 

* K e.PV AOKNQWLEOGEDCscifi 
L.o i, actors Representative 

t f ^ " iT j» j * r 5 l f F l s l 

! i A P " •?': 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING ANO SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSw 
ORONANC1 AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO; 

(fofr ^ V ,4^ 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 

coo 7 

OATi: 

n ?Miti ^ 

TIME; 

PROJECT LOCATION: 
FofcmER C f tw ip E u T N E f c 

(Check att that apply): 

" " f j ] Quality Control 

O Other erf Q 4 * -jfa 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

[*1 Safety Violation 

[ I Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION7 ! "^ t^ tAR. f i C U e J r \ g K l ^ C £ f\T 

/ • - /V _- r r t / rJ G. f fl A. L f l u . C 

I J Prompt correction or with contract 

GMA^a 

is requested, 

*• v " £ - —• 

USAOE Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: •____ |A/fi rs / ,-_ 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM S4B {BaviSBd) 
1 APRSi COPY 1 - Cdfiiractor's Re press ntative 

tAR.fi


U.& MMi ENGINEERING AND SyPPORT CENTS*, HUNTSVlLLi 
ORDNANCEAND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

t_VS>f\ E t A V . l ^ K ^ 

DATE: 

si^u otingo 
TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D0#: 
OQC~l 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

""""fH Quality Contra! 

• Othar ^ 4 t " * 3 J 

SUBJECT ITEM(8) 
| | Work Plan 

I Safety Violation 

| Safety Comments 

OESCRIPTiONmx*. M M f t P r . L f c ^ R f t v ^ C e . t\T 

EC&C C L A P T O N £Jl f U M I T ^ - d 6 0 ^ ( , l ^ 

Cfr (^PECTIQ^/ — / 
^ -A/crr-HihJC F*t I-ALS^— Y 

a Prompt correction or compliance with contract is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED;. 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 {ftsviied} 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENQINE1HING AND SUPPORT CENTS*, HUNTSVUJJE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

TO: 

U S A Eia,sJ, 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
ec>(pi 

DATE; TIME: 

,,.fll U'>' i4o 
PROJECT LOCATION 

(Checfc all that apply): 
" ^ 0 , Quality Control 

Q Other • q ^ & l * 5 5 " 

SUBJECT !TEM(S) 

^ ] Work Plan 
P I Safety Violation 

^ Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:^^ M ^ R P <LlfcmgArirf».g A T 

44T7 q C L P ^ T O H ftj fc-7) P^geEt> ft 
USfisCE DA I r tSPECTt f ld , A — • / 

L J Prompt correction or is requested. 

RECEIPT ACWNOWLEttQEfe /££&?£/ •£-
Contractor's I 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (RwisMfl 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - Conlf«*or"s Representative 



O R ^ * ^ P- AND EXPLOSIVE G R O i ^ 
_____ _ MJ=M0 

i 

jmjUieieni tBff«^«aeaaauri iFi~" ' " ~" '* "*' 

PO #' 

( . :SOJECTLO.-4 , /3M: 

^ f i V 

T.*"&r,; .-,;, --|At a p r r )' 

i X j Qjai i ry." .Mtrr'' 

,- I i clatif.) i t h r - V^i^ --.a 

'J l , - t -

RL.. uc=T *CS;(iOWLLoG(?"' ,V 
v'.^iOi'. "• ".reitfrtan.-e 

ACT"*>N TAKEK: 

• JEHHC F-" 
1 .' ' : : 3S 



; •_•.* AftMv f™3INEERING AND SUPPORT reMTER, K'J«7«. .t-L 
5 "ROMANCE AND EXPLOSIVE ? n - U P 
I MEMO 

•TO' DM i t : 1 TiM i 
1 ' " :"- fiw%.. . f J H ' - i - . - C ' ; ' !•"• 

v ,«i r«» * <•>••' MUMbtn . J PR1'JZ.OV » OCATK>w-

J OO #: 
r.'viT»^tci fuC_.. 

: S'.'B.lf-^TrrEMit, I .iCK afirhat ap:»;
;; • 

I L._,i Wfir^ P'»i " * b j Ouaiit" Control I 

j [ J Safe:;'violation • OShf< -, 4 Q # ~£>£̂  S 

' L J Safety Cor r - ?-.ts • 

,•• —~ •. w_ J f i i f ' iLf ro1J £• c u b "" .. -..:;"———~~ f » 

:S r*»"f- "...a L i ; i rO'1% ; cc«Ten :-~" 01 ra-ri_jjia.ri.ic « i ih c^ r t rac l sp f lc l f i r i ! i , •-.•;, 

HI .. _-.•'; ACKNOWL£DGfci;;_ 

USAGE Site r- ...teslntitlvc 

Contractors Rep-er-^talwie -

i -

t 
I C L . M . " NM 94.H I'Hevisfl:.' . | 
? i APR Ri: ' t 

ra-ri_jjia.ri.ic


U.S. mm 3INEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

05/f5 
DATE: TIME: 

0 7&G 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
Qcc?7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

0~-Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

[ | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: Qf,,PS Ctt,£*/,£3Z, Cty. 

Vl<* X^J Fw F17> F17 fill &*7 

<*4 \ ' V 

• 
Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

SACe-Site.RSpliesentative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 

t . ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILi 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 
USfi£ 

DATE: 

l/U/cb 
TIME: 
/ 3 < o 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
Oo®7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

cm 
(Check all that apply): 

0 . Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

j | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: GfLi/23 JL3C , D 2*1 B 7F} C^7 -12$ 

Oafr £-2% fXV GX<k /K2fr for? £27 Y> 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY w JINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

05/9E 
DATE: TIME: 

/3od 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
Ooo] 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 
R 1 Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

I I Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: Qii(?S £31 V *£& hh/^tf 

Ltfl&i&w /Tr 4- OePTt. o/^ s ' ' ff3o hft£ A 
^•36 "Rcckr? SryTotL CftA£n\ UiTk. fc^5 tf? P 

Dffrt o£ / - / K ^ N V̂ 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 

ACTION TAKEN: 

Contractor's Representative 

t CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

>* . 
.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSV 

ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 
MEMO 

TO: 

Us^Pt 

DATE:, 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D O # : O&e 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 
W\ Quality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: C&<t>S> TZ^ M,13 AOZ-C32 

3~S( PAJC) •V '̂7 Ufa?' 7c//Z*&> Ov'£/i. f=~o/Z G?4 

I I Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

*£*u££s 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 



U.S. ARMY L JNEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

03/^F 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 
i^r^iXQ y- &y ..0 - pop £ 

DO#: C&3 7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

CM J 
(Check all that apply): 

/ Q - Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: /ffo?5 -£k7 H32. K&J3233/ M19 

D f Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 
r-

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 

I ArtMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVIlf 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

usfic 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: c?c**>~? 

PROJECT LOCATION: 
Qjf POTTER-, As<~ 

(Check all that apply): 
J/^L Quality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
| | Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: flA** 032,330^^25 
^ 

I I Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

""TJSAC&Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 



U-.S.ARMY> SNEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

US/9F 
DATE: 

^</>A; 

TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
OGO' 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

Jx^Qual i ty Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I 1 Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: C^WS C J I 33CJ YCtf />£Ss^ 

• Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 

US^eE Site Representative 

Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

? A P R C 9 6 O R M 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

3. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVf 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
nl 

TO: 

WSAB' 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

NC 
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

[ | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: f l y " 

(Check all that apply): 

p 3 Quality Control 

• Other 

£ASin\ *& J5 A a*s<* 

<J5~F33\ HS-aZO *£?-&$ItY*-H3cf 

Thfnsf hsit4<t.is/ 2: 
dL££-<zat£2*c_ 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARIWT SNEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

U SAB 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: cvofp 

D O # : 

°*>-f 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

C a m p lpX3lT\h^h 

JVC 
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:T%/L £»?7<>g^n i 

(Check all that apply): 
0 Quality Control 
• Other 

# ^ 
iA h os-

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

\ ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVII ^ | 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP J 

MEMO 

TO: 
USb &?v\BWMtolAL 

DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: T f t £ FaLLovJ/A/Cj Qfi\rA /4AS 

(Check all that apply): 
I | Quality Control 
• Other 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

USftCI 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMYf iilNEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

(Pft £Vi)\fiOAJMeA/T4L 
DATE: TIME: 

MM 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

r\r\ #. I DO#: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

/JC 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: T t i £ £DLLQ\JJ t/Ufo GRW 

(Check all that apply): 

|~1 Quality Control 

• Other 

IT/IS FAM A Q/A lAyfaTiQfiJ' A 
1 

>3Jk 

r= A/olA WG Fblfrw? 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

? A P R C 9 6 O R M 948 (Revised> C O P Y 1 ' Contractors Representative 

S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, H U N T S M ^ f 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

03 A E 
DATE: TIME: 

HMovM \liV3~ 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

W<H1'D\/~OV-D~DOQL 
DO#: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

I I Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION:fflf; Fp\(0\d/Ati. 

(Check all that apply): 

I | Quality Control 

• Other 

GfilQS Hm fhttFfi 

*jS- C% fr.'dl. . Wi-C. tf. 4T- CM HT-DaO! 

fry*, joihi OP f/t CRitb, 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:/ 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 • Contractor's Representative 

file:///liV3~


U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE 6ROUP 

MEMO 

roSCAXoS M ^ H ^ DATE; TIME: 

07?o 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
DOGl 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 
53 Ouality Control 
M Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
0 Work Plan 

Q Safety Violation 

Q Safely Comments 

DESCRIPTION: (f/>i eL 0~$$ HAS P**-**. r*-<+* d'tLJ. 

l \ j Prompt correctton of compliai 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 

;rspepfficaiions ts raquesletl-

ConSractor's Representative 

£>*• •#-*.«. A^ t f v e £!-*•«-*. •^°/q SW£C ;A<iM.wi, 

?APR16ORM *" ( R e ¥ i s e* COPY 1 - Contractors Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

l0: $(A.WSJ U' r * *"'~° DATE: 

7f^ d& 
if >CA 

TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: &<&(=> 

D O # : 

ooo y 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

C<K^jp> (j<cf-K.^m L)C— 
SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: / n<=cf~/)o/"hjQ^- o / 6~rl<LT~~// 

(Check all that apply): 

[ X f Quality Control 

• Other 

n Prompt correction or compliant e With contract specifications isi-equested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: The. ^ * ^ « i , ^ , f » k*J 

tf)£c -ftn^. 

fa?M P4«(&J 
CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 • Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

S'l\Xt>jMs# £*..• 
DATE: 

£>6 
TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D O # : 
0001 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 7""%*^ ?4> f 4-)0*• o-f <£// J U~H 

(Checkfell that apply): 

S i Quality Control 

• Other 

ff fk*t) f m/j-Hlw 4-1*. rtof*. af-l-L*. «.lo«*<-

~h*.*k ask** his jiAtfei Ur^gKv/>-t»wW^/ 

\\tri & W/2S* LttOACf 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 
i 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

fee efs,^-1 *c SO *^> (£/#X~s/'*c-*So*. ^ 

£M> flj0^f7smz:r 

?APRC96°R M 948 (ReViSed) C O P Y 1 " Contractor's Representative 

file:////tri


U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

USqE 
DATE: TIME: 

CDB30 

CONTRACT NUMBER: PROJECT LOCATION: 

DO#: 
OOOJ 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) (Check all that apply): 

f~~] Work Plan #j§] Quality Control 

| | Safety Violation • Other 

• Safety Comments ffyoOgcT fW & / 

DESCRIPTION: G~f.<D S 7? €( ~Z~> Y Y6 Lsffa-

Prompt correction or compliance wMthjflQltactspeeifieations-i&xequested. 

3ACE Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED : QA^C^> //4Z£/<£-
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

"6M£ 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: oooj 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) (Check all that apply): 

f~ l Work Plan Q Quality Control 

[ " I Safety Violation Q Other 

• Safety Comments /3&>4er ? « f f£ 3 . 

DESCRIPTION: QfU&S Z<£ , Z 7 ^ * # fife&S* 

D Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

? A P R C 9 6 ° R M 948 (Revised) COPY1 " Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

US&£ 
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
cxxy-y 

D A T E ^ V A T T I M E : 

/OOO 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

L£/c£ iS'£ <~> 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) (Check all that apply): 

[~] Work Plan p ^ Quality Control 

f~ l Safety Violation Q j Other 

• Safety Comments / W - e r ^ t f P^J 

DESCRIPTION: GP^'^S Y^" 'K<T.- US< V ^ ^C 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED; 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

[CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

RIF3G AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

I 

TO: 
USft£ 

DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
C?cfo 7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(Check all that apply): 

]K\ Quality Control 

• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

j [ Safety Violation 

| j Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: / 5 T * » < " " / * ^ £ V ^ ^ f^S<.£-/? 

^ 

• Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 • Contractor's Representative 



I U S : ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 
uSfrB 

DATE: TIME: 

0 70Q 

, CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D O # : 
c>ooy 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

CP Q>UTASC/2. AsC 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: Gfl(DS S7, S f, S7, )C £ , p g , 

TKTP if' L><k t^£C<S TVM> ov££ &L Qd 

(Check all that apply): 
J3"~Quality Control 
• Other 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:_ 
Contractors Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

?APRC96°RM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

TJ.S.'ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

U$A£ 
DATE: 

I/XS/OJ-
TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: PROJECT LOCATION: 

DO#: Cj4te?Ui/3i><s 
aooy 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: G-l£(J>S 37, S ? , S*7 . X 6 , ~Z9 

(Check all that apply): 
0 Quality Control 
• Other „ _ 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



US. ARlOlY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

U5$(Z 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
oco? 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) (Check all that apply): 

|~1 Work Plan /0 -JDua l i t y Control 

j | Safety Violation Q Other 

• Safety Comments fficJfCT 9 V? tr & 

DESCRIPTION: £ / g / A > 3/Q, fcl t T& .T9, V? f 

~J\£ £(Zfis</b}ts<^ USQS/^7 CLPtiAZ/), Q C 
oa GLA7 V ^ 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

.. USACEijiW Representative x . 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

?APRC96ORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

LKS.AR&Y ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

US/96 
DATE;* 

944-
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
OC»7 

TIME: 

C7^C 
PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) (Check all that apply): 

• Work Plan ©--Qual i ty Control 

| | Safety Violation [ ] ] Other 

• Safety Comments fpJiJfcr <9<s? - ^ 7 

DESCRIPTION: (}£(OS 3/0, &7 , T $ . 7 7 , V* Y U7 

W£fi£ 7bfa/?/? QtS&t fg£ <3 /h (1/ZiJK Tfr 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

?!SnCo«0RM 948 (Revised> COPY 1 - Contractors Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

. ^ Z T 
DATE: TIME: 

o 7 « ? 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D O # : QCCl 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

j [ Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: G-faPS 

(Check all that apply): 

Quality Control 

• Other 

C*sLT& fCfC &4 V s 

I I Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION T A K E N : 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) C O P Y 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

U^PiF 
DATE: 

MA-
CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D O # : Ooay 

TIME: 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

| j Safety Violation 

| j Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: &£<£>5 ^ Y ^ Y &flS2tf& 

(Check all that apply): 

[~1 Quality Control 

• Other 

Ccvffr OB' A 

• Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

?APRC96ORM 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractcrs Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

Uifir 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 
l^? fl 0 V - O V - 0 - Q°a< 
DO#: aooy 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 

• Work Plan 

[ [ Safety Violation 

| j Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: C-Q-iOS 

(Check all that apply): 

O ^ Quality Control 

• Other 

y, to, u//o, c 6 yg f 7>o 
/ W UJ Us£dP T^/i^£D CKr/Sfi fO/Z Q A \ - \ 

I I Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications Is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED:. 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

?!£oCr,fORM 948 (Revised> COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
11 APR 96 

U.S.* ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
DATE: I TIME: TO: 

USftE 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

o 

DO# 
000 7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) (Check all that apply): 

• Work Plan [ g j Quality Control 

| | Safety Violation Q Other 

• Safety Comments fifa/GZT—9r* & SO 

DESCRIPTION: £&iQ£ tf/Q , UJ/Q; QA. , L ^ T~rG 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED: 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

? A P R ( 9 6 ° R M 948 (Revised) COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

03/3/r 
DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
occ/ 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

| | Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: 

(Check all that apply): 

0 - Q u a l i t y Control 

• Other 

1/°! Utte TcrtsufO Ovc& £b<L CX/I \ ^ 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

ACE Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
l l APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 
TO: 

OS/9 /"2 
DATE: 

e-b 

TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
co&y 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I | Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: &(lfPS 

(Check all that apply): 

J 3 - Quality Control 

• Other 

~Z r a/o. UiQ. LJ f fu9 
fti&SSD CO^/IAJ-^,^-7 <3LA\T 

^ 

I I Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 
O-S/9/5 

DATE: 

///Yc Ol 

TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

U/?/2Qv~ ay - 0 - °oe 6' 
DO#: 

O0&7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 

(_LfltirvtJsu] 

(Check all that apply): 
i ^ L Quality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

[ j Safety Violation 

| | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: GtlG-^ ^ 7 . X S . X~7, V 7 fad V9 

Lj£g£ TVfr/gy) oojg/C pofl Cjtf. fiAjy Pm Or-

Tl^Sf QfLto<> TkfrT MM e?-~- P^g fifcfeAly oF 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
1 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 

U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

CJ5/9£ 
DATE: 

9 *& 
TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

D 0 # : aco 7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 
<Zp (JxJT^cfi 

f LA&ei/.'f us ) 

(Check all that apply): 
0>J3uality Control 
• Other 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I [ Safety Violation 

I | Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: T 9 , T/O. UV.LtlU?. U'O'. >/ (C 1/7. 

I'R. vl.vio.kJ-7. X7. xp . *9 Y7 , VZ.V9 

? « f C&/)*£/ ) . UJ&S A/d~T 

CUftarJ? <£ 

Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

Site Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED^ 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

? «S°JORM 948 (Revised> COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 
1 APR 96 



U.S. ARMY ENGINEERING AND SUPPORT CENTER, HUNTSVILLE 
ORDNANCE AND EXPLOSIVE GROUP 

MEMO 

TO: 

USA, 

DATE: TIME: 

CONTRACT NUMBER: 

DO#: 
oaO -7 

PROJECT LOCATION: 
^ r r^C 

(Check all that apply): 
Q Quality Control 

D °ther 

SUBJECT ITEM(S) 
• Work Plan 

I I Safety Violation 

[ [ Safety Comments 

DESCRIPTION: /%?Tl f iL , C/2,/?S U7, U%^f. 

/ w Pun- Qh Ttesf £*'*•* ~tkflr A/?£ a*J 
£-3? Oft CSX ISH&Vtfr^ Ls£Af M5T CA&/&/? 

• 
Prompt correction or compliance with contract specifications is requested. 

Representative 

RECEIPT ACKNOWLEDGED 
Contractor's Representative 

ACTION TAKEN: 

CEHNC FORM 948 (Revised) 
11 APR 96 

COPY 1 - Contractor's Representative 



ANNUAL REPORT - REMOVAL ACTION AT FORMER CAMP BUTNER 

BUTNER, NORTH CAROLINA 

APPENDIX F. LOCATION PROFESSIONAL LAND SURVEYS 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 

Page F-1 



PRESENTED FOR REGISTRATION THIS DAY 

OF , 200 AT O'CLOCS-

AND REGISTERED iN THE OFFICE OF REGISTER OF 

DEEDS FOR „ _ CO., N.C. BOOK N0._ 

PAGE N 0 . „ _ _ 

REGISTER OF DEEDS 

NOTE: THE LINES AROUND THIS PERIMETER OF THE 2 6 . 3 2 ACRES ARE 
NOT REPRESENTING A BOUNDARY SURVEY. THIS IS A CONTROL SURVEY 
AS REQUESTED BY USA ENVIRONMENTAL ON BEHALF OF THE US ARMY 
CORP OF ENGINEERS. 

ROBERTS CHAPELL 

VICINITY MAP 
WOT TO SCALE 

GPS 
CONTROL 

t N=9O3,5OO.04 
-E=2.076.626.!2 
(NAD B3-FEET) 

\ 

( 

NOTES : 

ONLY THE NOTES MARKED BELOW WITH AN (X) APPLY TO THIS PLAT, 
AND THE SUBJECT PROPERTY SHOWN. 

> STATE GRID STATION 

( X ) B.) THE COORDINATE METHOD WAS USED TO COMPUTE THE AREA(S) 
SHOWN ON THIS PLAT. 

( ) C.) THERE..IS-A-NEW/-IRGNPIPE (Nip) ON ALL PROPERTY CORNERS 

USL£fcr::oWERWlSE" NOTED ON' THIS PLAT.' SEE' SYMBOLS. 

( X > 6.) THIS SURVEY^WAVOONE ' ;Wr iHQ^ BASIS 
OF THIS SURVEY.IS ;THE.'REFERENCED "INFORMATION: . 

(X . ) F.) ALL DISTANCES.ARE HORIZONTAL GROUND, UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED. 

( X ) G.) NO FLOOD HAZARDS. HAVE. BEEN DETERMINED ON THIS PROPERTY 

. UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED. 

GRAPHIC SCALE - FEET 

LEGEND. / SYMBOLS 
EIP 
NIP 
EPK 
NPK 
ECPS 
NCP5 
ERRS 
:NRRS 
ECM 
NCM 
-FO 
GP 
TP 
PB-
R/W 

3EIP 
CB 
^ S -
Lft 
N&C 
H&T 
MH 
FH 
OHU 
.PP 
E-100.0' 
S.T.S. 
UGE 
UGTV 
UGTC 

EXISTING IRON.PIPE OR ROD 
NEWi'IRON PIPE OR PIN 
EXiSFTNG'PK NAIL 
NEW.-PK NAIL, 

. EXISTING COTTON SPINDLE SPIKE 
..NEW'COtTON-.SPINDLE-SPIKE 
EXISTING.̂ RAILROAD. SHKE 
NEW.' RAiUROAB 'SPIKE - :. 
EXISTING CONCRETE 'MONUMENT' 
NEW-CONCRETE MONUMENT • 
FIBER: OPTICS. WITNESS POST ' 

.COMPUTED POINT -~-NOTHING-SET 
TELEPHbNE-PEDESTAL ' 
POWER BOX: 

RIGHT:0F.WAY. . 
" SEWER.CLEANOUT-

'BENT IRQN':PtPE OR ROD 
.- CATCH -BASIN: 

SANITARY SEWER LINE 
• •AREA:'LiGHT^ON .SUPPORT'POLE : 
,NAIL AND.CAP 
HUB:AND-":TACK 
MANHOUE COVER . 
FIRE-HYDRANT- • 
OVERHEAQJJTIUTY UNES 
POWER POLE. 

SPOT ELEVATION. 
NOT-TO SCALE 
UNDERGROUND ELECTRICAL UNES 
UNDERGROUND'TV. GAB't£ 
UNDERGROUND: TELEPHONE CABLE 

I.-.DOROTHY K: ^CURRIN, P.LS.. HEREBY CERTIFY TO 
. . •ANY-'BF :-THE-FOLHOWING::'-.. 

T . ) -THAT THE:. SURVEY, IS' ; .0F. AN EXISTING PARCEL ."' 
OR :PASCE£S :-:OF;LAND AND DOES ; NOT CREATE• A . 

' . ;NEW:'StREEt; OR ̂ CHANGE AN EXISTING "STREET;v: . . 
-'a.yTHAT-'THE'SUR^^'ISroV-'-AViiEyCTN'G'BoiLDlNG":. 
,. bft:rblHER-'S'TRli!(^Re;--OR''''ltoTHRAL'^TURE."-". 
" ..SUGH."AS;.A:.:«ATE[!CDURSE;" \" . 
i jVTHAT THE SURVEY- IS A CONTROL SURVEY. w ::/L -P.L;S.~L-3654 

1. -DOROTHY:K. CURRIN," CERTIFY THAT THIS PLAT WAS DRAWN" UNDER MY 
SUPERVISION FROM AN'ACTUAL SURVEY MADE UNDER . MY. SUPERVISION 
(DEED DESCRIPTION' RECOREDED IN BOOK SEE, PAGE- REF,-;EtC.} • 

N-COTHER); THAT THE BOUNDARIES NOT SURVEYED ARE'CLEARLT INDICATED ' 
AS" DRAWN FROM INFORMATION FOUND IN BOOK SEE, PAGE REF; . 
THAT THE; RATIO OF PRECISION AS CALCULATED IS -1:16,000*; THAT, 
THIS-PLAT. WAS.PREPARE!) IN ACCORDANCE-:WITHG:S:47-30' AS AMENDED. . 

AGCULINE SURVEYING 
2555 CAPITOL DRIVE, SUITE D, CREEDMGOR, NC 27522 

TELEPHONE 919-528-7979 FAX 919-528-5959 
DOROTHY K. CURRIN, RLS L-3654 
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ANNUAL REPORT - REMOVAL ACTION AT FORMER CAMP BUTNER 
BUTNER, NORTH CAROLINA 

APPENDIX G. OPERATIONS REPORTS 

This appendix contains the following documentation: 

• SUXOS Daily Operations Reports (on CD) 

• Weekly Operations Summaries (on CD). 

This space is intentionally left blank. 

Contract No.: W912DY-04-D-0006; Task Order No. 0007 
Original: 20 January 2009 
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3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

General. The title of the report should include 2008 to annotate the year and differentiate 
from future reports. 

General. The title of the next version of the report should include Draft Final for NCDENR 
review, as this version was the Draft version. 

Page 2-1, section 2.0. Figure D-2 should be referenced in the next to last sentence in the 
first paragraph to illustrate the current status of the removal action. 

Sections 2.6 through 2.14. Recommend discussing the removal action in chronological 
order. For example, Lakeview (section 2.11) should come before Area 4A (section 2.7). 

Sections 2.6 through 2.14. The grid tracking sheets and UXO accountability log in 
Appendix B should be referenced in the discussion of the removal action for the specific 
areas in sections 2.6 through 2.14. 

Tables 2-1 through table 2-6. The tables should include a column to identify if/where MEC 
items were discovered. 

Page 2-5, section 2.6.3. The third sentence states the M15 smoke grenade was moved to the 
location of the Ml training anti-vehicular land mine smoke canister and blown in place as a 
consolidated shot. However, figure D-3, the grid tracking log for Area 1 A, and the UXO 
accountability record indicate both items were discovered in grid 41-B23, but detonated in 
grid 41-B24. Please address. Page 2-7, section 2.7.2. Spell out IAW in the second sentence. 

Page 2-8, section 2.8.2. The third sentence incorrectly references brush clearing in Area 4C. 
Please correct to Area 4B. 

Page 2-8, Table 2-1. Only the property owner name is identified in table 2-1. Recommend 
using the address in lieu of the property owner or both for clarification. 

Page 2-10, table 2-2. The rationale for conducting the clearance at the Anthony Howerton 
Silo area was because a mobile home/trailer was in the vicinity which potentially could be 

Title changed to include "2008". 

Title to be changed on next version to "Draft Final". 

Sentence added to reference Figure D-2 in Sec 2.0, 
Paragraph 1, next to last sentence, Page 2-1. 

Lakeview removal action discussion (section) has been 
moved to precede Area 4A removal action discussion. 

A sentence referencing grid tracking sheets and the UXO 
Accountability Log in Appendix B has been added in each 
of Sections 2.6 through 2.14. 

An additional column was added to tables for areas where 
MEC was found. 

The Weekly Operations Summary for the week ending 18 
Feb 06 indicates that both MEC were moved from their 
individual locations in Grid 41-B23 to a safer location in 
Grid 41-B24 to be BIP. Section 2.6.3 has been revised to 
so state. All other references in Appendices D and E are 
correct as stated. The acronym "IAW" is spelled out. 

Correction made to section 2.11.2 (revised from 2.8.2) 

Address added to Table 2-3 (revised from Table 2-1) for 
both residences. 

Title changed in Table 2-1 (revised from Table 2-2) to 
match title of grid tracking log. 

ACTION CODES W - WITHDRAWN 
A - ACCEPTED/CONCUR N - NON-CONCUR 
D - ACTION DEFERRED VE - VE POTENTIAL/VEP ATTACHED 
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11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

used as a residence. Recommend using the title used in the grid tracking log (Anthony 
Howerton Silo/Trailer Area). 

Page 2-10, table 2-2. It appears two different addresses are being used to describe the 
trailer/home on Mancour Road past 6315 Mancour Road. 6315B Mancour is identified on 
the same line in the table. However, the number of anomalies (899) on this line is the same 
amount as the number of anomalies identified in the grid tracking log for 6315 Mancour 
Road alone. Another entry on table 2-2, 6317 Mancour Road appears to be referencing this 
trailer home as the number of anomalies (1221) is the same as the number identified in the 
grid tracking log for 6317 Mancour Road, which also indicates this is the location for the 
trailer home on Mancour Road south of 6315 Mancour Road. 

Page 2-11, section 2.10.2. The last paragraph of this section incorrectly references Figures 
D-51 through D-61 for Complex 1, Unit 1. The correct figures for this unit are D-28 through 
D-36. 

Page 2-12, section 2.10.6. The report states the clearance teams shifted to Complex 2, Unit 
2 after completion of Complex 1, Unit 1. However, the first sentence in section 2.10.1 states 
mobilization for Complex 1, Unit 1 consisted of shifting the work force to this unit as tasks 
in Complex 2, Unit 2 were completed. These sentences are contradictory and support 
restructuring sections 2.6 through 2.14 of the report to follow chronological order (see 
comment 2). 

Page 2-12, section 2.11.2. The first sentence of the second paragraph states the MEC teams 
began using the MOFB the second week of operations. However, there is no discussion of 
why. Recommend expounding on the rationale behind using the MOFB (i.e. In order to 
conduct project operations without incurring large delays, the MOFB was used as a tool to 
address the residents' lack of cooperation in evacuating during the work schedule of 0730-
1700. The MOFB allows for intrusive operations to be conducted while residents were 
within the MSD.) 

Page 2-12, section 2.11.2. The connection of the events discussed in last three sentences of 
the second paragraph should be improved. In addition, I think it is important to reference the 
property address (at least initially) when indicating the property owner's name. Recommend 

Table 2-1 (revised from Table 2-2) revised to delete 
reference to 6315B as a separate residence. Discussion on 
MEC items was changed to "11 properties". 

References to Figures for Complex 1, Unit 1 have been 
changed to "D-28 through D-36". 

Sections 2.6 through 2.15 have been restructured 
(relocated) within the report to ensure chronological order 
is maintained for removal actions. The first sentence in 
Section 2.10.1 was corrected to state that mobilization for 
Complex 1, Unit 1 consisted of shifting work force to this 
unit as tasks in Complex 2, Unit 1 were completed. 

Additional discussion was added to this section to expound 
on the rationale for using MOFB. 

Additional discussion to improve connection of the 3 
events was added to this section, and the property address 
was added. 

ACTION CODES W - WITHDRAWN 
A - ACCEPTED/CONCUR N - NON-CONCUR 
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the following language: Due to the difficulty in acquiring the ROE for several residents, a 
USAEDH representative mobilized to the site on 6 September 2006 to conduct field 
acquisition of the outstanding ROEs. However, the Daniels (657 Lakeview Drive) continued 
to refuse to sign the ROE. Therefore, vegetation clearance was completed on all properties 
within the 26-acre clearance area with the exception of the Daniels property. 

16 Page 2-12, section 2.11.2. The language in the third and last sentence of the fourth 
paragraph indicate Evans owns more than two properties. To my knowledge, Evans owns 
only two properties (653 and 658 Lakeview Drive). The language should be revised to 
indicate Evans owns two properties. In addition, as stated in comment 4, the text should be 
revised to indicate the property address for documentation purposes. Recommend changing 
the last sentence to read, USA pulled another 746 flags from the second Evans property 
(653 Lakeview Drive). 

Language in section 2.7.2 (revised from 2.11.2) was 
modified to indicate that Evans has two properties. The 
two addresses were included, and the last sentence was 
revised. 

17 Page 2-12, section 2.11.2. The first sentence of the fifth paragraph should include 
clarification and the second sentence is rambling in nature. 

a. Recommend the following language: By 3 October, all detect/flag 
operations had been completed for the 26-acre clearance area with the 
exception of the Daniels property. One MEC team was conducting 
intrusive operations using the MOFB. On 3 October, Ms. Daniels granted 
ROE for only the wooded portions of her property. 

b. Recommend the following language for the fourth sentence: However, 
Ms. Daniel refused to control or remove her dogs to permit USA to 
complete the clearance of her property. 

The first sentence of the 5 paragraph (now section 2.7.2) 
was modified to clarify the events of 3 October, and the 
second sentence was deleted. The fourth sentence of the 
5th paragraph was modified. 

18 Page 2-14, section 2.12.2. Third full paragraph. The acronym BIP should be defined at the 
first use in the document (in the second sentence of this paragraph) before using the 
acronym. 

Comment noted. The first usage of BIP is now in Section 
2.7.3, where it has been spelled-out. The acronym is used 
in all subsequent usages. 

19 Page 2-14, section 2.12.3. The third sentence incorrectly states 8 MEC items were 
discovered in Area 4C. 10 MEC items were discovered in Area 4C. It appears the MEC 
discoveries at the Foggy Bottom Hunting Lodge have not been included. 

The number and kind of MEC items found in Area 4C have 
been corrected in the text (2.10.3) and include Foggy 
Bottom Hunting Lodge; Table 2-2 (revised from Table 2-4) 
was corrected. 
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Page 2-15, table 2-4. The address (4669 Uzzle Road) for the Foggy Bottom Hunting Lodge 
(Area 4C-8) is incorrect. To my knowledge, there is no address for this structure. 

Page 2-16, section 2.13.2. The last paragraph incorrectly references figures D-28 through D-
36 for Complex 2, Unit 1. The correct figures for this unit are figures D-37 through D-51. 

Page 2-17, section 2.14.2. The term Unit 2-X is used to reference the property location. 
However, the address is used in section 2.13.2 for Complex 2, Unit 1. Recommend the 
address be used with the unit number in parenthesis for discussion regarding all locations. 
After that first reference, recommend using the unit designation for simplification. 

Page 2-17, section 2.14.2. The fourth paragraph discusses the discovery of the 37mm at 
4669 Uzzle Road. However, no discussion is presented on the discovery of the 105mm at 
4669 Uzzle Road. What is the rationale for presenting only the discussion of the 37mm? 

Page 2-18, section 2.14.2. The last paragraph in this section incorrectly references figures 
D-37 through D-51 for Complex 2, Unit 2. The correct figures for this unit are figures D-52 
through D-61. 

Page 2-19, section 2.15.2. The discussion should reference figure D-2 for the sign locations. 

Page 3-1, section 3.1. All of the grid sheets titled Lakeview set #1 are for Area 4A and 
should be revised to stated they are for Area 4A (all individual sheets also state Lakeview 
Subdivision). In addition, I get an error and am unable to open the grid sheets titled 
Lakeview set #2. It also appears there are no grid sheets for several houses in Range 
Complex 1, Unit 1 and Range Complex 2, Unit 2. Please address. 

Page 6-1, table 6-1. The Foggy Bottom Hunting Lodge is referred to as 4C Unit 8. To avoid 
confusion with the units in the remaining lands (Range Complex 1 and 2 Units) recommend 
referring to this location as other locations in Area 4C (i.e. 4C- Foggy Bottom Hunting 
Lodge). 

Page 6-2, section 6.1.5. The information for Area 4C does not appear to include the Foggy 

The address has been changed to "Foggy Bottom Hunting 
Lodge (Uzzle Rd)". 

References to Figures for Complex 1, Unit 1 have been 
changed to "D-37 through D-51". 

For all sections discussing removal actions at Area 4 
Complex 1 and 2, units and addresses were changed to be 
consistent, using the address and unit number for all first 
usages, then using only unit number for all other usages. 

A description has been added that discusses the finding of 
the 105 mm projectile on 7 Aug at 4669 Uzzle Road. 

References to Figures for Complex 2, Unit 2 have been 
changed to "D-52 through D-61". 

A reference to locations of signs on Figure D-2 has been 
added. 

Grid sheets for Lakeview set #1 have been renamed for 
Area 4A. Lakeview set #2 has been replaced with correct 
grid sheets and are viewable. Some files from removal 
actions in Area 4 Complex 1, Unit 1 and Complex 2, Unit 
2 performed in CY2008 were lost during shipment. This is 
noted in Section 3.1, Grid Records. 

Reference in Table 6-1 to Foggy Bottom Hunting Lodge 
was changed to "4C - Foggy Bottom Hunting Lodge, 
Uzzle Road". 

Section 6.1.5 has been revised to include the correct data 
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Bottom Hunting Lodge. Using the information from the December 1, 2007 and May 31, 
2008 status reports, the number of anomalies, MEC items, and estimated MD should be 
34,345, 10, and 4039 lb. respectively. 

for Foggy Bottom Hunting Lodge. 

29 Appendix B, grid tracking log. The log for Area 4, Range Complex 2, Unit 1 indicates the 
155mm HE was discovered within Unit 1-5 (McCorkle - 507 Enon Road). Although the 
round was found on McCorkle's property, it was found within the boundaries of Unit 1-6 
(509 Enon Road). This fact should be captured throughout the discussion, tables, and 
figures which discuss these two properties. 

Additional clarification was added in the discussion of 
removal actions at Area 4, Range Complex 2, Unit 1, and 
notes added to Table 2-5 and to Figure D-41 (Unit 1-5). 
Figure D-40 (Unit 1-4) already had a note. 

30 Appendix B, OE/UXO Accountability Record. Recommend more specific information for 
the area designation for the first two and last two entries under calendar year 2008. The 
current designation is 4C2 indicating Area 4, Range Complex 2. Recommend adding UX 
with X indicating the unit where the UXO was found. For example, the first entry (507 
Enon Road) would be 4C2U1 (indicating the first unit of Complex 2) and the last entry 
(4669 Uzzle Road) would be 4C2U2 (indicating the second unit of Complex 2). Also, 
recommend changing the designation for the last entry under Area 4C (4535 Uzzle Rd) and 
the third and fourth entry under 2008 to just 4C to avoid confusion with the units in the 
Range Complex 1 and 2. 

Names of Disposal Grids in the Appendix B, OE/UXO 
Accountability Log for CY2008 entries have been revised 
to avoid any confusion. 

31 Appendix C. Recommend arranging the photographs together for areas (i.e. All photos for 
Area 4A are placed consecutively.) In addition, recommend referencing photographs when 
applicable discussion is conducted in section 2. This would apply to locations also. Pictures 
at 4542D Uzzle Road are separated by a picture at 4559 Uzzle Road. 

Photographs in Appendix C have been re-arranged to be 
chronological (and kept together) for areas cleared. Also, 
references added in Sections 2.6 through 2.14 for those 
areas with photos included in Appendix C. 

32 Figure D-l. There are several comments as follows: 
a. It is difficult to see the boundaries of Area 4D and Area 4E due to water features 

and the title Hester Lake. Recommend placing the layer for the areas above the 
water features for clarity. 

b. The colors for the Camp Butner boundary and range complexes are identical. 
Recommend making the features different colors to differentiate. 

Realigned features to show over water feature. 

Differentiated colors. 

ACTION CODES W • 
A - ACCEPTED/CONCUR N -
D - ACTION DEFERRED VE 

WITHDRAWN 
NON-CONCUR 
- VE POTENTIAL/VEP ATTACHED 

CEHND FORM 7 (Revised) 
15 Apr 89 

PREVIOUS EDITIONS OF THIS FORM ARE OBSOLETE Page 5_of_8 



U. S. ARMY ENGINEER DIVISION HUNTSVILLE 

DESIGN REVIEW COMMENTS PROJECT 

CORPS OF ENGINEERS 
2008 Annual Report, Removal Action, Former Camp Butner, Butner, NC 

• SITE DEV & GEO • 
• ENVIR PROT& UTIL • 
• ARCHITECTURAL O 
D STRUCTURAL • 

MECHANICAL • 
MFG TECHNOLOGY • 
ELECTRICAL • 
INST & CONTROLS • 

OE SAFETY 
ADV TECH 
ESTIMATING 
SPECIFICATIONS 

• 
• 
• 

SYSTEMS ENG 
VALUE ENG 
OTHER 

REVIEW 
DATE 
NAME 

ITEM DRAWING NO. 
OR REFERENCE COMMENT ACTION 

33 Figure D-5. The grid tracking sheet for Area 4A identifies MEC in grid 45-1-30 (M-9 rifle 
grenade, unarmed). However, figure D-5 does not indicate MEC was discovered in this grid. 
Please address. 

Added MEC item to Grid 45-1-30. 

34 Figure D-7 through D-17. Several comments. 
a. In the title box, recommend including the address where applicable in 

parenthesis under the property owner name for documentation purposes. 
b. A note is placed on each figure indicating the footprint of the house within 

clearance area has been deducted from the reported acreage. Some figures 
such as D-10 and D-l 1 appear to indicate a house location within the clearance 
area. However, this smaller area inside the clearance area has not been 
identified on the legend. 

c. It appears figures D-10, D-l 1, and D-l6 are indicating a house location or 
areas where clearance was not conducted. If this is a house, the location does 
not appear to be accurate. If not, this figure needs to be cleaned up to remove 
these areas within the larger area. 

d. Figure D-10. Howerton is misspelled. Please correct. 
e. Figure D-15. The title indicates this property is owned by Michael Beachan. 

Please verify, as my information indicates this property is owned by 
Howertons. 

Added all addresses that were applicable. 

Those areas are now shown in the legend. 

Moved area in Figure D-10 to align with imagery, but left 
areas in place on Figures D-l 1 and D-l6, because imagery 
may not be the most accurate reference. 

Corrected spelling. 
Changed name to correct owner, "Howerton". 

35 Figure D-l8 
a. 

b. 

Several comments. 
Clearance areas 4C-1, through 4C-8 have been identified on the figure. 
Recommend identifying the addresses in relation to the clearance area in a 
table for clarification. 
The placement of the MEC items in Area 4C-7 and 4C-6 appears to be 
reversed. The parcel where Area 4C-7 is labeled is 4553 Uzzle Road (Dixon) 
and the parcel where Area 4C-6 is labeled is 4559 Uzzle Road (Forsythe). 

Added Chart to map. 

Corrected addresses for those properties. 

36 Figures D-19 through D-26. Several comments. 
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a. In the title box, recommend including the address where applicable in 
parenthesis under the property owner name for documentation purposes. 

b. Figure D-20. It appears, based on calculation (1.91 acres cleared), the separate 
section (0.368 ac.) drawn to the left of the primary area labeled 2.049 acres was 
not cleared. If so, please remove this from the figure. If this area was cleared, 
recommend showing the cleared area as one with the larger area. 

c. Figure D-24. The MEC items found for this address 4559 Uzzle Road are 
incorrect and have been reversed with figure D-25 (4553 Uzzle Road). 

Added addresses. 

Removed area of 2.049 acres, because it was not cleared. 

Addressed issue with response to Comment 35.b. 

37 Figure D-27. Several comments. 
a. Clearance areas 4B-1, 2, and 3 have been identified on the figure. Recommend 

identifying the addresses in relation to the clearance area in a table for 
clarification. 

b. MEC items 1, 2, and 47 are shown outside of the Area 4B open area clearance 
boundary. Shouldn't the boundaries of this area be reconfigured to include 
these areas since the clearance was conducted in these areas to find these 
items? 

Added table. 

MEC items are now shown within the clearance boundary. 

38 Figures D-28 through D-36. Several comments. 
a. In the title box, recommend including the address where applicable in 

parenthesis under the property owner name for documentation purposes. 
b. The acreage calculation is not consistent with other figures (i.e. figures D-19 

through D-26) where the total acreage of the property is identified in the figure 
and the total acreage cleared (excluding the non-cleared areas) is identified in a 
box in the lower right hand corner. On this figure the value is the same in spite 
of the fact there are areas which were not cleared. 

Added addresses. 

Made acreage calculations consistent. 

39 Figures D-37 through D-51. Several comments. 
a. In the title box, recommend including the address where applicable in 

parenthesis under the property owner name for documentation purposes. 
b. The acreage calculation is not consistent with other figures (i.e. figures D-19 

through D-26) where the total acreage of the property is identified in the figure 
and the total acreage cleared (excluding the non-cleared areas) is identified in a 
box in the lower right hand corner. On this figure the value is the same in spite 

Added addresses. 

Made acreage calculations consistent. 
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d. 

e. 

h. 

k. 

of the fact there are areas which were not cleared. 
Figure D-37. An area has been denoted as a yellow trapezium indicating a 
road feature. Recommend deleting this feature as it appears to be designating 
the house on the next parcel and not a road. 
Figure D-40. The areas not cleared as stated in the box (0.11 acres) does not 
equal the amount identified on the figure (0.41 acres) 
Figure D-41. The areas not cleared as stated in the box (0.193 acres) does not 
equal the amount identified on the figure (0.115 acres) 
Figure D-42. The areas not cleared as stated in the box (0.293 acres) does not 
equal the amount identified on the figure (0.15 acres). 
Figure D-43. The areas not cleared as stated in the box (0.365 acres) does not 
equal the amount identified on the figure (0.19 acres). 
Figure D-44. The areas not cleared as stated in the box (0.43 acres) does not 
equal the amount identified on the figure (0.203 acres). 
Figure D-45. The areas not cleared as stated in the box (0.43 acres) does not 
equal the amount identified on the figure (0.24 acres). 
Figure D-46. The areas not cleared as stated in the box (0.008 acres) does not 
equal the amount identified on the figure (0.019 acres). 
Figure D-46. An area has been denoted as a yellow trapezium indicating a 
road feature. Recommend deleting this feature in addition to the two at the left 
side of the figure as these are not roads. 

Removed road features. 

Fixed acreage calculation. 

Fixed acreage calculation. 

Fixed acreage calculation. 

Fixed acreage calculation. 

Fixed acreage calculation. 

Fixed acreage calculation. 

Fixed acreage calculation. 

Road features are now removed. 

40 Figures D-52 through D-61. Several comments. 
a. In the title box, recommend including the address where applicable in 

parenthesis under the property owner name for documentation purposes. 
b. The acreage calculation is not consistent with other figures (i.e. figures D-19 

through D-26) where the total acreage of the property is identified in the figure 
and the total acreage cleared (excluding the non-cleared areas) is identified in a 
box in the lower right hand corner. On this figure the value is the same in spite 
of the fact there are areas which were not cleared. 

Added addresses. 

Made acreage calculations consistent. 
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