APPENDIX 8
1998 USACE VIBRACORE LOGS, GRANULARMETRIC
REPORTS & GRAIN SIZE DISTRIBUTION CURVES



Hole No. SHI-1

DIVISION INSTALLATION SHEET
DRLLING LOG SOUTH ATLANTIC WILMINGTON DISTRICT e -
1. PROJECT 10. SIZE AND TYPE OF BIT 4" VIBRACORE TUBE 20
SHALLOTTE INLET 1. DATUM FOR ELEVATION SHOWNBW o WSL
2. LOCATION (Coordinges o Stafian) MLW
E 2187021 N 57751 12. MANUFACTURER'S DESIGNATION OF DRLL
3. ORILLNG AGENCY VIBRA-CORE (SNELL)
WILMINGTON DISTRICT r 13. TOTAL NO. OF OVER- 'DISTURBED 'UNDIS TURBED
4. HOLE NO. (As shawn an drawing title BURDEN SAMPLES TAKEN ! ! [0}
and flie number) SHI-1
14. TOTAL NUMBER CORE BOXES N/ A
5. NAME OF DRILLER
JERRY FULCHER 15. ELEVATION GROUND WATER
6. DIRECTION OF HOLE F—— |STARTED |COMPLETED
m VERTICAL [] INCLINED DEG. FROM VERT. L 2/5/98 L 2/5/98
17. ELEVATION TOP OF HOLE -5.0 Ft.
7. THCKNESS OF OVERBURDEN N/ A 18. TOTAL CORE RECOVERY FOR BORNG N/ A P
8. OEPTH DRILLEO INTO RaCK 0.0 19. SIGNATURE OF NSPECTOR
9. TOTAL DEPTH OF HOLE 12.6' KEITH BENTON
ELEVATION | DEPTH | LEGEND CLASSFICATION OF MATERIALS és%%%g- E%PEE (Drlillng ms.EmK/iss.dm of
(Description) ERY NO. weattering, dc., If signiflcart)
_5.0 Q c d . t 9
31 "+ +'|sP-Tan. coarse poorly Time Begin Vibracoring @ |-
e graded sand with shel | 8:05 hours -
i PP fragments NOTE : =
g1 1 CLASSIFIED ON 3/4/98 -
= BY LARRY BENJAMIN -
2 — CIVIL ENGINEER TECH. |—
= s NOTE: C
i Top of Hole at [
= River Bottom —
4 ... ——
=1 "« s LAB CLASSIFICATION |-
o I ai Jar -
i LA Number  Clossification [I—
o (A 1 2 -
-1.0 6 ] 2 SM [
] SP-SM Grayish tan medium. 2 3 SM -
— to coarse poorly graded 4 SP =
_ silty sand, trace of _
— shell fragments L
8 —
-13.6 ] — -
-14.0 1 MH Dark gray elastic silt 3 —
’ — SP-Tan., coarse poorly 4 —
B graded sand =
e o NOTE: X =
A & Hole Termu}oted as . —
Lo, necessary, for convenience, [~
1. - predetermined, depth, -
i or assumed vibracore =
g4 refusal. -
. NOTE: =
120 i The Vibracore run depth |—
=5, " was not recorded. —
-17.6 12.6 .
7 BOTTOM OF HOLE AT 12.6' —
. SOILS ARE FIELD VISUALLY —
. CLASSIFIED IN ACCORDANCE —
— WITH THE UNIFIED SOIL =
- CLASSIFICATION SYSTEM =
— —
= =
g -
. u
G FORM1836 rrevious EDITIONS ARE OBSOLETE. PROJECT HOLE NO.
aM{»R 7 SHALLOTTE INLET SHI-1




DEPARTMENT OF THE ARMY, SOUTH ATLANTIC DIVISION LABORATORY WORK ORDER: 8426

CORPS OF ENGINEERS, 611 SOUTH COBB DRIVE, MARIETTA, GA. 30060 3 REQUISITION: W81LJ881245987
U.S. STANDARD SIEVE OPENING IN INCHES U.S. STANDARD SIEVE NUMBERS HYDROMETER
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GRAIN SIZE IN MILLIMETERS
GRAVEL SAND
COBRLES COARSE | FINE COARSE | MEDIUM ] FINE SILT OR ELAY
Sample No. Depth (ft) (VISUAL) Classification Natw%| LL PL PI
Proj SHALLOTTE INLET
1 1.0-1.5__[TAN, POORLY GRADED SAND (SP), WITH A 113 mject
LITTLE GRAVEL SIZE AND SAND SIZE SHELL WILMINGTON DISTRICT
FRAGMENTS. Lab No. 7276005
Hole No. SHI-1
GRADATION CURVES Date  ©85/26,/98




DEPARTMENT OF THE ARMY, SOUTH ATLANTIC DIVISION LABORATORY WORK ORDER: 8426

CORPS OF ENGINEERS, 611 SOUTH COBB DRIVE, MARIETTA, GA. 30060 REQUISITION: W81LJ881245987
U.S. STANDARD SIEVE OPENING IN INCHES U.S. STANDARD SIEVE NUMBERS HYDROMETER
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GRAIN SIZE IN MILLIMETERS
GRAVEL SAND
CORRLES COARSE | FINE COARSE | MEDIUM | FINE SILT OR GLAY
Sample No. Depth (ft) (VISUAL) Classification Natw% LL PL PI Proi SHALLOTTE INLET
2 6.0-65 |GRAY, SILTY SAND (SM), WITH A TRACE OF | 258 roleet
MICA. WILMINGTON DISTRICT
Lab No. 72/6006
Hole No. SHI-1
GRADATION CURVES Date  05/26/98




DEPARTMENT OF THE ARMY, SOUTH ATLANTIC DIVISION LABORATORY WORK ORDER: 8426

CORPS OF ENGINEERS, 611 SOUTH COBB DRIVE, MARIETTA, GA. 30060 : REQUISITION: W81LJ881245987
U.S. STANDARD SIEVE OPENING IN INCHES U.S. STANDARD SIEVE NUMBERS HYDROMETER
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GRAIN SIZE IN MILLIMETERS
GRAVEL SAND
CORBLES COARSE | FINE COARSE | MEDIUM | FINE SILT BR CLAY
Sample No. Depth (ft) (VISUAL) Classification Natw%| LL PL P1 Proi SHALLOTTE INLET
3 85-9.0 |GRAY, SILTY SAND (SM), WITH A TRACE OF | 34.4 et
GRAVEL AND SHELL FRAGMENTS. WILMINGTON DISTRICT
Lab No. 726007
Hole No. SHI-1
GRADATION CURVES Date  05/26/98




DEPARTMENT OF THE ARMY, SOUTH ATLANTIC DIVISION LABORATORY
CORPS OF ENGINEERS, 611 SOUTH COBB DRIVE, MARIETTA, GA. 30060

WORK ORDER: 8426
REQUISTITION: W81LJ881245987

WILMINGTON DISTRICT

U.S. STANDARD SIEVE OPENING IN INCHES U.S. STANDARD SIEVE NUMBERS HYDROMETER
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Sample No. Depth (ft) (VISUAL) Classification Natw%| LL PL PI P SHALLOTTE INLET
roject
4 9.0-9.5 GRAYISH TAN, POORLY GRADED SAND (SP). 16.8 )

Lab No. 72/6008

Hole No. SHI-1

GRADATION CURVES

Date 05726798




Hole No. §H1-2

DIvSION INSTALLATION SHEET
DRLLING LOG SOUTH ATLANTIC WILMINGTON DISTRICT g
1. PROJECT 10. SIZE AND TYPE OF BIT 4" VIBRACORE TUBE 20'
SHALLOTTE INLET 1. DATUM FOR ELEVATION SHOWNBM o MSL)
2. LOCATION (Caordindes o Statlan) MLW
E 2187299 N 57375 12, MANUFACTURER'S DESIGNATON OF DRLL
3. DRILLNG AGENCY VIBRA-CORE (SNELL)
WILMINGTON DISTRICT 13. TOTAL NO. OF OVER- DISTURBED UNDS TURBED
4. HOLE NO. (As shawn on drawing Iitie BURDEN SAMPLES TAKEN 2 0
and flie number) SHI-2
14. TOTAL NUMBER CORE BOXES N/ A
5. NAME OF DRILLER
JERRY FULCHER 15. ELEVATION GROUND WATER
6. DIRECTION OF HOLE 16. DATE HOLE STARTED COMPLETED
%) VERTICAL [ INCLINED DEG. FROM VERT. 2/5/98 2/5/98
17. ELEVATON TOP OF HOLE  -5.6 Ft.
7 THCKNESS OF OVERBURDEN N/ A 18. TOTAL CORE RECOVERY FOR BORNG N/ A
B. DEPTH DRILLED INTO ROCK 0.0’ 19. SIGNATURE OF NSPECTOR
9. TOTAL DEPTH OF HOLE 1n.2" KEITH BENTON
ELEVATION | DEPTH | LEGEND CLASSFICQLDN’ 9F)MATER1ALS {iE%%%E— E%PES (Orllling IIMS.E ya?erlis. depth of
-56 O, scriplion) ERY NO. weatrering, dc. If slgnificat)
a c d . f 9
" "«"+1sP-Grayish tan. coarse Time Began Vibracoring @ -
.1 poorly graded sand 9:55 hours -
—sw e o with shel | fragments NOTE : [
" 1 _lcLASSIFIED ON 3/5/98 |-
I BY LARRY BENJAMIN -
22— CIVIL ENGINEER TECH. |—
4.7, NOTE: -
P Top of Hole at [
4 J River Bottom =
4.9 .
4 - LAB CLASSIFICATION |
e - Jar [
= PR Number Classification [
= ! SP =
: a«r ) . : L) :
=gt ® -
8—5 - 4 Trace of shell fragments 2 :_
qee oo o NOTE [
— Hole Termlr}oted as —
RN neces or convenience, |-
s s d predetermlned depth, —
-1"7.°, or assumed vibracore —
10-3..°.". refusal. il
9 .- NOTE: -
o DI The Vibracore run depth [~
11 . - was not recorded. [
-16.811.2 4 -
] BOTTOM OF HOLE AT 11.2' [
] SOILS ARE FIELD VISUALLY [
-~ CLASSIFIED IN ACCORDANCE —
] WITH THE UNIFIED SOIL N
_T CLASSIFICATION SYSTEM —
] L
. -
- -
. :
= [
ENG FORM1836 PrRevioUS EDITIONS ARE OBSOLETE. PROJECT HOLE NO.
um 7 RM SHALLOTTE INLET SHI-2




DEPARTMENT OF THE ARMY, SOUTH ATLANTIC DIVISION LABORATORY WORK ORDER: 8426

CORPS OF ENGINEERS, 611 SOUTH COBB DRIVE, MARIETTA, GA. 30060 i REQUISITION: W81LJ881245987
U.S. STANDARD SIEVE OPENING IN INCHES U.S. STANDARD SIEVE NUMBERS HYDROMETER
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GRAIN SIZE IN MILLIMETERS
GRAVEL SAND
GOBBLES COARSE [ FINE COARSE | MEDIUM [ FINE SILT OR ELAY
Sample No. Depth (ft) (VISUAL) Classification Natw%| LL PL PI P SHALLOTTE INLET
1 1.0-1.5  |GRAY, POORLY GRADED SAND (SP), WITH A 19.2 roject
TRACE OF GRAVEL STZE AND SAND SIZE SHELI WILMINGTON DISTRICT
FRAGMENTS. Lab No. 72/6009
Hole No. SHI-2
GRADATION CURVES Date  05/26/98




DEPARTMENT OF THE ARMY, SOUTH ATLANTIC DIVISION LABORATORY WORK ORDER: 8426

CORPS OF ENGINEERS, 611 SOUTH COBB DRIVE, MARIETTA, GA. 30060 o REQUISITION: W81LJ881245987
U.S. STANDARD SIEVE OPENING IN INCHES U.S. STANDARD SIEVE NUMBERS HYDROMETER
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GRAIN SIZE IN MILLIMETERS
GRAVEL SAND
COBBLES COARSE | FINE COARSE | _MEDIUM | FINE SILT OR CLAY
Sample No. Depth (ft) (VISUAL) Classification Natw%| LL PL PI
' SHALLO
2 80-8.5 |GRAY, POORLY GRADED SAND (SP). 19.3 Brojest  EHALLOTTE INLET
WILMINGTON DISTRICT
Lab No. 7276810
Hole No. SHI-2
GRADATION CURVES Date @5/26/98




Hole No. SHI- 3
DIVSION INSTALLATION SHEET 1
DRLLING LOG SOUTH ATLANTIC WILMINGTON DISTRICT .
1. PROJECT 10. SIZE AND TYPE OF BIT 4" VIBRACORE TUBE 20'
SHALLOTTE INLET . DATUM FOR ELEVATION SHOWRBW o WSU
2. LOCATION (Coordindtes or Station) MLW
E 2186432 N 57188 12. MANUFACTURER'S DESIGNATON OF DRLL
3. DRILLNG AGENCY VIBRA- CORE (SNELL)
WILMINGTON DISTRICT 13. TOTAL NO. OF OVER- DISTURBED UNDIS TURBED
4. HOLE NO. fAs shavn on drowlrg title BURDEN SAMPLES TAKEN 2 0
ond flie numbar) SHI-3
14. TOTAL NUMBER CORE BOXES N/ A
5. NAME OF DRILLER
JERRY FULCHER 15. ELEVATON GROUND WATER
6. DIRECTION OF HOLE s DATE HOLE STARTED COMPLETED
w VERTICAL [ INCLINED DEG.FROM VERT. 2/5/98 2/5/98
17. ELEVATON TOP OF HOLE -5.8 Ft.
7. THICKNESS OF OVERBURDEN' N/ A 18. TOTAL CORE RECOVERY FOR BORNG N/ A 7
8. DEPTH DRILLED INTO ROCK  ().Q' S SONATURE OF TEPECTOR
9. TOTAL DEPTH OF HOLE 4.1 KEITH BENTON
ELEVATION | DEPTH | LEGEND G-ASSFIC{\DT’E;, MO';’JMATER'NS ﬁcﬁ%’fﬁ E%Pfg 10r liing rInaR.E-::ﬁKISass. depth of
'5,8 Q . ; E!.?Y N[O wegltering, ar:q, If significant)
**.*.{SP-Tan. coarse poorly Time Began Vibracoring E
R graded sand with shel | 8:42 hours
5o e e fragments NOTE : —
3 CLASSIFIED ON 3/4/98 |
q .. BY LARRY BENJAMIN =
1—:‘-- . CIVIL ENGINEER TECH. |—
4 - T |note: -
0 Top of Hole ot [ —
3. .o River Bottom [~
a _on, =, LAB CLASSIFICATION |f_
n R Jar —
i M Number Classification | [
R 2 SC -
-9.2 L N
J_f/ SC-Brown fine to medium > [
» / clayey sand with rock ~
i fragments L
-9.9 441— //ﬂ -y
. BOTTOM OF HOLE AT 4.1 NOTE: —
- SOILS ARE FIELD VISUALLY Hole Terminated as . —
- CLASSIFIED IN ACCORDANCE gfgggfg;%ﬁgg_ depth, e
— WITH THE UNIFIED SOIL orfogglume vibracore =
= refu . —
- CLASSIFICATION SYSTEM =
— NOTE: —
= The Vibracore run depth |-
- was not recorded. —
= -
z -
i : E
. E
ENG FORM1836 rrevious EDITIONS ARE OBSOLETE. PROJECT HOLE KO.
uAR 7 SHALLOTTE INLET SHI-3




DEPARTMENT OF THE ARMY, SOUTH ATLANTIC DIVISION LABORATORY WORK ORDER: 8426

CORPS OF ENGINEERS, 611 SOUTH COBB DRIVE, MARIETTA, GA. 30060 2 REQUISITION: W81LJ881245987
U.S. STANDARD SIEVE OPENING IN INCHES U.S. STANDARD SIEVE NUMBERS HYDROMETER
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GRAIN SIZE IN MILLIMETERS
GRAVEL SAND
COBBLES COARSE | FINE COARSE | MEDIUM | FINE SILT OR CLAY
Sample No. Depth (ft) (VISUAL)D Classification Natw%| LL PL PI pro SHALLOTTE INLET
1 1.0-1.5  |TAN, POORLY GRADED SAND (SP), WITH A 17.0 et
TRACE OF SAND SIZE SHELL FRAGMENTS. WILMINGTON DISTRICT
Lab No. 7276011
Hole No. SHI-3
GRADATION CURVES Dae  @5/26,98




DEPARTMENT OF THE ARMY, SOUTH ATLANTIC DIVISION LABORATORY WORK ORDER: 8426

CORPS OF ENGINEERS, 611 SOUTH COBB DRIVE, MARIETTA, GA. 30060 -5 REQUISTITION: W81LJ881245987
U.S. STANDARD SIEVE OPENING IN INCHES U.S. STANDARD SIEVE NUMBERS HYDROMETER
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GRAIN SIZE IN MILLIMETERS B
GRAVEL SAND
COEBLES COARSE | __FINE COARSE | MEDIUM | FINE SILT QR LAY
Sample No. Depth (ft) (VISUAL) Classification Natw%| LL PL PI Proi SHALLOTTE INLET
2 34-39  [TAN, CLAYEY SAND (SC), WITH A LITTLE 18.1 foieet
GRAVEL . . WILMINGTON DISTRICT
Lab No. 7276812
) Hole No. SHI-3
GRADATION CURVES Date  05/26/98




Hole No. SHI-4

DRLLING LOG [PVEON

SOUTH ATLANTIC

INSTALLATION

SHEET 1
WILMINGTON DISTRICT

oF 1 SHEETS

1. PROJECT 10. SIZE AND TYPE OF BIT 4" VIBRACORE TUBE 20
SHALLOTTE INLET 1. DATUM FOR ELEVATION SHOWR'BW o MSL)
2. LOCATION (Coordindes o Statian) MLW
E 2187011 N 56726 12. MANUFACTURER'S DESIGNATION OF DRLL
3. DRILLNG AGENC VIBRA-CORE (SNELL)
WlLMINGTON DISTRICT 13. TOTAL NO. OF OVER- DISTURBED UNDIS TURBED
4. HOLE NO. (As shawn on drowirg thie BURDEN SAMPLES TAKEN 3 0
and flie number) SHI-4
14. TOTAL NUMBER CORE BOXES N/ A
5. NAME OF DRILLER
JERRY FULCHER 15. ELEVATION GROUND WATER
6. DIRECTION OF HOLE & GATE FOLE STARTED COMPLETED
X1 VERTICAL [T INCLINED DEG. FROM VERT. 2/5/98 2/5/98
17. ELEVATON TOP OF HOLE -2.4 Ft.

18. TOTAL CORE RECOVERY FOR BORNG N/ A

7. THCKNESS OF OVERBURDEN N/ A
8. DEPTH DRILLED INTO ROCK  ().0"
9. TOTAL DEPTH OF MOLE "7

19. SIGNATURE OF NSPECTOR
KEITH BENTON

7 _CORE | BOX OR REMARKS
E_LEVA4T.ION 061:1!1 LEGEND CLASSFIC(ADT"?;I p?kf MMATERIN-S REEC’:gV- SA':aoriLe la;gg':z ’;Irr;.::'la’; l;;;ﬁ;’g'n”of
. ¢ q . ( 9
9 "*"*"lsP=Tan. coarse poorly Time Began Vibracoring @ |-
4. graded sand trace of 9:25 hours [
i RO I shell fragments NOTE : —
a0 1 |cLASSIFIED ON 3/4/98 |
[ BY LARRY BENJAMIN [
2—". CIVIL ENGINEER TECH. |—
2 A NOTE: »
s Top of Hole at —
i River Bottom -
4.0 LAB CLASSIFICATION ||
B P Jar =
S A Number  Classification |f_
4.0 2 1 > :
—" ‘_' =
8—..".". —
i R PR [
e 3 INOTE: =
—los @ L{ole Termrr} —
-0 determmgg ((:j(e)gvemence —
1 O—_ g;eossumed vibracore [
B refusal. [~
- NOTE: -
N The Vibracore run depth [ —
“los @ was not recorded. -
-14.1 1.7 -
] BOTTOM OF HOLE AT 11.7' [
] SOILS ARE FIELD VISUALLY [
- CLASSIFIED IN ACCORDANCE =
] WITH THE UNIFIED SOIL [
] CLASSIFICATION SYSTEM -
= -
. I
E -
ENG FORM1836 PRevIOUS EDITIONS ARE OBSOLETE. PROJECT HOLE NO.

MAR 71

SHALLOTTE INLET SHI-4
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DISTRIBUTION TEST REPORT
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GRAIN SIZE - mm
Test|% +3" % GRAVEL % SAND % SILT % CLAY
e 14 0.0 0.5 88.8 0.7
LL PI Des Dao Dso D30 D15 Dig Ce Cy
[ 0.52 0.36 0.32 0.261 {0.1919 |0 .21704 1.12 2.1
MATERIAL DESCRIPTION UsSCS AASHTO
® Tan Poorly Graded Sand with Shell Fragments SP
Project No.: 50160-8-0025-W01-830 Remarks:
Praject: Shallcte Inlet, Brunswick, NC Tested by: S‘_ CA

® lLocation: SHI-4 Jar Sample 1 8 1.0-1.5 Ft.

Date: Feb .20, 1999

HT

Reviewed by:

GRAIN SIZE DISTRIBUTION TEST REPORT

LAW ENGINEERING, INC.

Figure No.




GRAIN SIZE DISTRIBUTION TEST DATA Test No.: 14

Date: Feb.20,1999
Project No.: 50160-8-0025-W01-830
Project: Shallote Inlet,Brunswick,NC

Location of Sample:
Sample Description:

SHI-4 Jar Sample 1 € 1.0-1.5 Ft.
Tan Poorly Graded Sand with Shell Fragments

USCS Class: SP

Liquid limit:

AASHTO Class: Plasticity index:

Initial
Dry sample and tare= 303.47
Tare = 0.00
Dry sample weight = 303.47

Tare for cumulative weight retained= 0

Sieve Cumul. Wt. Percent
retained finer
0.75 inches 0.00 100.0
0.375 inches 0.39 99.9
$ 4 1.48 99.5
# 10 3.40 98.9
# 20 12 .67 95.8
# 40 82.80 72.7
# 60 224.19 26.1
# 100 290.46 4.3
# 200 301.34 0.7
Fractional Components
% + 3 in. = 0.0 % GRAVEL = 0.5 % SAND = 98.8
% FINES = 0.7
D85= 0.52 De60= 0.355 D50= 0.320
D30= 0.2606 D15= 0.19187 D10= 0.17041
Cc = 1.1220 Cu = 2.0845



DEPARTMENT OF THE ARMY, SOUTH ATLANTIC DIVISION LABORATORY WORK ORDER: 8426

CORPS OF ENGINEERS, 611 SOUTH COBB DRIVE, MARIETTA, GA. 30060 i REQUISITION: W81LJ881245987
U.S. STANDARD SIEVE OPENING IN INCHES U.S. STANDARD SIEVE NUMBERS HYDROMETER
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GRAIN SIZE IN MILLIMETERS
GRAVEL SAND
QUBBLES COARSE | FINE COARSE | MEDIUM | FINE SICTF OR €LY
Sample No. Depth (ft) (VISUAL) Classification Natw%| LL PL PI )
2 50-55  |TAN, POORLY GRADED SAND (SP), WITH A 182 Profest  SHALLOTSE INLEY
TRACE OF GRAVEL SIZE AND SAND SIZE SHELL WILMINGTON DISTRICT
FRAGHENTS. : Lab No. 726013
Hole No. SHI-4
GRADATION CURVES Dae  05/26/98




GRAIN SIZE DISTRIBUTION TEST DATA Test No.: 15

Date: Feb.20,1999
Project No.: 50160-8-0025-W01-830
Project: Shallote Inlet,Brunswick,NC

Location of Sample: SHI-4 Jar Sample 3 @ 9.0-9.5 Ft.
Sample Description: Tan Poorly Graded Sand with Shell Fragments

USCS Class: SP Liquid limit:
AASHTO Class: . Plasticity index:
Notes

Initial
Dry sample and tare= 338.90
Tare = 0.00
Dry sample weight = 338.90

Tare for cumulative weight retained= 0

Sieve Cumul. Wt. Percent
retained finer
0.75 inches 0.00 100.0
0.375 inches 0.73 99.8
# 4 3.01 99.1
# 10 6.41 98.1
# 20 15.38 95.5
# 40 73.85 78.2
# 60 203.92 39.8
# 100 316.75 6.5
# 200 335.47 1.0

D85= 0.48 D60= 0.320 D50= 0.282
D30= 0.2143 D15= 0.16982 D10= 0.15722
Cc = 0.9131 Cu = 2.0347



GRAIN SIZE DISTRIBUTION TEST REPORT
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GRAIN SIZE - mm
Test|% +3" % GRAVEL % SAND % SILT % CLAY
e 15 0.0 0.9 88 .1 1.0
LL PI Dg5 Dgo D50 D30 D15 D40 Ce Cy
® 0 .48 0.32 0.28 0.214 |0.1688 |0. 1572 0.91 2.0
MATERIAL DESCRIPTION Uscs AASHTO
® Tan Poorly Graded Sand with Shell Fragments SP
Project No.: 50160-8-0025-W01-830 Remarks:

Project: Shallote Inlet. Brunswick, NC

Tested by: (A4 =
® |Location: SHI-4 Jar Sample 3 @ 9.0-9.5 Ft. ~ L

Reviewed by: H;‘/

Date: Feb .20, 1999

GRAIN SIZE DISTRIBUTION TEST REPORT

LAW ENGINEERING, INC. Figure No.




DISTRIBUTION TEST REPORT
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GRAIN SIZE - mm
Test (% +3°" % GRAVEL % SAND % SILT % CLAY
® 0.0 0.5 98 .8 Q.
LL FI Dps D&o D50 D3p D15 D1 Ce Cy
® 0.52 0.36 0.32 0.261 |0.1818 (0. 1704 1.12 2.1
MATERIAL DESCRIPTION UsCs AASHTO
® Tan Poorly Graded Sand with Shell Fragments SP
Project No.: 50160-8-0025-W01-830 Remarks:

Project: Shallote Inlet. Brunswick, NC

® Location: SHI-4 Jar Sample 1 @ 1.0-1.5 Ft.

Date: Feb .20, 1999

GRAIN SIZE DISTRIBUTION TEST REPORT

LAW ENGINEERING, INC.

Reviewed by:

Figure No.

Tested by: S(_ CA'
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GRAIN SIZE DISTRIBUTION TEST DATA Test No.: 14
Date: Feb.20,1999
Project No.: 50160-8-0025-W01-830
Project: Shallote Inlet,Brunswick,NC

- — . ————— ———— —— — —————————_———— — —— — — ————— — ————— ————— T —— S —— ———— A" S ———— —— o —— ——— - —

Location of Sample: SHI-4 Jar Sample 1 € 1.0-1.5 Ft.
Sample Description: Tan Poorly Graded Sand with Shell Fragments

USCS Class: SP Liquid limit:
AASHTO Class: Plasticity index:
Notes

Fig. No.:
Mechanical Analysis Data
Initial
Dry sample and tare= 303.47
Tare = 0.00
Dry sample weight = 303.47

Tare for cumulative weight retained= 0

Sieve Cumul. Wt. Percent
retained finer
0.75 1inches 0.00 100.0
0.375 inches 0.39 99.9
# 4 1.48 99.5
# 10 3.40 98.9
# 20 12.67 95.8
$# 40 82.80 72.7
# 60 224.19 26.1
# 100 290.46 4.3
# 200 301.34 0.7

D85= 0.52 Dé60= 0.355 D50= 0.320
D30= 0.2606 D15= 0.19187 D10= 0.17041
Cc = 1.1220 Cu = 2.0845





